TRUSTEE MEETING
PACKET

February 12, 2026



Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District
Trustee’s Regular Meeting Agenda
February 12, 2026 5:00 PM
103 Beaver Street — Yorkville, IL 60560

Call meeting to order and determination of a quorum. President Ken Johnson
Pledge of allegiance

Approve minutes of the January 8, 2026 regular meeting. As electronically mailed

Comments from the public.

o M~ wh o~

Present District bills for payment. — Fire Chief Jeremy Messersmith
a. approve tuition/travel/meal expenses-roll call (N/A)
b. approve District bills - roll call
Present payroll for review and approval - roll call
Present financial statements for review
Staff Reports
a. Fire Bureau- Fire Marshal Michael Torrence
i. Reports from Planning Council
b. EMS, Training, and Safety- Assistant Chief Ryan Cihak
c. Operations- Assistant Chief Scott McCarty
d. Administration- Fire Chief Jeremy Messersmith
9. Closed sessionper51LCS120/2c 2

Collective negotiating matters between the public body and its employees or their representatives, or deliberations
concerning salary schedules for one or more classes of employees.

10. Action taken after closed session

11. Old Business
a. Other Old Business

12. New Business

Open Session Audio Destruction — October 9, 2025

Closed Session Audio Destruction — July 11, 2024

Discuss and Approve Resolution 2026-02 Fire Prevention Codes
Approve Audit Engagement letter with Mack & Associate’s
Approve personnel changes

-~ 0o o 0 T o

Approve surplus of truck parts and EMS equipment
g. Other New Business

13. Any Other Business

14. Comments from the Public

15. Next regular meeting will be on March 12, 2026 5:00 PM

16. Adjourn regular board meeting.

Posted by: Date and time:




TRUSTEE MEETING MINUTES
OF THE
BRISTOL KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
KENDALL COUNTY, ILLINOIS
HELD IN THE TRAINING ROOM, 2ND FLOOR
103 E. BEAVER STREET, YORKVILLE, IL. 60560
THURSDAY, JANUARY 8, 2026

REGULAR TRUSTEE’S MEETING

BOARD PRESIDENT JOHNSON CALLED THE MEETING TO ORDER AT 4:56 P.M. and
DETERMINATION OF QUORUM

Roll Call
Board President Ken Johnson — yea; Board Treasurer Marty Schwartz — yea;
Trustee Jeff Farren — yea; Trustee Darin Peterson — yea

Administration present: Fire Chief Jeremy Messersmith, Assistant Chief Scott McCarty, Assistant Chief Ryan Cihak,
Fire Marshal Michael Torrence, and Katie Miller (minutes recorder).

The Pledge of Allegiance was recited.

Assistant Chief Cihak presented a Unit Citation for an EMS call for the following: Lt. Audrey Enlow, FF/PM Jesse
Holliger, FF/EMT Luke Babich, FF/EMT Jacob Bustos, FF/EMT Charles Vasicek, FF/EMT Nathan Warmer,
FF/EMT Connor Morgan.

Assistant Chief Cihak acknowledged the following who completed Basic Operations Course: Angel Vargas, Mason
Hayes, Ryan Wulff, Connor Morgan, Garrett Tunnell, Lucas Lohrey, Maurice Seng, Porter Thrall.

Discussion was held for three items from New Business to get moved up on the agenda. Motion was made from
Board Treasurer Schwartz and seconded by Trustee Farren.

C. Approve the appointment of Mark Hoffert to the open trustee position

Board President Johnson entertained a motion to approve the appointment of Mark Hoffert to Trustee. Motion to
approve from Board Treasurer Schwartz and seconded by Trustee Farren. All in favor say aye. All those opposed say
no. Motion passed.

A motion was made by Trustee Peterson to accept Mark Hoffert’s resignation from the Board of Commissioners.
Trustee Farren seconded this motion.

Roll Call
Board President Ken Johnson — yea; Board Treasurer Marty Schwartz — yea;

Trustee Jeff Farren — yea; Trustee Darin Peterson — yea
Motion Carried.

Mark Hoffert was officially sworn in as a member of the Board of Trustees.

D. Reorganize the Board of Trustees
Discussion was held on the Reorganization of the Board of Trustees.

Trustee Peterson motioned for Ken Johnson to remain the President. This was seconded by Board Treasurer
Schwartz. All in favor say aye. All those opposed say no. Motion passed.



Trustee Farren motioned for Marty Schwartz to remain the Board Treasurer. This was seconded by Trustee Hoffert.
All in favor say aye. All those opposed say no. Motion passed.

Trustee Farren motioned for Darin Peterson to become the Board Secretary. This was seconded by Trustee Hoffert.
All'in favor say aye. All those opposed say no. Motion passed.

E. Approve the appointment of Matt Seng to the Board of Commissioners

Board President Johnson entered a motion to approve the appointment of Matt Seng to the Board of Commissioners.
Motion was made from Board Secretary Peterson and seconded by Trustee Farren.

Roll Call
Board President Ken Johnson — yea; Board Treasurer Marty Schwartz — yea;
Board Secretary — Darin Peterson — yea; Jeff Farren — yea; Trustee Mark Hoffert- yea
Motion Carried.

Matt Seng was officially sworn in as a member of the Board of Commissioners.

APPROVE MINUTES OF THE DECEMBER 12, 2025 REGULAR TRUSTEE'S MEETING

Board President Johnson entertained a motion to approve the December 12, 2025 Regular Trustee's Meeting
Minutes. Motion to approve by Board Secretary Peterson. Seconded by Trustee Farren. All in favor say aye. All
those opposed say no. Motion passed.

APPROVE MINUTES OF THE DECEMBER 12, 2025 CLOSED SESSION TRUSTEE'S MEETING

Board President Johnson entertained a motion to approve the December 12, 2025 Regular Closed Session Trustee's
Meeting Minutes. Motion to approve, but not release by Board Secretary Peterson. Seconded by Board Treasurer
Schwartz. All in favor say aye. All those opposed say no. Motion passed.

COMMENTS FROM THE PUBLIC

N/A
DISTRICT BILLS
The Board List of Bills was presented for approval:

Fire - $22,581.50; EMS - $6,513.11; Operations - $24,892.78; Capital - $22,167.94; Foreign Fire - $0.00
Insurance - $18,819.00; Online ACH payments - $77,080.90; Memorial - $0.00
Total: $172,055.23

Board President Johnson entertained a motion to approve the District bills. Motion from Trustee Farren and

seconded by Trustee Hoffert.
Roll Call
Board President Ken Johnson — yea; Board Treasurer Marty Schwartz — yea;
Board Secretary — Darin Peterson — yea; Jeff Farren — yea; Trustee Mark Hoffert- yea
Motion Carried.

PAYROLL

The Payroll Summary Report was presented for a total gross payroll of $586,760.58 for the month of
December 2025 for 2 pay periods.



Board President Johnson entertained a motion to approve the Payroll. Motion from Board Treasurer Schwartz and
seconded by Board Secretary Peterson.
Roll Call
Board President Ken Johnson — yea; Board Treasurer Marty Schwartz — yea;
Board Secretary — Darin Peterson — yea; Jeff Farren — yea; Trustee Mark Hoffert- yea
Motion Carried.

GOVERNMENTAL ACCOUNTING TO DISCUSS THE FINANCIAL REPORT

James Howard presented Governmental Accounting’s financial report. The report was placed on file.

FIRE MARSHAL TORRENCE’S REPORT

Fire Marshal Torrence's report was presented and placed on file.
ASSISTANT CHIEF CIHAK’S REPORT

A/C Cihak’s report was presented and placed on file.
ASSISTANT CHIEF MCCARTY’S OPERATION REPORT
A/C McCarty’s report was presented and placed on file.

FIRE CHIEF MESSERSMITH’S REPORT

Chief Messersmith’s Fire Chief report was presented and placed on file.

OLD BUSINESS

A. Discuss and Approve Fleet Maintenance Agreement with Sandwich Community Fire Protection
District

Chief Messersmith adjusted the Sandwich Fleet Maintenance Agreement to account for emergency service call outs
at a $150/hr rate. Board President Johnson entertained a motion to approve the agreement. Motion from Board
Secretary Peterson and seconded by Board Treasurer Schwartz.

Roll Call
Board President Ken Johnson — yea; Board Treasurer Marty Schwartz — yea;

Board Secretary — Darin Peterson — yea; Jeff Farren — yea; Trustee Mark Hoffert- yea
Motion Carried.

B. Other Old Business

N/A

NEW BUSINESS

A. Open Session Audio Destruction — September 10, 2025 meeting

Board President Johnson entertained a motion to approve destroying all open session audio recordings from the
Trustee meeting on September 10, 2025. Motion to approve from Trustee Farren and seconded by Trustee Hoffert All

in favor say aye. All those opposed say no. Motion passed.

B. Closed Session Audio Destruction — June 13, 2024 & June 26, 2024 meeting
3



Board President Johnson entertained a motion to approve destroying all open session audio recordings from the
Trustee meeting on June 13, 2024 and June 26, 2024. Motion to approve from Board Treasurer Schwartz and
seconded Trustee Hoffert. All in favor say aye. All those opposed say no. Motion passed.

F. Approve Resolution 2026-01 Purchasing of a Medic Unit

Board President Johnson entertained a motion to approve Resolution 2026-01 Purchasing of a Medic Unit. Motion to
approve from Board Secretary Peterson and seconded by Trustee Farren.

Roll Call
Board President Ken Johnson — yea; Board Treasurer Marty Schwartz — yea;

Board Secretary — Darin Peterson — yea; Jeff Farren — yea; Trustee Mark Hoffert- yea
Motion Carried.

G. Approve Personnel Changes

Board President Johnson entertained a motion approve the resignation of Jessica Chaput from part time employment.
Motion to approve from Board Secretary Peterson and seconded by Trustee Hoffert. All in favor say aye. All those
opposed say no. Motion passed.

H. Approve Surplus of Fire Gear

Board President Johnson entertained a motion approve the surplus of Fire Gear of five coats and six pants. Motion to
approve from Board Treasurer Schwartz and seconded by Board Secretary Peterson. All in favor say aye. All those
opposed say no. Motion passed.

1. Other New Business
N/A

ANY OTHER BUSINESS OR COMMENTS FROM THE PUBLIC

N/A

NEXT REGULAR TRUSTEE’S MEETING

The next Regular Trustee’s Meeting is scheduled for February 12, 2026 at 5:00 p.m. at 103 E.
Beaver Street, Yorkville, 1L 60560.

ADJOURNMENT

Board President Johnson entertained a motion to adjourn the Regular Trustee’s Meeting. Motion by Board Treasurer
Schwartz and seconded by Board Secretary Peterson. All in favor say aye. All those opposed say no. Motion passed.

The Trustee Meeting of January 8, 2026 was adjourned at 6:16 p.m.

Minutes Approved and Accepted:

President Secretary



} oBey

9G'2€4- fiddns fiajes 18814 jej0)
Sb'Liy 1UOA WPY - 6955 69598 920212420 g
14992~ “OIYBA WBY - €956 08¢98 9202/21/20
Aiddns Kejes jes|y
00'ge- ‘ouy 'sdens sabyel . tejol
0092~ -3 bunubyesd - 0zss vi9# AUl L9 9202/21/20 8
au) ‘sdesis seyyByosy
96°86¢2- dUj FVIAIRS Al jejoy
o6z | -opweAWRYM 8955 sapddngdoys vzl 9Z02ZL/20 g
U} 83IAI8S 8414
52802 Jeamspodg @ Saoys sAnQ (ejog
G2'802- '@ B swaopun - S9Ls  sakey ' sjoog €LLLLY 9202/2L120 g
ieamsuodg @ seoysg s,Ang
00'cse- 18jua) 9SO ¥AINQ [e10L
mmuomw. TN WY - 2486 GGBBZOL# AUl S58B20L 9202/21120 g
002 BIOIYBA INRY - 2456 9948201# AU 899201 9202/Z1120 g
18)uaD 8SOH %eIng]
8695t 0BG PUB SBIRS SUILLILING {BJO]
266Gy TOPIBA WEBY - 895G UBL#JBWOISNG  '9Z-Z4 9202121120 ng
0c092- TBPIUBA WY - B9SG TSI soWOIND T oZ-zd 9202/21/20 na
98'0%4- TOPIBAWBY - T/86 TSl IewoOISND  gz-b3 9202121120 g
82118 PUB S8jeg supLwNg
00'0se- O AUIA 2 WL WOISn) ALD fejoy,
00'052- TRIOIUBA INBY - €955 IS dMDANeY  /0/10 20220 g
07T HAUIA B ULl WoISN3 ALD
14966~ 0711 'punos pue sued obeayd [ejo)
54896~ TUADIYSA WBY - 8955 UBL#JBWOISND  LOAOY 89202121120 g
86'Le TORIBA INPY - €56 UBL#IBWOISND  OOAOY LA ArAV ] e
077 'punog pue speg ofieonn
00084~ yogq uopueig jejor
00'08L- g Bunybyaud - 016G “TMERS Z# AU i AUl 9202/21/120 k=]
ajog uopuesg
24090 JBusY Yons L eJoIny |BJ0L
89°69¢'Z- 'BOIYIA WBY - 9965 BELR JawolsnD 082992 9202121120 g
Yoo TARIBA WBY - 9966 BEL#JOWIOISND  GE65ST 9202/24/20 g
48]u8) ¥INniy eiomy
6L YSY'2- saoies |eydes uozewys [ejot
91'EE}'2- 3 Bunybyed . 0265 T DOOOMINTL ML 9202121120 5
981 i- g Bunubyend - 0165 DOIO-MINTL M 9202/21/20 2
86'89~ b3 sandwod - 5829 DOOD-MITE TMNTL 9202721120 g
64°9E1- TR SUUOHUN -GOLS  DOID-MINTE MWL 9202/ZLIZ0 li=}
S8318G [eyideD uozeury
00°1€9'L- “oul studinb3g auQ Jiy (ei0)
00 LLe- g @ suuonun) - 5916 6SBLEZ# ALY 8681€2 9202121120 g
00280 3 6uiybyeny - 0255 CLLLEZH AL gLL1€2 920221120
Q0 ZHy- 'g R suuojun - 691G 60LLEZ# Al 601i€2 9202721220
00°1p5- 3 Bugybiyaiiy . 026s €160€TH AUy €H60ET 9202724120 na
‘o] uewdinby aug ny
Junowy junosoy owep wnN 8jeq adAL
920z Aieniga

au1d - s|jig 4o 3siq paeog
1911S1Q UORD3J0I Bul [[EPUDY [O}SLIg



:

Z3bBed

61164~ {1} 00 Addng ueg-1e35RWON tEI0L
£L°€0)- doys - NBY - 6095 LZ8LEL6SE AU TULBLES 9Z0Z/ZWZ0
oVt TUAPMBAWPY - 8955 YEESELBGH AW TGELgS 9202/21/20 I}
{1} ‘00 Aiddng uen-saysepon
05'661- SHIOM Apog uouey jeloL
05'661- TTARIBAWTY - 2955 D0000L# IOV ISZOSE 9202724120 g
SY0p0 Apog uouep
AT Y N fousBiswg uesnpoep (€10
avee- “"aoIyeA WY - 9856 709i6d 20964 92020
98'86- IOIYAA WY - 2095 10926d  L09LED 9202121120
1S et~ "APIYAA WY - 9955 009.8d  008Led 920ZIZHTO
18'vgL- “*8joItaA WBY - 8955 666.6d  665L5d 920221120
81'89- “"IOIYBA WY - 9955 0.6/8d  045.6d 920Z/ZHZ0
89°002- SIAA WY - 9955 §zsled  825l¢d 9ZOZ/ZHZO0
8562~ "2I0IYBA WRY - 9955 g15/ed  9i5.6d SZOZZLIZ0
9E'28Y'L- “OIIOA WRY - 9955 Lvled  2Lvied 920221120
89°002- “rBOIYBA WY - 8OSS ZIvied  2Lvied SZOZIZLIZ0
96°€C1- “"B[OIYBA W'BY - 2256 Olyied  OLbled 920212420
Lyovs- “B[OIUBA INRY - 98G5 60v.LEd  60piEd 9202121120
£8'9Z)- “IIOIBA WRY - 89S 80viEd  8OvlEd 92020
10°Zle- USJOINAA WY - 2258 90PLEd  90viEd ferderdra¥eds]
12'882- “IOBA WBY - BISS 0L£28d  OLELED SZOZRLIZO
£€'821- “SOINBA WBY - 8956 Oveled  OvEled 9202121120
oree- “3OIUBA WP - 8956 6228d  l62.8d 9202121120
8921 lepy ® seday - 0955 2leled  zeLed S202/ZHiZ0
¥5°001- AMBA WRY - TLSS S6ZLEd  §82s8d 92022420
£5°698" “"B[OIAA WP - 2456 ovZied  OvZLed 920224120
66'62L" “B[OBA WBY - 8955 0vZied  0bZied 92027214120
AoueBiawg usanpoepy
26168 {1} swarskgiamog siErssan) feioL
0L'6G9- UIPIBA WRY - 2485 669ESH# IOV 0Z¥0D SZOZRLIZG ng
28°'2L- "OIOIBA R - 2485 669E51# OV 0ZH0D 9ZOZZLIZ0 ng
{1} sweisAgiomoy syeIsueiu;
00°029- oes) ses ybiy eloL
00°029- TSIBQUINN Bitd - OYSS 9658 1 AU 9669+ 9202124120 na
swel) Jels yBiy
Iees's- U} 'S4 0oufess) [ej0 L
W8Es's- SAMIA - [end - 6295 TZIEL0 9202124120 g
"y .wu osuley
88°€€0't- uuopuN AsjieA X0 B0,
88'EE0"L- Qg SWUOUN - GYLS suwsopun  -920Z 9202/2L/120 na
uuojjun Asjiep Xo4
8b'928- "apudias|d (230,
69°€5- <9956 QLEOVIZEL#AUL  TpIZEL 9ZOZZLIZ0
S5'e8¢- 9955 g9BOvIZEI# AU 9ZOZIZLIZO
0Z'oF 095§ VEBLSOZEL# AY) 92OZIZHIZO
8l'Lz- -CLSS  99GYTOTCIH AUl 9202/ZLITO
8S'pE- ‘PISA WBY - 2285 PELBZGISI# ALl TZGLEL 9202124120
8e'9g TUSDIBA R - ZLSS  668LISICI#AL  ULIGLE) 920Z/ZLIZ0
61°85- UOPIOA INPY - 895S  00EYSPLSLEAUL  GHLEL 920ZZLIZ0
66°18- UBOIUBA WBM - 2SS B9LZEEISIEAM  EELEL 9Z02ITLIZ0
L6L TUOPRBA WBM - 8955 £S09LELELR AU TEISE 920220 g
“apudisaly
unowy }NODOY oweyy woy ajeqg edAy
920z lierugag

all4 - s|g Jo 3siq pieog
JoLgSIQ UORISI0Ld 3114 [[epud)) jorsig



¢ 88eq

1v'189°LE-

101
18'8€2- SHed oY YN SJUANIOA (BI0L
(584 o TIOIMBA BN - 8955 9G290b# AUl 9G290r 920221120 g
66'v9 e g eday - 0955 22090v4 Aut 22090 QZ0ZL2LIZ0 g
20°G- DIYIA WRY - 2285 062¥0v# Aut 06L900 AV ATAN AN
869~ OIUBA INRY - 2GS SLLY0t0# AUt 6LLVOY 9202124120
99°Lt- AP WBY - 8965 ESEPOVE AL £SEPOY Q202121120
9eL- “UOOIYBA WBY - 8965 LYEPOP# AU [ 4%4114 920Z1ZLIZ0 g

SHEd OINY YAYN {|IAUOA

§6'69- OWD ArayD esa) [ejo)
S6'69- IIUIA RN - £96G 869£€€SILD  SOLD 9202121120 ng

OWO Arey) eray

06691~ ou} "fapioiquiz g BuluaaIoSHIS S,URSIS [E10)
06°691- UE g suuojiun - 91 sunojiun SOBYZ SzOZeLIZo i1

“ou) ‘Aepjosquiz g Bujusesdsilig s,usaelg

9€'96Z- soeg aiit sduiod (R0 )
00°06- “'BIDIYON WRY - 9985 “oL08e 920ei2Len g
9£'902- “TBOIIA NBY - TLGS ez 9202124120 g

asneg a1y) sdwog

192y 69 Aiddng jeuisnpul DSIN [e30L
29219 N g Nedoy - 0866 TOEZVEC# IOV T'ZZLL8 8202/21L120 ng

07 Aiddng jemnsnpu; oS

unowy jJunoadYy owap wnpN aeq odAL
9Z0z Menigey

3414 - s|jig o isi7 pieog

301381Q UODJ0I Bl [lepus) [oIslg



} eBey

Z9°158 ‘wioL
sy'eee- SHEd OJNY YAYN AlARIOA (8oL
09 .mw,m.zx zzzzz S3JIYeA - jand - G285 685S0¢# AUl 685501 920221120 g
88051~ SOPIYBA - |9nd - G295 CiZyov# AY) fa%a414 92022120 g
SHed OINY VdVN SIIANI0A
09’18 Auedwo) 110 89994 (2304
09'i8p 1R g J1eday - 0985 0EESP# 10OV 8162 S2Z0Z/ZLIZ0 3]
Auedwog jo 89684
yL08- 0T 'dasg v [ejo)
17 .omu EEEEEEEEE e g Jeday - 0195 BZLBEL# ALY 6218¢1 8202121120 g
971 ‘deeg v
Junowy Junoady oW wnN ajeqg odA
9Z07 Auenugag

SN - siitg jo )siT pieoy
1OUISIQ UON9)0Ld dul [HEPUDY |ojsug



} 8Begd

8861~ <WOLEL TZOVSLER WOV yE80Y 9202/21/20
621 ~LOLLL TTZOpSIEE 100y 690 9202/21/20
7l Vi -20LLL TU20PSLER OOy Lreoy 9202123120
YO'ECL- ng Buuead . LoLt, T ZOpSLE# oY T4 9202/2ii20
y6LL BN R NRdBY - Z000L  TZOYOLEX POV SLeoy 9Z02/2L120
L2001 g Buuesd - zotts Z0bSLEH 1oV sieoy 8202120
1862~ “Uesnpy Mand - ZplS 20P9LCH# 1OV 0966¢€ 8202/21/20
8b'95~ “dng uones - LGELS COvaLE# 1oy 9888¢ 8202z Hieg
Ly6l- dng UOHEIS - LSELS 20Y9LE# 1oV 88t 8202121120
Z9°15 BN Jieday - Zo01L Z0r9ie# 100V SLi9E 9202121120
8’69 e @ Jedey - 1001 Z0V9LER oV 9e46€ 82022120
£v'0e- RN g seday - 1001 Z0bale# OV 1626¢ 9202121120
6°201- 'ng Bues|] - 10112 Z0P9LE# 10V ¥526€ 9202/21/20
v6' 22 B g ieday - 10012 2009LE# 100V $626¢ 9202/24/20
vg'L21- BN g seday - LogLL 20V9LER 100V 616 9202/Z1120
Lyt 'ng Buuesld - €05 1L ZOVOLE# 10V 8EI6E 9202/21/20
¥5°0L- e g aedsy - €00LL  TZOVOLEH 0OV BEL6E 9202124120 1532
BUAYO A - spaeualy
oozt~ uolieossy s ajybyaid siouny 1ejoL
00°52Z}- 'sqng @ senq - OplS senq (enuuy 8968 92022120 [iti2]
uopenossy sJejyByeary stouyy
§2'98L- U "SALIIOSSY F UOLIS PIBMOH B0
ferdpe: g 030y 218697 - 0SS DZIGZOZEAUL  TULGZOZ 9202/21120 g
*3U| “S8IRISOSSY P UOWIS PIEMOY
00°058°2- O77 'Buiuncooy (RIUAWILIBAOS 1810 L
00°058'2- o0y R ebal - 0L 'S Bununoooy £82¢ 9202121120 g
271 ‘Bununondy jRuswIuIBA0D
8y'ai- J9WIBlY 715 1SB2WOD (Bjo )
8r'olL- “'aL pue Bleq - 20904 T LLBHIOY TL0ZL 9202121120 e
1BuIAU} 2 1§ ISBOWOD
21'66- L3S 1seowio) g0y
2166 L - suoydaidy - L0S02 9qed LIS ereio 920CIELIZ0 ina
L3S 1se0W0D
SO'EP6'L- 077 ‘[lesipayy 9a1) punog |ejol
66°192- ddng |edlpely - 5929 18098 BTV A AN A g
10°208- “~ddng |ealpaly - 5929 V008 9202121120
e “*ddng |edIpSy - 5929 66098 9202/21120
66°LEL- "*ddng {ea1pal - 59z9 "£9098 9202724120
60°L- "*ddng |eoIpal - 5929 95098 920221120
S5 ¥0L- “ddng [eoipap - G929 45098 9202121120
60°vi- ddng 1eoIpep - 5929 6y098 920 LI20 18
OT1 ‘fevipayy 8as) punog
19°2Cie- sannag endes uozewy (2104
S6°LE ng Buwesl) | 10LLL  -IIMH-AALE  -dALL 9202721120 g
$B8°6€- “3eIdwod - 10212 TTDDOO-MWTE MWL 820c/2L20 g
18°bEC- MR UOHRIS - GES5 CUDOO-MINTE MWL 9202724120 132]
§89)AJ9S Jejides) uozewy
62°€28'2" auf Aysjes sebinry tei0),
18'295- usbAx0 - 0/Z9  LZ00Z# s9ked 9202/211Z0 s
99'200'1 usbAxo - 0429 120024 10ked 9202120 £}
91262~ UsBAXQ - 0229 120024 J9ked 9202121120 g
-suy fyojes seBuy
junowy junoavy ouwely wnN ajeqg adk),
920z Mieniqog

suogeladQ - s|jig Jo )si7 pieog
1914)S1Q UORIB}0Id 2414 [[EPUSY |oJSLg



Z sbey

00062~ 10%A0S tej0)
00°052- ddng (edlpayy - 0929 LZELOZ# IOV UPBOZ6 9202121120 na

1ehns

005482 FHVHSNSWIS [0 ),
00'528'2 “IRIN 21eMYOS - 0612 2802Z# Al 28022 9z0zITLIZ0 g

FUVHSNSNIS

00048 ouj "vSI Yooy [Bjo L
0006 IxeasAdoD .QZLL  'EICLEOMEMM  EI80L  9Z0ZZMZD g

3u) 'vSn yoay

0z 8852~ Kiswobjuow pieyony (30}
0Z'885°2- L -UOHEORPT - Q0LS  QUAIAY uomIng 920Z/24/20 g

KiowoBjuoy pieyspy

19°ghe- "0u] "samog Aaulld jeloL
ogzl- “IXe474d0 - 0ZiZ  G-0008%100Y 68201 920ZIZLIZO g
18881~ “diysrebelsed -Gyl U6-0008# 100V "Z10ZO 9202121120 g

*3u] ‘semog Aeujid

00°'81G'}- {4} Bueay g Buiquinid Appng 1 Ined |ejoL

00°008~ "B g HedaY - L0012 BOELEE# AUl BOEIEE 9202124120
002t B ' HedaY - 10012 SLTIECE# AUl G/ZIEE SZOZ/ZLIZ0

00'¥62~ RN 'R aeday - 1001 19Z1EE# AUl LOZIEE 9202/Z1i20 ng

{1} Buneey 3 Buiquinid Appng 7 Ineg

0S°421- P11 ‘opieise) @ Blequaseys oyouiq] UasonQ (B10L
05121~ 000y @ (ebal . ogls roissejoid 104 89681 9202124120 e

P17 ‘opierse) g Bieg H ojjouid lo]

61°9€072- 00 JOIBASIT SHO (BI04
61'9£0°2- BN g aedey - LO0LL  gz#JeWOISND  Oy0OL 9202121120 e

‘09 40jeAB[3 SHO

00°00S"t~ INDSAY JBJRAN [RIUSD YUON [BIOL
00°005}- "L - UOHEdNP3 - 00LS CLOD-9Z# AUl 2100-92 9Z0Z/ZLIZO na

BNISEY JOIRA [RJUSD YLON

£9°0L2'e" JSUIBAA UBYIEN (BI04
£9'0LZ'e- UL -UOREONPT - 004G quadY uominl  quiey 9Z02/21/20 e

Jeudeps ueyieN

09'886'2- SI19jU3D A1BDUYEIH P JBUASOH SLIOKY |BI0L
00°G¢- 2] sskojdw3 - 0522 €000 SZ0Z/21/20 we
09'EL6'2- o) skoldwl - 05z, OLSIME ROV “ZEO00 9202/21/20 i}

sisjuen eseayjesy g [Byldson suloy

88'v8L L {201 Ainosapy 1810
¥eie- ddng |edpa - 5929 898ZIEHAUL  TTLEANI SZOTITLIZO ng
yv'eLe *~ddng eatpaly - 5929 9LZTLEHAUL  TLEANI 9z02/ZLIZ0 na

{eaipay Andsepy

15'882'1- BHAMIOL - SpIEUBYY (BIOL
90'92Z- BN R HRdAY - €O0LL  ZOYOLE# 100V 1901 9202121120 g
L8'8LL- “ng Bumesd < £0LLL  T'ZOYOLER OOV 0z60% 9202I2LIZ0 e

junowy JunoldY owap wny ejeq adAy
9zoz Aiensqa.

suopesadQ - sjiig 40 IsI pieog
10LISIQ UORD3)0I4 B4l [[epuUd)Y [oyslig



¢ ofey

157281'¢e- Wi0oL
e JOBUS OIpEY B 90V S{IAHIOA (B30
e ey B Hedsy - ZOOLL OLLIBL  9202/ZL/20 e
HOBYS OIPEY B 9OV BJIIANION
00°58%"1- PUSI ARUUES [OISUE-BIANOA (B0
00'oee- MR I9MIG - E0E0L  0-ZIPRIUNOOY  'GZ0Z9 S202re4HZ0 g
00°00¢- MR IBMBS - £0E0L  O-SIP# UNODDY G029 9202121120 e
Qo'see- MR IBMBS - Z080L  0-BLCHIUNOIDY  T/8BIS 820221120 8
00'12s- AN 18MIS - LOEOL 0-0G# N0y THSEDL 920¢/21/20 mna
josiq AiRjjues [03sug-a)lIAoA
SL'VZL L {1} -ou| ‘Buneaeoxzy sebuuuip €10y
05°¢9z- RN R deday - £00LL 182-92# M| 182-92 9z0zZreLiee g
SLeEvL- B g seday - Z00LL 082-92# Avi 082-92 9202/21120 g
05°2€2- W g eday - LO0LL 62-8¢# AUl 642-9C 8202121120 (13324
o0s'2ez- ey g aeday - €001 Ly2-92# AU 1yZ-9e 8202/21120
0S°EvL- e g sleday - Zo0LL QYZ-9C# AU Sy2-9¢ 9202/21/20
05°L¢€2- e % Jieday - LOOLL SkZ-92# AU Sy2-9e 9202721120
0548~ e sedey - €00LL QEZ-9C# AUl 0€e-82 9202721120
(o7 R R Nedey - 20042 622-92# A4 622-9C 9202/21/20
05748 e g aeday - L00LL 82T-92# At 822-92 9202121120
0%°L8- RN R A1eddY - €001 981-9Z# A 981-92 9202/21120
SLEr W P Hedsy - Z00LL SB4-92# AUl S81-92 TAtArAT 4]
05°.8- ey g ueday - 10012 ¥81-92# AUt »81-92 9202721120 ma
{1} ouj ‘Bupeaeaxz seBujuuia
1028 'd163 80inIBS 7 SIONPOId anblun 1BI0L
orveL- ng Bueeld - ZoLLL 59268 8202/21/20 g
PE8SL- ng bunes|d - LoLLL £9126¥ 8z02re3/20 g
15282 ng Buwead - 10112 elicsy 9202124120 g
di0D #91BS g S19NpoIg enbiun
junouy junosoy owey wnp ajeq adAg
9Z0Z Auenigoy

suogesadQ - s|jig Jo 3si pieog
10L3SIQ UOIBJOI D41 [[EPUSY [O)SLIE



| ebed

R ——— ey

ST€80'98" w101
coel8gL- pun4 sty AN SIOUL (2105
0061881~ 'O SUBUNIOM - 0S4 O0-9BSRIOY  LBE6E  920Z/2LIZ0 g
puny ¥si s1gng siou
ST PeZ'se SIouped PaINSSY €10
00°0e8's T gy equin - 0zL2 IO-NINSINE  SS6IE  9Z0ZZLZO g
SZPEY'9S- TIGEN) [BIBURD -S0LL  LO-NINSIIE  PSBIE  9Z0ZIZLZ0 g
SIBUMRY PSINSSY
junouy JuNodaY owel wnn [eq adiy
9Z0z Aienigag

aoueinsu| - sjjig J0 3si pJeog
10U}SIQ UORIB)0IY 41 [[EPUSY |03SHY



1 eBeyg

0£°260°06- viOoL
0£'860'v2- U] [RISP} 193YS %O0IOSIIM (B0
0€'860'vZ- “alold [eyded - 0008 OV-PEEWWOS  TVWOL 9Z0Z/ZHT L]
"3U] ‘[EIO N 188U HOOIGSIM
00°022'L- QT "SHBM SO UsISIIdI |80 L
00°0L2" L~ smeseddy - GZog PHEH AU 982 9T0LILIZ0 ng
T "Som eiqoy uosdaLd
00'952'g1~ 6000 p Bunesy axedswon jelo L
00'0/6'6~ 3loid [ended - QODB  "TEHEISU DYAH 9202121120
00°981'6- “afold [eided G008 ElEISY| OVAH 9Z0Z/eHZD ng
Bujjoo g BupesH ssesswoy
00°S€5'12- @SNoYyBIEAN JAJUAD BIRQ 1810
00°686'1- b3 saindwogy - ggzg LZOZLO-ANE TD-ANI 9202/eLiZ0 =}
00'055'61- b3 seindwoy - 5gzg 8YSI0-ANI - “"O-ANI 9202121120 ng
asnoyaseps Jejue) eleq
00°682'g1L- "ou 'suog pue dipry (ej0 ],
00°682'91- aloid [ewded - 0008 2SP0L# AU} 25601 9202121120 [LE:]
~204 ‘suog pue dijy
00'8p1'2- ou Juawdinb3 suQ iy [ejo
00'8yL'2- 1erded 34d - 0918 2202ECH AUl z20ZET ferdvrdiq¥rdo] ne
“au Juswdinby auo Jy
unowy unosay owsyw wny aeq 8dk)
920z faeniqag

Ieude) - sjig yo 3si paeog
10HISIQ UORDRJ0Y il j[epudy] [o)sg



| abeyd

ov'ele 8il4-10 W SWIOHUN - G9LG  “TSwAed sujuQ T uopelodion sejun
ov'sLe all4- 10 4 -NUD - 111 “Uswhed sujuo 7 uolelodiod sepiD
000 3il4-10 TTHNO9S [B100S - G90S  “swAed sutjuQ Juswiodws ydag
£5°266'2 all4- 10 a4 -MD - LLLL  “swhed sujuO  wgIA - eouswesuel |
29'888'c ~18dO - 0 A4 -NUYD - LLLL  TewAed suquo Jouonay ABisui)
000 ~18do - v0 alld -qUD - LiLL  UawAed suiuo 121V
000 19dQ - 0 SH4-MUD - LLLL  rswded SUiug TIMMOA Jo AD panun
000 49dQ - 0 3H4-MUD - LLLL swded auug  UIBMOA Jo AItD paiun
000 ~3dO - $0 SH4-MUD - LLLL swhed BuUlUO  TTIBUOA J0 AND pajun
000 ~18dO - 0 and -y - L1l “UswAed suluQ Z 1S p3won
LL 08 ~12d0 - 0 - - LIl awAed aunuQ 1 1S p3woe)
2.°69L'S all4- 10 Si4-MUD - LLLL awAed suuQ  Teunsuj 91 fedisuid
80°0£S *48d0O - 0 alid-dYo - LLLL  “swhed suuQ € 1S J00IN
gr'gle *18dO - 0 ald-NYD - LIl “TswAed suiug Z1S J0oIN
€5'6.'L “48dQ - 0 A4 -NYD - LLLL  TUewAed SUIUG seg JOdIN
SY'€8.'6p ald-10 AN-MYD - LiLL  awdhed euuoc  UIYS enig ssou) anig
Z6'61G'S aild- 10 AU -AUYD - LLLL  TTawAed sujuQ oVIdY
£5°266°2 8lld-10 UeINSUlYlesH - OplL Uewded auug  ygIA - BOuSWesuel]
29'88¢'e "319d0-¥0 | -suoydejpl - 10G0.  “swhed sujuQ 18uoneN ABreuld
000 5edQ- 40 | -suoydsel - 10S0L awAed auluQ 181v
000 “RdO-P0 MR ISMeS - £080L  aWAEd BUUO  “TIANIOA JO AD panun
000 1Rd0-$0 M9 JaMeS - Z20g0.  awhed auyuo MUOA J0 AND paun
000 1ed0-p0 UM IeMes - 100, awked auijuo INIOA J0 A pajun
000 ~18do - ¥0 ald MU - LLLL  “awded sujuQ € 1S p3wod
000 ~18dQ - 0 € -0 - £010L  “ewAhed sujuQ € 1S pawon
000 1adQ - 0 Z-oU03I3 - 20L0L  Tsuwihed suyuQ Z 1S p3wog
LL Y08 18dQ - 0 1 -2033 - LOLOL  TswAed suyuQ L 1S p3won
000 19dQ - #0 AUl -NUD - LLLL  TeswAed auluQ 2 1S jseswo)
000 “18d0-$0  Z-suoydesl - 20S0L  awhed aujuo 218 Jseswo)
S9'9€L 3edo - v0 Bl4-NUD - LLLL  awhed suluo  t ssaulsng JSEswo)
G9°'9¢. ...hmaO -$0 "] pue aled - £090.L ...mE>mn_ UINC T esaulsng jsejwo)
000 .:hmno ~-90 @] pue eeq - 20902 ...mE>mn_ AUIUO T esauisng jselwon
000 ..._maO -0 g pue eleq - L0902 ...mE>m& SBUIUQ ° ssauisng jseswo)
000 ...hmao “$0 c - mccr_am_m.r - 0602 :.wE>m& AUIO T ssauisng Sedwo)
000 :.._mQO -0 P mcocaw_m.r - 2050, :.mE>mn_ [UUO T ssaulsng 1seiwo)
000 ...‘_mQO -$0 L - mcocaw_m._v - L0S0.L :.mrc>m& sulijuQ T ssaulisng jselwon
2L°691'G 8ii4~10 “TeinsulUNesH - 0FZL ewhed sujup  Censuj a fedisuld
80°0€S 18do - v0 €-Se9 - £020L swAhed sujug €15 J02IN
gr'glLe "19dO - #0 Z-Se9-2020L TswAhed sujug Z 1S 100IN
5627 ~4adO - ¥0 L -seD - 1020, TswAed sujug Se JOOIN
St'e8L'6p 8lld-10 UeINSUlUYNeSH - OvZ. Tewhed sujupg  TUIYS @nig SS0ID) anjg
26'615'S 2l - 10 JBlJY - £ZLE  dWAed suluo oV1dY
$9'656 alld- 10 Alld-MYD - LLLL  “rowAhed suluo Aueg Xapn
000 all4-10  SAPBA - 8N4 - G296  swhAed suluo Jueg xapn
¥9'9G6 3li4-10 SOPISA-[eNd - GZ9§  rawhed suiup jueg xop Ued dv
Hpain ngaq sSse[D unoady OwBy aweN wnN
9202 ‘i¢ Aenuep siseg jen1doy

uoljoesuel] |eUINop [elauan)
J1013SIQ UOIOBjO.Id 3l ||epus)y |ojslig

92/60/20
WY €0:L1



Z abed

12'986°LL 12°986°LL Tviol
12.7986°L2 12°986'LL
000 19dO - #0 a4 =MD - LLLL  TUswAed suijuo {1} o011 sieasweaig
000 18dQ0 - $0 TIUINg Uonels - GeSG  rswihed auiuo {1} o711 sieasWeRRIQ
npain ngaqg sse| junoday owsaNy aweN wnnN

9202 ‘L€ Aenuep
uoljoesuel] jeulnop [eJauas)
J0L1}SIQ UOI3I3J0.d Bl [|epud)j [o)sig

siseq [enJ2oy
92/60/20

NV €0:1L1



| abed

L6°L18 SN - €0 seleles - 1105 diNOD
16°2.8 3l - 10 Salees - 110g diNOD
000 3ld- 10 "0 BWIL Yed - 520§ 6601
00°0 B4~ 10 "USISOWO JAD - 0L0S uoneseA
86'895'6 alld - 10 saueles - 110§ uoyeseA
000 il - 10 saueles - 110§ Aepijo
8.°100'¢ SINZ - €0 salefes - 1105 H18
6.°100'¢ a4 - 10 seueles - 1105 #IS
000 3ll4-10  "UonAsul-WdD - €205 uadwiod ¥dD
000 SINZ - €0 Ssoueles - 10§ “uoieIBANIS
00°0 ail4- 10 SSWEIES - LLOS  "TUONESBANPIS
000 SW3-€0 "es swil Ind - 0105 4
000 alli-10  "eS SWil ind - 0105 1
000 dUf-10 U9 [EAUYI3] - LE0S L
00°0 alli-10  ""BONP3 AMqnd - 8EOS P3 and
000 Sld-10  oho Buwesl - zzog  rowo Buwest
007Ly'El SIN3 - €0 SoLEleS - 10§ 0D dwlj Led
00vLY'El ail4 - 10 SeLEleS - 10§ 0D Swi Wed
000 All-10 oD AW Hed - G205 T |eD uo pled
00°0 3ll4-10  "T0Q SUHL Hed - 5Z0F [edisAyq
000 8li4-10  UODOMEYIBN - KOS O dlUEYIB|
000 alld-10  "leg Wil find - 0L0S §§044
000 dll4-10  “[eg WL lInd - 010§ TOHO
000 3l4-10 [eS sWil Ind - 0105 HVSNO
18'862°LL SIN3 - €0 saleles - 110G AepijoH
88'862°11 all4 - 10 Sauefes - 110g AepijoH
£0°8L¥ SN - €0 seLeles - 110G v
£0'8iy alld- 10 seuees - 110g v
2L9ey SIN3 - €0 seuees - L10g 0L
2Lo9ey all4 - 10 ssueles - L10g 9L
00'0 SW3-€0 "fes aWll Ind - 0L0S 4d0v
000 aid-10  "Ulegawil Ind - 0L0S ddov
£2°L91°L SW3 -£0 Seuees - L10g 10
veLoL'L alli- 10 salefes - 110§ 10
00°0 dld-10 U ISBMBIMS - LY0S AILYM
000 dl4- 10  Ise) anasay - 9E0g va0s
000 SW3-€0 oSyl - HdD - €205 osw3
98'996 SW3 - €0 SeLees - 110§ }dQ soueinsu
18'956 aild - 10 ssueles - 110§ QO soueinsuy|
000 SW3-£0 “"BSSWILINd - 0LOS snuog ox9y
00°0 8ll4-10 S aWlL{Ind - 010§ snuog oay
oo'c SW3-€0 Ulegawll|Ind - 0L0S  "Uog uoisudley
000 ali-10 ESBWILING - 0L0S  "og uoisusiay
L7’ 252'G9 SIN3 - €0 Seleles - 110§ SEL]
[A@ATN] 3il4- 10 Seueles - 1105 SEL!
000 SW3-€0 dwoDJ0WO - 020§  “HUSASI $SOT
000 dll4-10 "dwoQ ey - 020§  dwog seomo
99'L¥0'6 SINT - €0 SSLEIES - L10S " SISOWO JAIYD
99'LY0'6 a4 - 10 SeLBES - LLOS T SISO JOIuD 9z/8lL
Hpain jqag sse|n Junoaoy owsp aweN wnN
920z ‘g Aenuep siseg jeniooy

uolnjoesuel] [eulnor [eJauasg
J0L13ISIQ UOHISJ0Id BlI4 [|epuSY [0)SlIg

92/60/20
NV €0°L1



z abegd

12°€69'VLE

L1°€69'V1LE

Tv.iolL
LL°€69'PLE 21°€69'PLE
9v'658 a4 - 10 al4 =YD - LiLL T Bulng noshed Kedbuong
S6'605°L al4-10  “URINSU| YNeaH - ObLL vda3A
SYELL'EE ali4- 10 M4 -NYD - L1l uolsusd
16°1E2'61 ald - 10 al4-3UD - LLLL Kungery xey
SOSHE'vL al4- 10 CEEED Fo RN NN
SOSYE'Y.L ai4- 10 SHS-NYD - LiLL
99'v86'6 8id-10  XeJl awooul | - OELE
00°8+9'€Z A4-10  Tody| [esSped - 6ZLE L SWOOU| pad
0zees'y Si4-10 Uesienos Il -gZie  Aunoss jeroog
£V'9.2' al4-10 U9 [e100g 33 - 8ZLE a1edIpaly
19'969'Z1 ald-10  uoisuad Uply - LZLE uolsusd
G6'SE6'Y alld - 10 uesH - gzZLe [eO1palN
19619 ald - 10 HHIN - 9ZLE (]
19619 al4- 10 JdIN - 92LE SN
15°€52°L al4- 10 oBYY - €21 oeyy
82°€56 ald - 10 Jepy - €21 sepy
2£°€£0'2 ald-10  Xejoud 33 LGY - 22LE pSPiers
60°802 and4-10  xeid 33 LSy - 22LE sy
OL'66S'2 ald-10  Xxepld 33 /G - 22LE /5%
20'8£2'2 al4-10  Xxeid 33 LGP - ZZLE JAstd
9v'668 and4-10 oomues lolhed - 0905 - Buig (joihed Kedbuong
666G L1 alid- 10  Xejaid 33 LG - ZZLE  2SP UOISIA YSH
000 SINT-€0 "SISO JBID - 005 90O JBID
00°0 Qlld- 10 "USIdPOBIYD - 0E0S T ISdMIO JBIND
000 all4-10  uolsued Uplp - 1ZLE uoisuad
18'969°2L ald-10  uoIsusd Uply - LZLE uoisusd
0Z€25'Y all4-10 "TUHNOAS |BI2OS - G905 SS ¥3
£r'9/2'e all4-10  "TMN09g |BId0S - G905 P Y3
99°'v86'6 ald-10  Xelswoou|T|-QELE  XeL awodu] T
00°8¥9'c2 al4-10  "UOdU|[eseped - 6ZLE L Swoduj pad
02'€2s'y aN4-10 oS [eos 3T - gZie  Aunoes [eroos
£7'9.2'c all4-10 oS |eog 37 - 82LE aledipaly
000 8l14-10 “TYSILIED SdD - HZLE sjuswysiLIeD
000 all4-10  uoIsuUSd Uplb - LZLE uoisuad
000 al4-10 UUsiues) SO - $ZLE sjuswysiuies
000 ald- 10 L0bXd - 2ZLE Moy
000 ai4-10 “ebysaaul and - 6208 ERIE
000 AUL-10 0D IUBYISN - ZHOS diNOD
Hpailo Hgaqg sse|D JUnoJdYy oway sweN wnN

920z ‘g Aenuep

uoljoesuel] |eulnop |eJauan)
JoH3SIQ UOII3J0Id Al [[EPUI) [o)sLg

siseg [ensooy
92/60/20

NV €0°L1



| obed

¥1°99% SN - €0 saueles - 110G diNDD
Gl 99p ald- 10 ssuees - 110 diNOD
000 alid-10 0D auil Wed - §Z0S 6601
000 ald- L0 TTUSISdYO SIS - 0S0S uoeses
£9°229'€ a4 - 10 ssueles - 110§ uohesep
00°0 aud- 10 ssueles - 1105 AepijoH
09'082'Z SN - €0 saueles - 110G IS
65°082'C an4 - 10 souees - 1105 IS
000 all4- 10 UONJSUl - ¥dD - 20§ “uadwio) HdD
00'0 SINT - €0 seuees - LL0S  “TUCHBIBANDIS
000 and - 10 SSUElES - | L0  “TUCHBIBANDIS
000 SNZ-€0 "les 2wl lind - 0LOS 11
000 al4-10  “Ulesswil jing - 0L0S 1
000 al4-10 oY [edwyds] - 2€0§ 11
000 al4-10 eanpz Jlignd - 805 p3 and
000 ald-10 oo buwer] - 2zos oo Buwiesy
18°€L9'9L SN - €0 SSUEleS - L 10§ 0D Swil Ued
Z8cL9'9L al4-10 SeuEleS - |10 00 awil Yed
000 aN4-10 oD BWIL Med-SZ0S T lleD uo pled
000 all4-10 "TOQ swif Wed - 5205 [edisAud
000 alld- 10 "UODOMEBYIBI - ZPOS 0D JUBYIS
000 ald-10 "UleS awil Ind - 0L0S S804
000 all4-10  “Ules eswil lInd - 010§ TOHD
00°0 all4- 10  Ufesewil ind - 010§ ¥vsnod
000 SW3 - €0 sauees - 1108 AepijoH
00'0 all4- 10 sapeles - 110G AepijoH
69°G5¢ SINT - €0 saueles - 1106 v
69°G6¢ ald - 10 sapeles - 1105 ™
Pr0oLL SN - €0 sauees - 110§ 9L
Py 0Ll ali4-10 saue[es - 110G 9L
000 SNZ-€0 "[eS awWil Ind - 0108 440¥
000 all4-10 “Uleg 8wl find - 0L0S 440%
8.'ve8'e SIN3 - €0 seueles - 110G 10
6.°v€8'E al4 - 10 saeles - 110§ 10
000 all4-10 " ISJRM BMS - YOS YILVM
000 ald-10 "UYyseL 2ndsay - 9805 ve0s
000 SINZ-€0  “ongsul - ¥dO - €205 OSN3
98°966 SN3 - €0 soueeS - 110§ 1O @oueinsy|
18°966 all4 - 10 saueles - 110 1dO soueInsyy
000 SWI-£0 “lesswil |ind - 010§ snuog o8y
00°0 a4 - 10  “Ules ewil iind - 0105 snuog osay
000 SW3-€0 “[esawil|ingd-0L0§ "og uoisuaey
000 all4-10 UleSauwil N4 -0L0G  TUog uoisudley
29°'8.4'0L SIN3 - €0 soueles - 110G o3y
£8'8/'0L alid - 10 saueles - 110G ER]
000 SNZ-€0 dwod IO - 0205 TTHUSARIH SSOT
000 al4-10 dwodiSoPo - 0Z0s  Cdwe) 1o
99'Lb0'6 SN - €0 SauelES - 110G T SISOO $8ID
99'L¥0'6 ald - 1L saueles - 110§ T SISOO P 2Tl

HpaLn ungaqg ssejn unoasy OWAIN sweN wnN

9202 ‘ze Aenuer

uorjoesuel| [eunop [eJauas
Jo}SIQ UOII3J0.d alld [[epua)] jojslg

siseg [Bn193y
92/60/20

NV €0:11



Z abed

St'0.5°G82

Sv'0.5°G82

TviolL
S+'0.5'982 6¥°015'982
1€5¢ ald- 10 Al -NYD - LLLL - Bulg noshed Kedbuons
86°Z8v'L al4-10 “Uensuj yjesH - ov./ va3A
¥Z'925'2¢ an4-10 a4 -3 - LLLL uoisuad
18982y all4 - 10 8l -MYD - LiLL Agert xep
2T .£8°19 aid- 10 a4 -34D - Ll usodeq ang
£2°/£8'19 aid - 10 a4 -MuD - 11LL “usodeq ang
G.°096'S al4-10 Xelawooul|-Q0ELE  Xel awodu| i
L76LE'6) and-10  "Uoou| [ei9pSd - 6ZLE L SWooU| pa4
67901y ai4-10 95 (eosg I3 -8zie  Aunoes jewos
98146 al4-10 9 [e1os I3 - 8ZLE aJedipaiy
£0°GLL'EL al4-10  uoIsudd Ublb - LZLE uoisuad
€S Y6y all4- 10 ulesH - GZle [eoIpay
€509 al4 - 10 SN - 9zZLE I
$5$09 all4 - 10 S9N - 92LE AN
1§€GL L al4 - 10 oBYY - £21€ oeyy
82°€56 ai4 - 10 oepy - €Z1€ depy
97'68.'9 ai4-10  Xepld 33 L6¥ - 2ZLE ish
60°802 ai4-10  Xepld 33 LSy - ZZLE sy
€1°128'9 alnd-10  Xepid 33 LGv - Z2LE a.5v
108822 al4-10  Xepid 33 LSy - Z2LE iSY
l1°€52 al4- L0 @0WIes floihed - 090§ T Bunpg jjoihed Aedbuong
90°0£5'9L ali4-10  Xeld 33 LGP - ZZLE LG UOISIA VSH
000 ST -€0 "SISO 8IS - 0L0S T IR0l JeIyD
00°0 ali4- 10 CUSISOPO JBIYD - 0E0S T IRdMO JBID
000 a4~ 10  uoisusd Uvly - LZLE uolsuad
€0°GLL'EL and-10  uoisuad Uply - LZLE uolsuad
67901y a4~ 10  "ULNO3S [BI00S - 6906 SS ¥3
98°1.6'2 8ll4- 10  “UHUNO9G [BI20S - G905 SETRSE|
5.°096'8 Ali-10  XelawooupTi-QELE  Xel awodu|
76126l alN4-10  Uoouffeseped - 6ZLE L SWOdUf pad
6°90L'y al4-10 eg(enog 33 .92l Aunoss [eroos
98'1L16'2 al4-10 9g[eInog 33 - 8ZLE a1e21paly
000 Bll4-10 TUSIUED SdD - YZLE sjualwysiues)
000 ald-1p  uoisusd Yyly - LZLE uolsuad
000 alld- 10 TUSIED SdD - $ZLE sjuswysiueD
000 a4 - L0 LOYXd - LZLE MLoP
000 and-10 ebyssaul alnd - 6£06 ENIE
00°0 al4-10  "U0D JUBYIS| - TYOS diNOD
Hpasn Hngag SSe[D junoaoy OwsN aweN wnN

920z ‘2z Aenuep

uoljoesuel] [EUINO[ [BI9U9D)
J19L3SIQ UONI8}0Id Bli4 ||epud)Y [oslig

siseq [enidoy
92/60/20

NV €0°L)



Financial Report

For the 9 Month(s) Ended January 31, 2026
FISCAL YEAR 2026

*
e o
*W-

*C@@'

Page 1 of 11



BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Summary

For the 9 Month(s) Ended January 31, 2026

75% of Fiscal Year

Account Description Total Actual Total Budget % of Budget
REVENUE
Property Tax 8,683,349 8,646,000 100.4%
Ambulance / Response Fees 1,467,571 1,865,000 78.7%
Replacement Tax 24,588 65,000 37.8%
Foreign Fire Insurance 93,961 70,000 134.2%
Interest 275,228 175,000 157.3%
Unrealized Gain/Loss 29,544 - 0.0%
Development Fees 139,617 125,000 11.7%
Donations 550 - 0.0%
Plan Review / CPR /Repott Fees 16,338 15,000 108.9%
GEMT Expense Reimbursement (280,967) (500,000) 56.2%
Sale of Assets 4,500 - 0.0%
Misc. Income 119,221 60,000 198.7%
Transfer From Fund 2,285,070 4,570,140 50.0%
Loan Proceeds - - 0.0%
Grants 22,915 485,000 4.7%
Actual Revenues 12,881,487 15,676,140 82.7%
Budgeted Revenues 15,576,140
% Diff 83%
EXPENDITURES
Personnel 4,768,828 7,317,175 65.2%
Pension Fund Contribution 650,000 650,000 100.0%
Equipment 77,961 147,550 52.8%
R&M 350,570 469,090 74.7%
Administrative 300,807 505,995 59.4%
Medical Supplies 39,540 58,500 67.6%
Utilities 116,479 202,500 57.5%
Insurance 149,718 315,000 47.5%
Foreign Fire 65,167 70,000 93.1%
Memorial Expense 2,577 7,000 36.8%
Actual Expenditures 6,521,647 9,742,810 66.9%
Budgeted Expenditures 9,742,810
% Diff 67%
SURPLUS / (DEFICIT) FROM OPERATIONS 6,359,840 5,833,330 109.0%
CAPITAL EXPENDITURES
Capital Projects 1,163,310 2,115,225 55.0%
Transfer To Funds 2,285,070 4,570,140 50.0%
Actual Expenditures 3,448,380 6,685,365 51.6%
Budgeted Expenditures 6,685,365
% Diff 52%
TOTAL SURPLUS / (DEFICIT) 2,911,461 (852,035) -341.7%
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE 10,068,081
ENDING FUND BALANCE 12,979,542

Page 2 of 11



BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Summary
For the 9 Month(s) Ended January 31, 2026

Revenue Distribution

Unrealized
Gain/Loss

o 0.3%
Foreign Fire  |nterest Plan Review / CPR

Insurance 2.5%
0.8% ° /Re%o;t(yl:ees
Replacement Tax Misc. Income
0.2% 1.1%
Sale of Assets

0.0%

Ambulance /
Response Fees
13.2%

Property Tax
78.0%

Operational Expenditure Distribution

Medical Supplies
0.6% Utilities
1.8%

Administrative
4.6%
R&M Insurance

0 2.3%
B ) Foreign Fire

1.0%
Equipment
1.2%

Pension Fund
Contribution
10.0%

73.1%

Page 3 of 11



18,000,000

16,000,000

14,000,000

12,000,000

10,000,000

8,000,000

6,000,000

4,000,000

2,000,000

(2,000,000)

BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Summary
For the 9 Month(s) Ended January 31, 2026

$16,428,175
$15,576,140
$12,881,
$9,970,02
$2,911,461
T T
Revenues Expenditures
$(852,035)
mYTD O Budget

Page 4 of 11



BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Aclual Summary
For the 9 Month(s) Ended January 31, 2026

75% of Fiscal Year

Account Description Fire EMS i FFIB Capital Memorial Total Actual Total Budget % of Budget
REVENUE
Property Tax 4,590,314 3,864,985 228,051 - - - - 8,683,349 8,646,000 100%
Ambulance / Response Fees 12,012 1,455,560 - - - - - 1,467,571 1,865,000 79%
Pension Fund Contributions - - - - - - - - - 0%
Replacement Tax 24,588 - - - - - - 24,588 65,000 38%
Foreign Fire Insurance - . - - 93,961 - - 93,961 70,000 134%
Interest 103,621 3.203 - - 2,737 165,548 120 275,228 175,000 167%
Unrealized Gain/Loss 39,888 - - - - (10,344) - 29,544 - 0%
Development Fees 139,617 - - - - - - 139,617 125,000 112%
Health insurance W/H - - - - - - - - - 0%
Employee Pension Contribution - - - - - - - - - 0%
#TF Reimbursment - - - - - - - - - 0%
Donations 50 - - - - - 500 550 - 0%
Plan Review / CPR /Repor Fees 16,338 - - - - - - 16,338 15,000 109%
GEMT Expense Reimbursement - {280,967) - - - - - {280,967 (500,000) 56%
Sale of Assels 4,500 - - - - - - 4,500 - 0%
Transfer From Fund - - - 213,475 - 2,071,585 - 2,285,070 4,570,140 50%
Loan Proceeds - - - - - - - - - 0%
Grants - - - - - 22,915 - 22,915 485,000 5%
Misc. income 101,41 - 14,802 - - 3,000 - 119,221 60,000 199%
Actual Revenues 5,032,34 5,042,780 242,853 213,475 96,698 2,252,714 620 12,881,487 | 16,576,140 83%
Budgeted Revenues 4,457,001 5,204,000 689,950 242,000 4,913,190 70,000 - 15,576,140
% Diff 113% 97% 35% 88% 2% 3218% 0% 83%
OPERATING EXPENDITURES
Personnel 2,771,178 1,897,650 - - - - - 4,768,828 7.317,175 65%
Pension Fund Contribution 325,000 325,000 - - - - - 650,000 650,000 100%
Equipment 61,360 16,344 - 1.257 - - - 77,961 147,550 53%
R&M 184,650 85,842 - 80,058 - 20 - 350,570 469,090 75%
Administrative 7432 916 - 292,085 - 394 300,807 505,995 59%
Medical Supplies - 9,582 - 29,958 - - - 39,540 58,500 68%
Utilities - - - 116,479 - - - 116,479 202,500 58%
insurance - - 146,938 2,780 - - - 149,718 315,000 48%
Foreign Fire - - - - 65,167 - - 65,167 70,000 93%
Memorial Expense - - - - - - 2,577 2,577 7,000.00 37%
Actual Exy 3,349,621 2,434,334 146,938 522,596 65,167 413 2,577 6,521,647 9,742,810 67%
d 4,332,930 4,257,930 759,950 315,000 - 70,000 7,000 9,742,810
% Diff 7% 7% 9% 166% 0% 1% 37% 67%
SURPLUS / (DEFICIT) 1,682,726 2,608,447 96,916 (309,121) 31,531 2,252,300 (1,957) 6,359,840 5,833,330 109%
CAPITAL EXPENDITURES
Capital Projects - - - 2,478 - 1,160,831 - 1,163,310 2,115,225 55%
Debt Service - - - - - - - - - 0%
Transfer To Funds 1,062,035 1,223,035 - - - - - 2,285,070 4,570,140 50%
Actual Ex( 1,062,035 1,223,035 - 2478 - 1,160,831 - 3,448,380 6,685,365 52%
dE dit 2,124,070 2,446,070 - - 2,115,225 - - 6,685,365
% Diff 50% 50% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 52%
Fire EMS Insurance { FFiB Capital Memorial Total Actual Total Budget
TOTAL SURPLUS / (DEFICIT) 620,691 1,385,412 95,915 {311,599) 31,531 1,091,469 {1,957) 2,911,461 {852,035)
BEG FUND BAL 4,033,063 3,222,485 367,245 514,906 196,583 1,722,112 11,677 10,068,081
END FUND BAL 4,663,754 4,607,807 463,160 Pagp b 228,114 2,813,581 9,720 12,879,542
Fund Bal to Exp Ratio 105% 126% 315% 38% n/a nla 377% 130%



Revenues
4011 - Tax Levy
4031 - Replacement Tax
4041 - Foreign Fire Insurance Tax (2%)
4224 - Interest - Money Market
4225 - Gain/Loss From Investements
4310 - Transfer-In
4301 - Development Fees-Yorkville
4511 - Donations
4605 - Response Fees
4610 - Plan Review / Permit Fees
4624 - Training Reimbursements
4630 - Expense Reimbursements
4640 - Report/ Copy Fees
4680 - Sale of Assets
4690 - Grants
4750 - Miscellaneous Income

Total Revenues

Expenditures
Personnel
5011 - Salaries
5012 - Contract Salaries
5045 - Trustee's Compensation

5065 - 401K / IMRF Dist. Contributions

5056 - Pension Fund - Contribution
5060 - Payroll Service

5065 - Social Security & Medicare
7730 * Accident,Sick & Disability
7740 - Health Insurance

Subtotal

Equipment
5165 * Uniforms & Brass
5167 - Uniforms - Mechanic Uniform
5510 - Firefighting Supplies
5520 - Firefighting Equipment
5527 - Equipment - Fire Investigation
5530 - Station Equipment

BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Summary
For the 7 Month(s) Ended November 30, 2025

BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Detail
December 31, 2025

Monthly Monthly

Total Budget YTD Total YTD Budget $ Over Budget % of Budget
0.00 720,500.00 8,683,349.26 8,646,000.00 37,349.26 100.43%
4,515.50 5,416.67 24,588.07 65,000.00 -40,411.93 37.83%
0.00 5,833.33 93,961.12 70,000.00 23,961.12 134.23%
23,262.63 14,583.33 275,227.72 175,000.00 100,227.72 1567.27%
603.97 0.00 29,543.99 0.00 29,543.99 100.0%
2,285,070.00 380,845.00 2,285,070.00 4,570,140.00 -2,285,070.00 50.0%
0.00 10,416.67 139,617.30 125,000.00 14,617.30 111.69%
500.00 0.00 550.00 0.00 550.00 100.0%
218,592.96 165,416.67 1,467,571.42 1,865,000.00 -397,428.58 78.69%
870.00 1,250.00 16,338.00 15,000.00 1,338.00 108.92%
0.00 0.00 2,250.00 0.00 0.00 100.0%
0.00 -41,666.67 -280,966.55 -500,000.00 0.00 56.19%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
4,500.00 0.00 4,500.00 0.00 4,500.00 100.0%
0.00 40,416.67 22,915.00 485,000.00 -462,085.00 4.73%
7,053.34 5,000.00 116,971.39 60,000.00 56,971.39 194.95‘&
2,544,968.40 1,298,011.67 12,881,486.72 15,576,140.00 -2,694,653.28 82.7%
447,585.36 509,139.58 4,088,703.35 6,109,675.00 -2,020,971.65 66.92%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
0.00 2,708.33 0.00 32,500.00 -32,500.00 0.0%
5,148.36 7,500.00 50,203.53 90,000.00 -39,796.47 55.78%
0.00 54,166.67 650,000.00 650,000.00 0.00 100.0%
1,112.63 0.00 5,331.31 0.00 5,331.31 100.0%
14,877.98 18,333.33 135,057.20 220,000.00 -84,942.80 61.39%
0.00 1,250.00 0.00 156,000.00 -15,000.00 0.0%
54,949.17 70,833.33 489,532.42 850,000.00 -360,467.58 57.59%
523,673.50 663,931.25 5,418,827.81 7,967,175.00 -2,548,347.19 68.01%
3,898.72 4,041.67 28,920.82 48,500.00 -19,579.18 59.63%
0.00 666.67 3,221.97 8,000.00 -4,778.03 40.28%
3,164.57 1,708.33 9,933.53 20,500.00 -10,566.47 48.46%
512.14 4,291.67 29,834.89 51,500.00 -21,665.11 57.93%
0.00 Pads® e 11 0.00 3,000.00 -3,000.00 0.0%
0.00 595.83 1,765.79 7,150.00 -5,384.21 24.7%



BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Summary

For the 7 Month(s) Ended November 30, 2025

BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Detail
December 31, 2025

Monfﬁ'ly Monzﬁly

R&M

Total Budget YTD Total YTD Budget $ Over Budget % of Budget

55301 - Station Equipment - 1 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
65302 - Station Equipment - 2 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
55303 - Station Equipment - 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
5540 - Fire Numbers & Maps 333.24 0.00 414.51 0.00 414.51 100.0%
6285 - Computer Equipment 38,18 741.67 3,869.23 8,900.00 -5,030.77 43.47%
6285 - Computer Equipment - Other 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
Subtotal 7,946.85 12,295.83 77,960.74 147,550.00 -69,589.26 52.84%

5560 - Repair & Maintenance Vehicles 5,767.48 20,833.33 50,892.82 250,000.00 -199,107.18 20.36%
5562 - R&M Vehicles 101 361.59 0.00 2,074.25 0.00 2,074.25 100.0%
5563 - R&M Vehicles 102 0.00 0.00 698.30 0.00 698.30 100.0%
5564 * R&M Vehicles 103 0.00 0.00 1,976.36 0.00 1,976.36 100.0%
6565 + R&M Vehicles 104 0.00 0.00 1,111.94 0.00 1,111.94 100.0%
5566 - R&M Vehicles 121 2,781.17 0.00 4,844.77 0.00 4,844.77 100.0%
5567 - R&M Vehicles 122 32.21 0.00 7,093.95 0.00 7,093.95 100.0%
5568 + R&M Vehicles 123 2,084.64 0.00 31,009.59 0.00 31,009.59 100.0%
5569 - R&M Vehicles 107 0.00 0.00 480.01 0.00 480.01 100.0%
6569 + R&M Vehicles 108 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0,00 0.0%
5572 * R&M Vehicles 124 76.53 0.00 15,474.57 0.00 15,474.57 100.0%
5573 + R&M Vehicles 106 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
5576 + R&M Vehicles 131 0,00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
5577 + R&M Vehicles 136 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
5578 + R&M Vehicles 141 0.00 0.00 1,405.78 0.00 1,405.78 100.0%
5579 + R&M Vehicles 142 0.00 0.00 91.62 0.00 91.62 100.0%
5580 + R&M Vehicles 143 51,65 0.00 3,777.34 0.00 3,777.34 100.0%
5581 - R&M Vehicles 144 0.00 0.00 8,732.04 0.00 6,732.04 100.0%
5582 - R&M Vehicles 145 0.00 0,00 498.09 0.00 498.09 100.0%
5590 + R&M Vehicles 161 0.00 0.00 8,565.51 0.00 8,565.51 100.0%
5591 * R&M Vehicles 158 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
5592 - R&M Vehicles 166 0.00 0.00 9,187.11 0.00 9,187.11 100.0%
5594 + R&M Vehicles 161 0.00 0.00 3,5623.48 0.00 3,523.48 100.0%
5595 - R&M Vehicles 162 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
5598 - R&M Vehicles 175 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
5600 - R&M Vehicles 177 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
5602 - R&M Vehicles 181 3,335:49 0.00 25,203.26 0.00 25,203.26 100.0%
5605 - R&M Boats and Trailer 0.00 0.00 55.59 0.00 55,59 100.0%
5608 + R&M Shop Supplies 0.00 P 41?67 1 4,585.28 5,000.00 -414.72 91.71%
5609 - R&M - Shop Tools 1,653.80 aggd 5 12,855.13 10,000.00 2,855.13 128.55%
5610 - Repair & Maintenance Equipment 1,100.60 1,432.50 15,152.80 17,190.00 -2,037.20 88.15%



65615 - R&M Electronic Equipment
5620 - R&M Personal Protective Equip
5625 - Fuel - Vehicles
7100 - Repair & Maintenance
71001 - Repair & Maintenance - 1
71002 - Repair & Maintenance - 2
71003 - Repair & Maintenance - 3

7100 - Repair & Maintenance - Other

Admin

5130 -
5135

Subtotal

Legal & Accounting
Station Supplies

51351 - Station Supplies -1
61352 - Station Supplies - 2
51353 - Station Supplies - 3
5135 - Station Supplies - Other

5140 -

Office Supplies -Op

51401 - Office Supplies -1
51402 - Office Supplies - 2
51403 - Office Supplies - 3
5140 - Office Supplies -Op - Other

51456 -
5535 -
5545 -
5690 -
5700 -
5705 -
5720 -
5725+
5736 -
+ Training Computers & Software
5740 -
5742 -
5750 -
7110 -

5737

Postage/Shipping

Station Furnishings - Other
Membership Appreciation Expense
Travel / Meeting Expenses
Education - Tuitions

Education - Supplies & Equip
Education - Conferences
Education - Travel Expenses
Education - CPR - Cards

Dues & Subscriptions
Public Education Supplies
Dispatching Fees
Cleaning Supplies

71101 - Cleaning Supplies - 1
71102 - Cleaning Supplies - 2
71103 - Cleaning Supplies - 3
7110 - Cleaning Supplies - Other

BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Summary

For the 7 Month(s) Ended November 30, 2025

BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Detail
December 31, 2025

““Monthly Monthly

Total Budget YTD Total YTD Budget $ Over Budget % of Budget
0.00 0.00 59.30 0.00 59.30 100.0%
0.00 516.67 704.28 6,200.00 -5,495.72 11.36%
6,114.98 7,500.00 61,627.39 90,000.00 -28,372.61 68.48%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
2,042.12 5,442.00 45,561.56 65,304.00 -19,742.44 69.77%
664.58 1,020.38 10,375.70 12,244.50 -1,868.80 84.74%
3,004.23 1,095.96 19,378.54 13,151.50 6,227.04 147.35%
2,344.00 0.00 5,573.49 0.00 5,573.49 100.0%
31,395.07 39,090.83 350,569.85 469,090.00 -118,520.15 74.73%
3,236.25 8,750.00 41,843.80 105,000.00 -63,156.20 39.85%
0.00 541.67 0.00 6,500.00 -6,500.00 0.0%
0.00 0.00 796.59 0.00 796.59 100.0%
0.00 0.00 376.82 0.00 376.82 100.0%
16.98 0.00 270.43 0.00 270.43 100.0%
842.82 0.00 2,822.59 0.00 2,822.59 100.0%
-2,082.99 125.00 0.00 1,500.00 -1,500.00 0.0%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
37.00 0.00 37.00 0.00 37.00 100.0%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
2,082.99 0.00 2,082.99 0.00 2,082.99 100.0%
9.85 141.67 1,076.40 1,700.00 -623.60 63.32%
648.00 1,533.33 20,065.13 18,400.00 1,665.13 109.05%
315.53 833.33 1,884.22 10,000.00 -8,115.78 18.84%
0.00 333.33 168.60 4,000.00 -3,831.40 4.22%
1,300.00 5,083.33 17,997.58 61,000.00 -43,002.42 29.5%
0.00 333.33 525.37 4,000.00 -3,474.63 13.13%
375.00 416.67 1,5661.56 5,000.00 -3,438.44 31.23%
0.00 416.67 3,676.16 5,000.00 -1,323.84 73.52%
0.00 0.00 768.75 0.00 768.75 100.0%
0.00 0.00 129.95 0.00 129.95 100.0%
527.90 74.58 1,972.90 895.00 1,077.90 220.44%
76.90 1,250.00 10,970.59 15,000.00 -4,029.41 73.14%
0.00 4,000.00 43,725.94 48,000.00 -4,274.06 91.1%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
297.82 333.33 4,697.24 4,000.00 697.24 117.43%
0.00 333.3 3,081.33 4,000.00 -918.67 77.03%
293.92 Pagﬁ:?.é%ai 11 6,496.29 4,000.00 2,496.29 162.41%
0.00 0.00 1,132.00 0.00 1,132.00 100.0%



BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

Monthaly ~Nonthiy

Budget vs. Actual Summary
For the 7 Month(s) Ended November 30, 2025

Budget vs. Actual Detail

December 31, 2025

Total Bud_get YTD Total YTD Budget $ Over Budget % of Budget

7120 - Copy / Fax Lease 370.00 416,67 4,503.94 5,000.00 -496.06 90.08%
7150 - Software Maintenance 2,290.00 8,500.00 84,086.55 102,000.00 -17,913.45 82.44%
7170 - Computer Equipment Repair 0.00 83.33 100.55 1,000.00 -899.45 10.06%
71701 - Computer Equipment Repair - 1 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
71703 + Computer Equipment Repair - 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
7170 - Computer Equipment Repair - Oth: 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%

7200 - News Letter & Web Site Expenses 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
7250 - Employee Testing & Vaccinations 5,130.20 6,666.67 42,011.49 80,000.00 -37,988.51 52.51%
7256 - New Hire & Promotional Testing 0.00 0.00 1,905.60 0.00 1,905.60 100.0%
Countywide Fire Records Management Syst 0.00 1,666.67. 0.00 20,000.00 -20,000.00 0.0%
7999 - Miscellaneous Expenses 0.00 0.00 39.00 0.00 39.00 100.0%
Subtotal 15,768,17 42,166.,25 300,807.36 505,995.00 -205,187.64 59.45%

Medical g
6260 - Medical Supplies - Reusable 0.00 166.87 5,755.94 2,000.00 3,755.94 287.8%
6265 - Medical Supplies - Non-Reusable 1,058.36 2,083.33 13,477.78 25,000.00 -11,622.22 53.91%
6270 - Oxygen - Other 2,706.87 2,000.00 19,401.86 24,000.00 -4,598.14 80.84%
6275 - Medications 0.00 208.33 0.00 2,500.00 -2,500.00 0.0%
6275 - Medications - Other 0.00 0.00 904.16 0.00 904.15 100.0%
6280 - MedMedical Equipment 0.00 416.67 0.00 5,000.00 +5,000.00 0.0%
Subtotal 3,765.23 4,875.00 39,539.73 58,500.00 ~18,960.27 67.59%
Utilities

7010 - Electric 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
70101 - Electric - 1 804,71 2,916.,67 19,388.61 35,000.00 ~15,611.39 55.4%
70102 - Electric - 2 0.00 1,458.33 7,206.50 17,500.00 ~10,293.50 41.18%
70103 - Electric - 3 0.00 1,458.33 7,945.56 17,500.00 ~9,5664.44 45.4%
7020 - Gas 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
70201 - Gas - 1 1,479.53 958.33 6,312.26 11,500.00 -5,187.74 54.89%
70202 - Gas - 2 316.46 47917 2,341.86 5,750.00 -3,408.14 40.73%
70203 - Gas - 3 530,08 47947 3,071.54 5,750.00 ~2,678.46 53.42%
7030 - Sewer & Water 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
70301 - Sewer & Water - 1 0.00 22917 3,712.74 2,750.00 962.74 135.01%
70302 - Sewer & Water - 2 0.00 114.58 2,187.36 1,375.00 812.36 159.08%
70303 - Sewer & Water - 3 0.00 114.58 3,473.02 1,375.00 2,098.02 252.58%
7050 - Telephone 0.00 1,562.50 0.00 18,750.00 -18,750.00 0.0%
70501 - Telephone - 1 3,388.62 4,687.50 33,995.28 56,250.00 ~22,254.72 60.44%
70502 - Telephone - 2 0.00 0 10.51 0.00 10.51 100.0%
70503 - Telephone - 3 0.00 Page%d’g " 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
7050 - Telephone - Other 358.00 0.00 12,465.06 0.00 12,465.06 100.0%



7060 -

Data and Television

70601 - Data and Television - 1
70602 - Data and Television - 2
70603 - Date and Television - 3
7060 « Data and Television - Other

7070 -

Insurance
7705 -
7720 -
7750 -

Alarm Monitoring
Subtotal

General Liability Insurance

Umbrelia /Excess Liability Ins.

Workmens Compensation Insurance
Subtotal

Foreign Fire

5170+

Annual Station Disbursement

Memorial Expense

8060 *
8200 -

Capital

8000 -
6280 -
8160 -
8285 -
8525 -
8638
8010 -
8020 -

Charitable Donations
Firemen's Park Expenses
Subtotal

Capital Projects
Medical Equipment
PPE Capital
Computer Equipment Capital
Apparatus
Equipment Purchases over $5,000
Debt Service
Transfer Out
Subtotal

Total Expenditures

Net Income

BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Summary
For the 7 Month(s) Ended November 30, 2025

BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

Budget vs. Actual

Detail

December 31, 2025
Wonthly Monthly

Total Budget YTD Total YTD Budget $ Over Budget % of Budget
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
99.12 2,083.33 1,532.93 25,000.00 -23,467.07 6.13%
0.00 0.00 52.40 0.00 52.40 100.0%
736.65 0.00 736.65 0.00 736.65 100.0%
0.00 0.00 12,046.53 0.00 12,046.53 100.0%
0.00 333.33 0.00 4,000.00 -4,000.00 0.0%
7,713.17 16,875.00 116,478.81 202,500.00 -86,021.19 57.52%
0.00 4,583.33 227.00 §5,000.00 ~54,773.00 0.41%
0.00 1,250.00 0.00 15,000.00 -15,000.00 0.0%
18,819.00 20,416.67. 149,491.00 245,000.00 -95,509.00 61.02%
18,819.00 26,250.00 149,718.00 315,000.00 ~165,282.00 47.53%
2,079.92 5,833.33 65,167.35 70,000.00 -4,832.65 93.1%
2,079.92 5,833.33 65,167.35 70,000.00 -4,832.65 93.1%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
0.00 583.33 2,577.06 7,000.00 -4,422.94 36.82%
0.00 583.33 2,577.06 7,000.00 -4,422.94 36.82%
14,775.53 122,291.67 749,709.75 1,467,500.00 -717,780.25 51.09%
5,579.69 12,833.33 133,821.49 154,000.00 -20,178.51 86.9%
0.00 14,665,67 88,983.75 176,000.00 -87,016.25 50.56%
6,838.88 4,393.75 14,065.64 52,725.00 -38,669.36 26.66%
16,851.93 8,333.33 73,203.69 100,000.00 -26,796.31 73.2%
0.00 13,750.00 103,535.18 165,000.00 -61,464.82 62.75%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
2,285,070.00 380,845.00 2,285,070.00 4,570,140.00 -2,285,070.00 50.0%
2,329,116,03 557,113.75 3,448,379.50 6,685,365.00 -3,236,985.50 51.58%
2,940,276.94 1,363,181.26 9,970,026.21 16,428,175.00 -6,458,148.79 60.69%
-395,308.54 -65,169.58 2,911,460.51 -852,035.00 3,763,495.51 -341.71%

Page 10 of 11



BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Summary
For the 6 Month(s) Ended October 31, 2025

Bristol-Kendall Fire Protection District

Investments
December 31, 2025

Bank Account  Current Rate Book Balance

First National - CK 3048 1.46% 33,828
First National - FFIB CK 0353 1.46% 1,635
First National - MM (EMS) 8274 1.97% 375,900
First National - MM (FFIB) 6591 1.97% 229,408
First National - MM (Memorial) 0220 1.97% 10,959
Charles Schwab - Investments 9163 N/A 6,094,705
Charles Schwab - Building Investr 2959 N/A 1,027,946
Charles Schwab - Capital Investm 1789 N/A 4,985,523

Total $ 12,759,904

First National - MM

(EMS)

2.9% First National - MM
(FFIB)
1.8%

First National - CK
0.3%

First National - MM

(Memorial)
Charles Schwab - 0.1%
Capital Investments
39.1%
Charles Schwab -
Investments
47.8%

Charles Schwab -

Building Investmer

8.1%

Page 11 of 11



920T ‘T¢ Arenue( papug (s)HUO 6 Y3 104
SISAJeUuy Teroueur]

PLYSI(J U013I3101] 11 [[epUd)-[0ISLIg



198png 30 %601 10 §EE'9TS PAIROD -
$99/] 110day /Y JD /Ma1Ady ue[]

193png Jo 9 /ST 10 877G/ PAIINI0D -
}S9IU]

198png Jo %6/ 10 /6" /9% 1§ PRS0 -
S9o n.H @Uﬁ‘mﬂbﬂgéﬂ

1938png Jo %00T 10 6FE'€89°8% PIORI0D -
soxe] Ajradorg

(ssajsuen pusaiur oN) 393 PN €30, JO %96 10 LIF9650TS PAIIS[[0D)

Tesx 198png jo 9%c/

SJUSIYSIL] SNUDAY



%¢E8 Pd %
0V19LSST SaNULASY pajespng

%Ce 8I7°06L°6 %¢E8 0V1°9LS°CT mevqunﬁ SONUAIY [eMOY

%I1vC L66 V€ %661 000°09 Wmmnm: SWOdU] SN
%901 pSL'L %S 000°S8% waﬁmm syue1D
%0 - %0 - - SP22001J UBo|
%0 - %0¢S OV1°0LS Y Womoam 8TT pun,j WolL IoJsuel],
%0 - %0 - Woomﬁv S19SSY JO oeS
%Covl-  [8S°IC %95 (000°005) W@qow@ JuowssMquIIyy asuadxy TNID
%1 vyL9 %601 000°S1 memﬁﬁ $99,] 110doY/ YO / MoIASY UR[]
%98- 010 %0 - Womm suoneuo(
%81 00S 76 %CI1 000°6T1 Mioﬁmmﬁ $39,] Juewdoreas(y
%L8- zelece %0 - vam“mm SSOT/UTes) pazifearuf)
%19 90S°0L1 %LS1 000°GLI memnmwm 1sa197u]
%0¢ 6TlcL %bel 000°0L womnmm 9oUBIMSU] 211 USI2I0,]
%9- 0£C°9C %8¢ 000°59 Wwwmhvm xe] Jueweoe[dey
%¢€9 165706 %6L 000°598°1 Wﬁmﬂnowq $99 asuodsay / eournquIy
%9 LYTTTT'8 %001 000°9t9°8 W@mﬁmwonw xe], Apedoig

SHANAAAY
5 (:2) ¢ Jdeax jse] 198png 198png [¥10]. [eN39V [B)0L uondirasa( Junoddy
JSe] woJay Jo %
(Ga@)pur

SONUIAIY]



0SL°88 0SL°ETT LT¥°SST 198png "DAV

S6C°16 §68°cT1 €90°€91 "DAV
PC0CAd == SCOZAdE 920ZAd W
A
a > L & 2 06€°L6 1S€°08C [udy
Q SR N S S SR
& QA &@kk@éé&vbvoa,@&é S
J\woo o @0 RS W voo, vso, ,wo, ¢&9 & %/ @oo 4.@/7 - 665201 cociceT yorepy
08T19CT  T9L°L91 Areniqaq
000°0S
(I¥¥or)  1189%1 €6581C Arenuef
000°00T  8.S°9€T TTO'SLI CLTSLI Ioquiaoa(g
: .m 898201
i § TPSYCT  PIT69T  L86°861 ISQUISAON
8 t ZI8'9ET 000‘0ST
) ; 1 698°0ST SLy eyt & . ¢
LSSt oot LILOTT  (POP'8IT)  TITLET 1390190
il €LT'SLT
e 000000c ) h7¢16 LO9E0TT  0PSE0T roquisydog
¥S€0
£€658TT ° ¢ ¢ c ¢ Sw
| ooo'osz 965°T9 638°CCT  698°0S1 1snsny
¥SO° 1L LLTT6 898701 A
-~ 000°00¢€
8€LG0T  66£°08 T18°9¢€1 sung
suon239||0)
8.5°601 12801 IV eV KeIN
PT0TAA  ST0TAA  970TAA IUOTA

(s994 TINAD J0 19U 67/92AD) S H =oouenqury




%0°8L
xe] Apedolid

%C€El
SR
asuodsey / souengquy

%<0

%Ll Xe| juswsoe|dey

SWIodU| "OSsIN

%L0
so9 Hoday/
ddO / MSINSY ueld

%80

%S'C souelnsu| all4 ubleio

1saia)u|

%€0
SSO7/ule) pazijealun

Uonnqrgsi(J sNUsAdY

SONUIAJY]



Teax 193png Jo 9% ¢/,

SIPIYPA F0T'SLS o

Teaded Hdd 786'88% o

yusweoe[dey] sUIBUT ‘CHC69G o

U] SPIYSA ‘88Q°1CE

yusweoedey JOOY 7R0°96CS o

wysAg SUnIeTY UOTIRIS SILT 066°20CS
yuswdmby restpsn ‘Cpe 16T

198png Jo %66 I0 0T C9T @ -
s1oolox Teyden

198png Jo %8G I0 6/F9T1 -
SO

198png Jo %66 10 £08°00€$ -
SATENSIUTWIPY

198png Jo 96/ 10 0/S°06ES -
SdueURIUIRIA pue siteday]

193png Jo 969 10 87899/ 54 -
[PUUOSIaJ

}98png Jo 9.9 10 £$9'TTC'9$
sarnjrpuadxy Sunerad(

SIYSIYSIH 21njrpuadxy



%S da %

$9€°689°9 semypuadxy pajespng
%ECT T6T TSl %CS $9€°689°9 ow €8r°E semyIpuedxy [enjoy
%0 - . %05 OvT0LST 00582 spun o] xaysuei]
%001~  pIvspl %0 - S0TATOS 199
%L1- 8L8°S6E] %SS STTSIIT Wimﬂmf; spafo1g rende)
| STAYINLIANAIXA TVIIdVD
mxg T %
018°THL'6 semypuadxy pajespng
%01 yIET1S6°C %L9 018°TYL6 WSSNQ sexmIpuadxy [enjoy
%E9 851 %LE 000°L WRQN osuadxy [LIOWA
%IEE LET'ST %E6 000°0L WSE@ 211 uSraI0,]
%Sh- 66V°0LT %8 000°1€ SIL6H1 souemsTy
%L~ 8zosel %8S 00520 Wmté: sonII
%ST L09°1€ %89 00S°8S Wovmamm seyddng Teotpey
%C- 960°80¢ %65 $66°50S W.Swnoom SATRISTUTUIPY
%9C VE1'8LT %SL 060°69% Wonmnomm IN®Y
%Lb- p6EGYI %ES 0SS“Ly1 196°LL yuswdmbyg
%0¢ 000°00$ %001 000°0S9 Woooﬁomo UONNQLIUOY) PUN,] UOISUSJ
%cl 9€8°TLL Y %S9 SLILTEL mwmwawﬁ{ [ouuosIog
. STINIIANAIXA ONIIVIAIO
Jeax (o) G g | 198pnyg 198png [e)oL [en)oV [Bl0], aondLIdSd( JUN0dDY
jser| woay Jo o, :
(Gaq@)pur

saInyipuadxyg




%lcL
[suuosiad

%00}
uoRNqLIUOY
pun4 uoisuad

%C'lL
Juswdinbg
%0°L
all4 ubialo vy s
o Akgs
aouelnsu| e
aAljelIsIuIWpY
%81 {o@.o

SellilN  se|ddng [edips|y
uonnqysi(q amrpusdxyg jeuoneradQ

saInjrpuadxy



9¢0¢

SeINIPUSUXT —Em SONUBASY = wuyeq/snidingm  seinypuedxJm  senusreym
9202 $202 9202 5202
oy - 000'000°C 000'000°'C
T 13 '
L9V L6 218'v62'2 L 000°000% 0000007
o 000'000°9
- 000°000°9
000'000°8
- 000°000°8
000°000°01
‘ o —-L 000'000°04 o
000'000°Z1
: - 0000002} 000°000°%1
000'000'¥1
%0¢€1L %.1.E e/u e/u %6¢ %SLE %9¢lL %G0L onjey dx3 o} |eg pun4
WNvm.m.\nm,N—. 0cL'6 L18G'€L8C V¥ll'8ce 10€°€0C 091°¢cor /06,09 #S.°€99v V4 ANN4 dN3
Wrwo.wmo,or 1911 CLLE'TEL'L £8G'061 906'vLS Sv2'19¢€ G6v'cee's £90°e€0'v v4a dNN4d 939
LovLLe e (256°L) 697°L60°L Les‘Le (665°LLE) G16°G6 ZLy's8e’lL 169°029 roi43a) s SN1denNs Tv.1i0L
[enoy €301 |[enowsy  [ejiden gi34  suoneiadQ ooueinsu] SIS EYTR]

‘1¢ Arenue[ papuy (S)JIUOA 6 93 10

aduereg punyg



%8’ L
SIUBWIS3AU|

- qemyos sajiey)

%10
(leoway)

ININ - [euonen 1sui4

%8'T
(g144)

NN - [euOneN 1sii4

%6'C
(sw3)
NI - |leuonen 1s.14

%T'8
1USWISaAU|
3ulp|ing - qemyos sajiey)

%1'6€
S1uswisaau| jeude)

- eMYDS sajJey)

%€°0
AJ - |euoileN 1sdi4

8V v clL lejo)
G/0'9/6'Y V/N 68/1L  sjuswisaAu| [eyided — gemyog sapey)
0S£'G20‘L V/N 6S6C  Sluswisanu| Buipjing — qemyos ssjeyn
996°€85‘9 V/N coL6 SlusWisaAU| - gemMyos sspey)
8¥¥'0l %.6'L 0220 (ledows\) ININ - [euoneN 1sdi4
9L 1LET %161 1659 (4144) ININ - [euonen 3sii4
20L'gsl %161 /28 (SW3) WIN - leuonen 3sii
L. %9t L €G€0 MO 444 — leuoneN 1sii
€99'/GY %911 8%0¢ MO - [euoneN isii
a9duejeg )oog o)y jusiing JUNoJdJy jueg

SJUSWI}SOAU]



Paramedic Services of Illinois, Inc.

Invoice

One Pierce Place, Suite 750W e ——
Itasca, IL. 60143
1/31/26 9511
Bill To
BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION
DISTRICT
103 E. BEAVER STREET
YORKVILLE, IL 60560-1704
Terms Due Date
Net 15 Days 02/15/26
Quantity Description Amount
Total January 2026 Income (IL 108) $ 136,237.62
INTEREST EARNED -JAN (NO fees) $163.10
REFUNDS PAID : $2,569.18 -$2,569.18
Income - Park Ridge Bank $133,668.44
GEMT Portion Excluded from Billing Fee - $ 36,007.80
EFTS Directly paid to BK:
Total EFTS paid direct to BK:
Total for 5% Billing Charae $ 97,.660.64
5% Billing Charge (on $) 97.660.64 -$ 4,883.03
Payable to Bristol-Kendall -$ 128,948.51
Total $0.00




18'65L°2$
SLLy9'ss
8I'695°Z$
S0'9vT'ES
SL'9YS‘TITS
8L'628%
0S°ST$
5'625'vT$
ZT'66€°802$

0T°€9T$
0003
00°0$
T9LET'IETS
00°058$
¥S'v9L205$

S1viol

Atewwing Sugig [enuuy

9¢0¢
PLIISIQ UOIIDI0Ud Bdi4 ||Bpud)-|03slig

1865LZs
SL°Lv9'g8s

8T'695°ZS
SO:9PT'ETS
SL9ps’Tots
BL'6Z8S
0S°STS
ZS6Z5'VZ$

Z1°66€°8023

3A0qE wWoK NUIUNSIIPY (2301
$334 suonaljiol
fpv dwo) suewyiom

spunyay
SwIUISAIPY WaPIY
suoRd3|0) 03 Juas
Honum
uesnsu|
PIE2IPAN
uedipay
Ssjuaunsnfpy
PpauJes 3sasaul

Jig 03 Appauip pred suogoajjo)

suogad|joD Sunpg Ay |=oL
SUDRID]|0) BdueINquIY jendy [e30)L
P3jig 3uyjig 3.4 [e3oy

P3|ig Junowy [e3o1



08°£00°9e $ 9zoss’e $ 90'855°6E$

06°€00°8T $
81°9/6°S $ 9e7Ts6'TT $ 8STI8 $ vesiT $ ve'e9LTIS £ seoe
eLLeoet $ tvssore $ 89'88LC $ zZgger $ erweL'oes  vr 14114

JWYPSMOIAPINOId  SSBADUILWINEN  IWYVIWGIWS93Id S1BHWagald  JWYPIEGIEI0) SIJAIBS  IB3AIEpU3|RD

920¢ Atenuer W39 - 11epus) j01s1ig

6Zv0v
Levov
PJJ044

sieio)
‘LW39 S3H 01984 an( unowy jelo]
Tepua) jo1sug

nepus) joisiig
SWENIaPIAOLg



Monthly Investment Performance Report

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District

Presented by:

Thomas S. Sawyer, Managing Partner
John J. Falduto, Managing Partner
Edward J. Lavin, Chief Investment Officer

SAWYER FALDUTO
ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Sawyer Falduto Asset Management, LLC
589 S. York Street
Elmhurst, IL 60126
0: (630) 941-8560
www.sawyerfalduto.com

As of January 31, 2026




SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Table of Contents

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District= Operations FUNG ssssssssssimmsssssssssssisissssssissiseiivssesiss st sisiiimimmmsmmsa i 3
ACCOUNT OVEIVIBW susvsrsssrssssssvsnsssessssrsissssss s esesssssysss iasssssssssssss suayossssssdsisssisanssssssonseusss sosssssson o7 so3sns ossvassonsv somssivoR e mvevs s uasvomasms T ivassoa oo s s aaanonsasiss 3
PETTOTINANCEHISTONY: wovuresvosoussssssusssssnsyvesss avissssmess s sssyvs sy osssssssasnssssssssssssaiseistsn ioim issmsisvosssorssmssarsmsisassrsae R s SRS T s psa evessasvevoniis 4
o B 5
HOIINES:ssssssessssmsvsnssvimssssomesonssssnsusmsmss s oxvas sosvasssssrssanss csiassoxs e easEs e oo RS e R RS SHoS H TR Ao RSO S U s ooV TSRO TSR o oA e Aes oW e Tisss R o Rt a s ionshonshonodstsoniaissvos i¥ernsnis 6
TrANSACTIONS! sivevmrsrsmsssmsnnsronensesnsssssasss swussosssressss s oesvy FoRs SRS TR TR TA S HT oA YA T Tas oS aUAs s oA VR RAUNax s 50 FORUsRaHUR 0 S0 Nusnensnonsnsnsanasnnsnsasaesansasaonsinsnsnssiivans 7

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - CApItal FUNG ......c.c.ecceveiriniriieiieieie ettt ettt s st st ss s st be et b esss s bbb s e s b e bbb e b s s aebessesesesesanes 8
ACCOUNTIOVEIVIEW, tsrsisvssessisiss oot s st siussimissiomshssaisi¥sistsobnssnataesressessnssssassrasersssssassseseosssssasesss assss eoaseasasss osesessssseteassssssossssssetonsssstssaesesersessassesss 8
PEITOIMANCE HISTOTY ..c.voveveiiiieeiiiiiiieisiste st sa bbb e b se e sbebe e be e s bbb b b e s st sb st st s bebe st s b b ebabobo bbbt sbeRebeReRe R et Rs R ettt sbebeb et sasstaeatsbsbensbtats 9
BONA ANGIYSIS! itistmmmsmeimmismiisisssisnsmissiionssasssnassmsssssnssreessassesssssnsssssasassssossesensaesss sonsesssssos s41stssstesessssasssas sosissssonssssosasensssonsasnensasas esessessasasaomens ostansrons 10
HOUAINES 5smussiuinsocsnisnas sttt siseiistsnsionsssasssasonseonsnsnensassansasasnsassassessassssessssssesess sosssasses sotesestssstsossssassssnssossansastasessronasasess snsnsnsssssnsassessonsssnsssaebonsasssssensesbe 11
TRANSACHIONS 1uvvitititiiienicit bbb st bbb bR e e RS e R bR et h et etk kbbb bbbt e bbb e et e Re bt s 13

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - BUIIAING CAPILAl ......covvvverereiiiiriiiiiesetesiiseeesess e seseseesese e sess s esssesesesesessesesebesssesesesessssasssesesesssssssssssesssessssasnns 14
ACCOUNT OVEIVIEBW ...viiiiiiiiiiiiiiiii ittt b et s b e b bbb 8 b ek s 4k e s b e e e e b e b e 4 e R e b e b e b e b e e b e ke s e e e e b e e b e b e e b et e seebe e ebesensebasesbensebarens 14
PEITOIMEANCE HISTOTY .viuiieiiiiisisii ettt et et et b s e s b b e b e bebebe e s e b ebe b e b e RebeRsehebebebese R s e Rsas eh b et ebebebabessa b et ebebebebebabensbebebens 15
HOIAINGS 1.veviviiciiiiiist st et e st b e st b s e sk b s e b e Re b e e Re s b eRe e bebe R s e b esseR e e ebe b ebebeshebesbebassebebesbebebessebeasehensbesserebeaessensanensebatees 16
L2 - Lt [ £ o 17

FiXed INCOME IMATKET UPTALE ..cuciiiiiiiiiiiiiisiistsi ettt st b e s e a e e e b e e e be b s ebebeseebesaebeRe e be e s ebe R s bebe b e b eRs s eas b e b ebebenesnebesbensebeban 18

There may be a slight difference in the ending value between this report and the Schwab statement due to accrued income, timing of transactions,
and/or rounding. The Schwab statement continues to be the official custodial record for the account.

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 2 of 18 As of January 31, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Account Overview

Portfolio Allocation

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Operations Fund

4 Current Current
Subsector Value Percent
B U.S. Treasury $2,528,839 45.1%

[ cash Equivalent $3,080,771 54.9%

Total $5,609,610 100.0%

Cash Flow Review
Inception to Date
Month to Date Quarter to Date Year to Date (11/8/2023)
Beginning Market Value $6,095,018 $6,095,018 $6,095,018 ]
Contributions / Additions S0 S0 S0 $28,214,268
Distributions ($500,000) ($500,000) ($500,000) ($23,350,000)
Capital Appreciation $4,497 $4,497 $4,497 $271,003
Income/Expenses $6,241 $6,241 $6,241 $491,655
Change in Accrued $3,853 $3,853 $3,853 (617,318)
Ending Market Value $5,609,610 $5,609,610 $5,609,610 $5,609,610
Investment Gain $14,592 $14,592 $14,592 $745,341

Projected Income
Description Q2 2026 Q3 2026 Q4 2026 Q12027 Total
U.S. Treasury $18,581 $18,581
Cash Equivalent $27,259 $27,259 $27,259 $27,259 $109,034
Total $45,840 $27,259 $27,259 $27,259 $127,615

Projected Income and Maturities

Description Q2 2026 Q3 2026 Q4 2026 Q1 2027 Total
U.S. Treasury $1,009,581 $1,009,581
Cash Equivalent $27,259 $27,259 $27,259 $27,259 $109,034

$1,036,840

$27,259

$27,259

$1,118,615

Information in this report was compiled using data from the custodian available as of the publishing date. While we believe the data to be reliable, we
do not independently verify pricing and valuation data. Please refer to the official statements provided by the account custodian. All date period
references are on a calendar year basis. Fiscal year reports are available by request. Past performance does not guarantee future investment results.

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District As of January 31, 2026

SFAM Page 3 of 18



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Performance History

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Operations Fund

Start Value Inflows Outflows End Value Investment Ghalx?:
Since Inception
First Quarter 2026 $6,095,018 S0 ($500,000) $5,609,610 $14,592
Fourth Quarter 2025 $7,322,003 $205,769 ($1,500,000) $6,095,018 $67,246
Third Quarter 2025 $6,926,701 $3,886,524 ($3,550,000) $7,322,003 $58,777
Second Quarter 2025 $5,188,740 $4,599,728 ($2,900,000) $6,926,701 $38,233
First Quarter 2025 $6,827,602 S0 ($1,700,000) $5,188,740 $61,138
Fourth Quarter 2024 $10,553,539 $228,918 (54,050,000) $6,827,602 $95,145
Third Quarter 2024 $9,571,792 $3,704,838 ($2,850,000) $10,553,539 $126,909
Second Quarter 2024 $8,735,342 $4,288,491 ($3,550,000) $9,571,792 $97,959
First Quarter 2024 $10,477,709 S0 ($1,850,000) $8,735,342 $107,633
Fourth Quarter 2023 S0 $11,300,000 ($900,000) $10,477,709 $77,709
Since Inception Total $0 $28,214,268 ($23,350,000) $5,609,610 $745,341

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 4 of 18 As of January 31, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Bond Analysis

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Operations Fund

150.0%
100.0%
50.0%
0.0%
2026
B rercent of Fixed Income
Maturity by Year
Yield to Yield to
Current Maturity Maturity Modified
Weight Description Principal Value Yield (Cost) (Market) Duration
100.0% U.S. Treasury $2,519,000 $2,528,839 1.8% 4.0% 3.7% 0.1

100.0% Total $2,519,000 $2,528,839

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 5 of 18 As of January 31, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Holdings

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Operations Fund

Yield
Maturity Current to Maturity Annual
Weight Description Symbol Date Quantity Value Yield (Market) Income
Fixed Income
Taxable Bonds
U.S. Treasury
18.2% US Treasury Bill 912797PV3  3/19/2026 1,025,000.00 $1,020,350 0.0% 3.5% SO
03/19/2026
9.0% US Treasury Note 912828P46 2/15/2026 503,000.00 $502,430 1.6% 4.4% $8,174
02/15/2026 | 1.625%
Accrued Income $3,776
17.9% US Treasury Note 91282CGV7  4/15/2026 991,000.00 $991,155 3.7% 3.6% $37,163
04/15/2026 | 3.750%
Accrued Income $11,128
45.1% Fixed Income Total $2,528,839 1.8% 3.7% $45,336
Cash Equivalent
Cash Equivalent
Cash Equivalent
0.2% Schwab Government SWGXX $10,101 3.3% $332
Money Fund
54.7% Schwab Treasury Money SCOXX $3,070,670 3.5% $108,702
Market Fund
54.9% Cash Equivalent Total $3,080,771 3.5% $109,034

100.0% Total g $5,609,610 3.7% $154,370

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 6 of 18 As of January 31, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Transactions

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Operations Fund
From December 31, 2025 to January 31, 2026

Accrued
Trade Date Activity Description Quantity Amount Interest
1/30/2026 Income (Reinvested Schwab Treasury Money 900.66 $901
Dividend) Market Fund
1/30/2026 Income (Reinvested Schwab Treasury Money 8,385.93 $8,386
Dividend) Market Fund
1/30/2026 Withdrawal Schwab Government $500,000
Money Fund
1/22/2026 Sell US Treasury Bill 510,000.00 $510,000
(912797PD3)
01/22/2026
1/15/2026 Income (Reinvested Schwab Government 1.14 S1
Dividend) Money Fund
1/6/2026 Expense Schwab Government $3,047

(Management Fee) Money Fund

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 7 of 18 As of January 31, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Account Overview

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Capital Fund
Portfolio Allocation

Cash Flow Review

Current Current

Subsector Value Percent

I U.S. Treasury $4,533,744 89.9%
|77 Certificate of Deposit $246,072 4.9%
Cash Equivalent $263,089 5.2%
Total $5,042,904 100.0%

Inception to Date

Month to Date Quarter to Date Year to Date (4/15/2024)
Beginning Market Value $5,033,008 $5,033,008 $5,033,008 S0
Contributions / Additions S0 S0 S0 $4,750,000
Distributions S0 S0 S0 S0
Capital Appreciation ($3,894) ($3,894) ($3,894) $83,014
Income/Expenses $24,998 $24,998 $24,998 $212,383
Change in Accrued ($11,207) ($11,207) ($11,207) (62,493)
Ending Market Value $5,042,904 $5,042,904 $5,042,904 $5,042,904
Investment Gain $9,896 $9,896 $9,896 $292,904
Projected Income
Description Q2 2026 Q3 2026 Q4 2026 Q12027 Total
U.S. Treasury $37,088 $49,762 $28,616 $40,387 $155,852
Certificate of Deposit $3,114 $1,199 $3,131 $1,219 $8,664
Cash Equivalent $2,164 $2,164 $2,164 $2,164 $8,656
Total $42,366  $53,125 $33,911 $43,770 © $173,171
Projected Income and Maturities
Description Q2 2026 Q3 2026 Q4 2026 Q1 2027 Total
U.S. Treasury $497,088 $549,762 $583,616 $540,387 $2,170,852
Certificate of Deposit $3,114 $1,199 $3,131 $1,219 $8,664
Cash Equivalent $2,164 $2,164 $2,164 $2,164 $8,656
Totéli $502,366 $553,125 $588,911 $543,770 $2,188,171

Information in this report was compiled using data from the custodian available as of the publishing date. While we believe the data to be reliable, we
do not independently verify pricing and valuation data. Please refer to the official statements provided by the account custodian. All date period
references are on a calendar year basis. Fiscal year reports are available by request. Past performance does not guarantee future investment results.

As of January 31, 2026

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 8 of 18



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Performance History

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Capital Fund

Start Value Inflows Outflows End Value Investment G':?r:
Since Inception
First Quarter 2026 $5,033,008 S0 $0 $5,042,904 $9,896
Fourth Quarter 2025 $4,982,525 S0 S0 $5,033,008 $50,483
Third Quarter 2025 $4,383,585 $550,000 S0 $4,982,525 $48,939
Second Quarter 2025 $4,337,408 S0 S0 $4,383,585 $46,177
First Quarter 2025 $3,927,908 $350,000 S0 $4,337,408 $59,499
Fourth Quarter 2024 $2,243,224 $1,650,000 S0 $3,927,908 $34,685
Third Quarter 2024 $2,213,369 S0 S0 $2,243,224 $29,855
Second Quarter 2024 S0 $2,200,000 S0 $2,213,369 $13,369
Since Inception Total S0 $4,750,000 $0 $5,042,904 $292,904

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 9 of 18 As of January 31, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Bond Analysis

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Capital Fund

60.0%
40.0%
20.0%
0.0%
2026 2027 2028
B Prercent of Fixed Income
Maturity by Year
Yield to Yield to
Current Maturity Maturity Modified
Weight Description Principal Value Yield (Cost) (Market) Duration
94.9% U.S. Treasury $4,471,000 $4,533,744 3.9% 4.1% 3.6% 1.2
5.1% Certificate of Deposit $245,000 $246,072 3.5% 3.9% 3.6% 1.9

100.0% Total

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 10 of 18 As of January 31, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Holdings

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Capital Fund

 VYield
Maturity Current to Maturity Annual
Weight Description Symbol Date Quantity Value Yield (Market) Income
Fixed Income
Taxable Bonds
U.S. Treasury
10.1% US Treasury Note 91282CLQ2 10/15/2027 500,000.00 $502,774 3.9% 3.5% $19,375
10/15/2027 | 3.875%
Accrued Income $5,802
10.1% US Treasury Note 91282CLH2 8/31/2026 500,000.00 $500,332 3.7% 3.6% $18,750
08/31/2026 | 3.750%
Accrued Income $7,977
5.5% US Treasury Note 91282CMF5 1/15/2028 275,000.00 $278,620 4.2% 3.5% $11,688
01/15/2028 | 4.250%
Accrued Income $549
10.0% US Treasury Note 91282CJT9 1/15/2027 500,000.00 $502,032 4.0% 3.6% $20,000
01/15/2027 | 4.000%
Accrued Income $939
6.8% US Treasury Note 91282CMS7  3/15/2028 335,000.00 $337,238 3.8% 3.5% $12,981
03/15/2028 | 3.875%
Accrued Income $4,985
6.5% US Treasury Note 91282CKJ9 4/15/2027 320,000.00 $323,550 4.5% 3.5% $14,400
04/15/2027 | 4.500%
Accrued Income $4,312
9.8% US Treasury Note 91282CFB2 7/31/2027 500,000.00 $494,356 2.8% 3.5% $13,750
07/31/2027 | 2.750%
Accrued Income $38
4.5% US Treasury Note 91282CJP7 12/15/2026 225,000.00 $226,503 4.3% 3.6% $9,844
12/15/2026 | 4.375%
Accrued Income $1,298
4.3% US Treasury Note 91282CGV7  4/15/2026 215,000.00 $215,034 3.7% 3.6% $8,063
04/15/2026 | 3.750%
Accrued Income $2,414
6.6% US Treasury Note 91282CLS8 10/31/2026 330,000.00 $331,121 4.1% 3.7% $13,613
10/31/2026 | 4.125%
Accrued Income $3,497
4.9% US Treasury Note 91282CHBO  5/15/2026 245,000.00 $244,943 3.6% 3.7% $8,881
05/15/2026 | 3.625%
Accrued Income $1,914
10.8% US Treasury Note 91282CMN8 2/15/2028 526,000.00 $533,191 4.2% 3.5% $22,355
02/15/2028 | 4.250%
Accrued Income $10,327
Certificate of Deposit
3.3% Beal Bank 07371DNA1  12/22/2027 165,000.00 $165,376 3.7% 3.6% $6,188
12/22/2027 | 3.750%
Accrued Income $594
1.6% Capital One Bank 254673MP8  2/22/2028 80,000.00 $79,023 3.0% 3.6% $2,400
02/22/2028 | 3.000%
Accrued Income $1,079
94.8% Fixed Income Total $4,779,815 3.9% 3.6% $182,286

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 11 of 18 As of January 31, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Holdings

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Capital Fund

Yield
Maturity Current to Maturity Annual
Weight Description Symbol Date Quantity Value Yield (Market) Income
Cash Equivalent
Cash Equivalent
Cash Equivalent
5.2% Schwab Government SWGXX $263,089 3.3% $8,656

Money Fund

100.0% Total $5,042,904 3.8% 3.6%

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 12 of 18 As of January 31, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Transactions

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Capital Fund
From December 31, 2025 to January 31, 2026

Accrued

Trade Date Activity Description Quantity Amount Interest
1/31/2026 Income (Interest) US Treasury Note $6,875

(91282CFB2)

07/31/2027 2.750%
1/31/2026 Income (Interest) US Treasury Note $4,781

(91282CIv4)

01/31/2026 4.250%
1/31/2026 Sell US Treasury Note 225,000.00 $225,000

(91282CJv4)

01/31/2026 4.250%
1/15/2026 Income (Interest) US Treasury Note $10,000

(91282CJT9)

01/15/2027 4.000%
1/15/2026 Income (Interest) US Treasury Note $5,844

(91282CMF5)

01/15/2028 4.250%
1/15/2026 Income (Reinvested Schwab Government 14.70 $15

Dividend) Money Fund

1/6/2026 Expense Schwab Government $2,517

(Management Fee) Money Fund

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 13 of 18 As of January 31, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO
ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Account Overview

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Building Capital

Portfolio Allocation

Subsector

Current Current
Value Percent

[ ICash Equivalent

$1,027,946 100.0%

Total $1,027,946 100.0%
Cash Flow Review
Inception to Date
Month to Date Quarter to Date Year to Date (5/8/2025)
Beginning Market Value $1,025,350 $1,025,350 $1,025,350 S0
Contributions / Additions S0 SO S0 $1,000,000
Distributions S0 S0 S0 S0
Capital Appreciation SO S0 S0 S0
Income/Expenses $2,596 $2,596 $2,596 $27,946
Ending Market Value $1,027,946 $1,027,946 $1,027,946 $1,027,946
Investment Gain $2,596 $2,596 $2,596 $27,946
Projected Income
Description Q2 2026 Q3 2026 Q4 2026 Q12027 Total
Cash Equivalent $9,097 $9,097 $9,097 $9,097 $36,389

Total e 49,097 $9,097 49,097 $9,097 436,389

Projected Income and Maturities

Description Q2 2026 Q3 2026 Q4 2026 Q12027 Total
Cash Equivalent $9,097 $9,097 $9,097 $9,097 $36,389
Total $9,097 $9,097 $9,097 $9,097 $36,389

Information in this report was compiled using data from the custodian available as of the publishing date. While we believe the data to be reliable, we
do not independently verify pricing and valuation data. Please refer to the official statements provided by the account custodian. All date period
references are on a calendar year basis. Fiscal year reports are available by request. Past performance does not guarantee future investment results.

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 14 of 18 As of January 31, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Performance History

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Building Capital

Start Value Inflows Outflows End Value Investment G'\a“iar:
Since Inception
First Quarter 2026 $1,025,350 S0 S0 $1,027,946 $2,596
Fourth Quarter 2025 $1,015,936 SO S0 $1,025,350 $9,414
Third Quarter 2025 $1,005,713 S0 S0 $1,015,936 $10,223
Second Quarter 2025 S0 $1,000,000 S0 $1,005,713 $5,713
Since Inception Total S0 $1,000,000 S0 $1,027,946 $27,946

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 15 of 18 As of January 31, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Holdings

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Building Capital

Yield
Maturity Current to Maturity Annual
Weight Description Symbol Date Quantity Value Yield  (Market) Income
Cash Equivalent
Cash Equivalent

Cash Equivalent

0.0% Schwab Government SWGXX $195 3.3% $6
Money Fund

100.0% Schwab Treasury Money SCOXX $1,027,750 3.5% $36,382
Market Fund

100.0% Cash Equivalent Total $1,027,946 3.5% $36,389

100.0% Total $1,027,946 3.5% $36,389

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 16 of 18 As of January 31, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Transactions

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Building Capital
From December 31, 2025 to January 31, 2026

Accrued
Trade Date Activity Description Quantity Amount Interest
1/30/2026 Income (Reinvested Schwab Treasury Money 2,806.83 $2,807
Dividend) Market Fund
1/30/2026 Income (Reinvested Schwab Treasury Money 301.45 $301
Dividend) Market Fund
1/15/2026 Income (Reinvested Schwab Government 0.31 S0
Dividend) Money Fund
1/6/2026 Expense Schwab Government $513

(Management Fee) Money Fund

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 17 of 18 As of January 31, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Fixed Income Market Update — January 31, 2026

Key Takeaways:
*  Yields moved slightly higher in January with the exception of the 1-year which moved slightly lower

. Fed officials held their first meeting of 2026 and elected to keep their benchmark rate unchanged a

*  The latest inflation data came in 2.7% - unchanged from the previous month and in line with expectations
° Labor market conditions remain stable with unemployment dropping slightly to 4.4% (previously 4.5%)

t3.75%

U.S. Treasury Yield Curve
4.00%

3.25%
1 Month 3 Month 6 Month 1Year 2 Year 3 Year

e 12/31/2025 s 1/31/2026

3.75% _/
3.50% xﬁ e

5Year

Government u.s. High Quality

Yields as of Money Market U.S. Treasury = Certificate of R Taxable High Quality
1/31/2 Bill / N D) it C t
/31/2026 Fid ill / Notes eposi Kichcy Municipal orporate
Liquid 3.29% - - - - -
3 Month - 3.65% 3.65% 3.62% 3.67% 3.68%
6 Month - 3.62% 3.70% 3.60% 3.71% 3.70%
9 Month - 3.61% 3.70% 3.56% 3.72% 3.71%
1 Year - 3.46% 3.75% 3.44% 3.55% 3.56%
3 Year - 3.59% 3.80% 3.61% 3.84% 3.81%
5 Year - 3.79% 3.80% 3.83% 4.03% -
Economic Data Federal Open Market Committee
Median Fed Funds Rate Forecast
Indicator Current Previous S
3.375%
2 7(y 2 7(y 3.125% 3.125%
- Inflati «1.70 w0 3.0%
SR lighion (Dec2025) | (Nov2025) 2.500%
4.4% 4.5%
U I t 2.0%
nemploymen (Dec 2025) (Nov 2025) |
3.75% 3.75% '
ds Rat 1.0%
Fed Funds Rate (Jan 2026) (Dec 2025)
4.49 3.89 N
Real GDP Growth A /o 0.0%
Long Term

(3rd Qtr 2025) | (2nd Qtr 2025) Current 2026 2027 2028

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 18 of 18 As of January 31, 2026



Bristol Kendall Fire Department

Fire Prevention Bureau

103 East Beaver Street
Yorkville, IL 60560-1704.
Tel: 630 553-6186
Fax: 630 553-1482
R TR A R AR N AN R R R R B A A A 2 2 R 2 B R R AR b s e g R A R R N N BN W W R BT £ g&m

FIRE MARSHAL REPORT

02-12-2026
Inspections Life Safety (83)

Violations Found (49)

Re-Inspections (54)

Violations Corrected (81)

C.O. Inspections (D

Alarm Investigation  (5)

Outside Agency Inspections (State (1) (Private (4)
Fire Alarm Plan Review (1)

Ansul Puff Test (0)

Ansul System Plan Review (0)

Site Inspection (12) Grande Reserve townhomes, Grande reserve north
Fire Alarm Test (6)

Sprinkler Test (6)

Sprinkler Plan Review (6)

Hydrostatic Test (8)

Wet Kitchen System Plan Review (0)

Flush Test (0)

System Flow Test (0)

Above Ceiling Inspection (6)

Emergency Form Updates (4)

Knox Box Keys (2)



Tank Review (0)

Pre-Action system Test (0)
Knox Box Installations (0)
Knox Box Removal (0)

Food Truck Vendor Inspections (0)
Carnival Ride Inspections (0)
Fire Damper Inspection (6)
Fire Caulk Inspection (6)
Out of Business (0)

New Business (1)
Disconnect Inspection (2)
School Fire Drill (0)

School Inspections (0)
Special Meetings (2)
Occupancy Load (0)

Run Hide Fight Drill (0)

State Smoke Detector Program (Smoke detectors installed January- dec. 12

Total Contacts (Adults 7 ) (Children 20)

Fire Investigations (1)

Classes Attended (1)

Public Education

02-12-26



Bristol Kendall Fire

Protection District

103 East Beaver Street
Yorkville, IL 60560-1704
Phone: 630 553-6186
Fax: 630 553-1482

February 2026
Trustee Meeting
Training Report
Training:
Training Hours for January 2 2026, 2,976
e 2,490 Training Hours for December, 2025

e 3,543 Training Hours for November, 2025
e 3,937 Training Hours for October, 2025

Total hours for the month of Janaury 2,976

Total




Notes:

« We began the process of completing our annual compliance training. Our goal is to
have all required training completed by the end of March.
« We completed shift meetings with all three shifts.

o We conducted a recap of 2025.

o We discussed future plans and initiatives for 2026.We spent dedicated time
with Officers focusing on officer development.

o Officers worked with their crews to develop and present a Target Hazard
presentation specific to their Still District. These presentations were delivered to
their respective shifts by the end of January.

o Officers also worked with their crews to develop and present a NIOSH
presentation, which was presented to their shifts by the end of January.

o We continue to explore creative and effective ways to further develop our
personnel.

« Jen Lynd completed CPR recertifications for personnel.

« Annual SCBA fit testing was completed.

« Life Star provided education and training on Field Labor & Delivery and Pediatric
Emergencies.

« Crews also had the opportunity to conduct advanced airway training in house.

« Crews conducted Ice Rescue and Cold-Water Emergency training at Harris Forest
Preserve.

o [ attended a workshop in Minooka on a program called U SIM, which is designed to
build simulated emergency scenarios. This program will support officer development

and can be utilized for future training and operational processes.
« | represented the Fire District at Fox Republic in support of Special Olympics fundraising
efforts, raising over $1,500 in one hour through a combination of cash and online

donations. The event raised more than $11,000 total.



Bristol-Kendall Fire Protection District
103 East Beaver Street
Yorkville, IL 60560-1704
Phone: 630-553-6186
Fax: 630-553-1482

February 2026
Trustee Meeting
Operations Report

Calls by Month:

CALLS PER MONTH FOR 2026

January -

Calls for Service by Year:

2023 2024 2025




Calls per Stations:

Calls per Station in December

100

60
40
20

0

Sta'éion 1

[ Station 2 e
{ M Station 3 T

Calls by Responding Unit:

Sum of Calls

Calls by Shift:

Black =95
Red =120
Gold=113



Calls by Major Incident Types

Fire: 2 (0.6%)

Hazardous Situation: 16 (4.9%6)

Public Service: 75 (22.9%)

No Emergency: 19 (5.8%) ——

\ Medical: 216 (65.9%)

Staffing:
e Fulltime District
o 35 Personnel
e Part Time
o 21 Personnel
e Civilian Medics
o 2 Personnel

Fire Division:
e Mutual Aid to Little Rock Fox — 96 Blackhawk Springs Dr — Structure Fire —
Battalion 1 and Engine 123 to the scene
e Vehicle into a Structure — 142 Bertram Dr
e Mutual Aid to Oswego — 6807 Reservation Rd — Structure Fire — Battalion 1 and
Water Tender 161 to the scene



Grant Funding:
e Applied for the Firehouse Subs Grant for an EMS training manikin
e Waiting to hear about the OSFM Small Equipment Grant

e Met with the grant writer to start the process to apply for the SAFER Grant
(Fund future manpower)

Fleet Maintenance:
e New motor is in E124 and the cab is back on
e Finalized the specs for the two new engines to get a print

i —

Q ¥}

Stations:
e New HVAC unit has been installed for the training room at Station 1
o The roof installation has been completed at Station 1



Bristol Kendall Fire

Protection District
103 East Beaver Street
Yorkville, IL 60560-1704
Phone: 630 553-6186
Fax: 630 553-1482

February 2026
Trustee Meeting
Fire Chief Report

Bills out of Norm:
e Fire Fund
o Aurora Truck Center- $6,767 for King Pins, Tie Rods, and Brake
Calipers on engine 121
e EMS Fund
e Operations Fund
o SimsUShare- $2875 for training software
e Capital Fund
o Artlip and Sons- $16,285 for training room roof top HVAC unit
o Data Center Warehouse- $19,550 for station internet project
o Homecare Heating & Cooling- $18,756 for new HVAC units at station 2
and 3
o Precision Mobile Werks- $7,270 for installation of lights on new pickup
o Weisbrook Sheet Metal- $24,098 for station 1 roof (Complete)
e Insurance Fund
o Assured Partners- $65,264 for annual insurance on vehicles, buildings,
and added employee insurance

Staffing:
e Hours for January:
o Hours Worked- 13586.25 Hours
= QOvertime Hours- 218.25 Hours
7G Building Maintenance- 47.25 Hours
7G Inspections- 21.5 Hours
7G Investigations- 7 Hours
7G EMS- 2.5 Hours
7G IT- 0 Hours
7G Fleet Maintenance- 3.5 Hours
7G Public Education- 78.5 Hours



» 7G Special Duties- 8 Hours
» 7G Training- 33 Hours
» Rider- 149
o Total Hours off- 1685 Hours
» Kelly & BKFPD Days- 456 Hours
» Sick Days- 341.5 Hours
» Vacation Days- 317 Hours
=  Comp Time Days- 96 Hours
» Bereavement Day- 10 Hours
»  Work Comp- 72 Hours

Hours Worked

13586

0

Hours Worked

Overtime Hours Worked

218

Qvertime Hours




Sum of January

Time Off

510,0)
400
300
pA0,0)

100

Kelly & BKFPD

O =
Sick

Finances:
e FNBO Checking- 0.95%
o Market Value- $341,500
o Interest- $488.21
o Year to Date Interest- $488.21
e FNBO Money Market- 1.26%
o Market Value- $375,899
o Interest- $339.14
o Year to Date Interest- $339.14
e Schwab Operation Account
o Market Value- $5,594,705
o Schwab Money Market is 3.63% (1-6-2026)
o Year to date net gain is $14,592
e Schwab Vehicle Capital Account
o Market Value- $4,985,522
o Year to date net gain is $9,896
e Schwab Building Capital Account
o Market Value- $1,027,945
o Year to date net gain is $2,596
e Fire Billing
o $7,870 in Charges
o $0 received
o Little Rock Fox Fleet Maintenance Revenue-
o Labor- $25,500
o Consulting- $320
o Parts- $10,470.05
e Waubonsee Community College
o Fall Semester Charge- $13,650
o Payroll Costs- $1,697.34

Vacation




Commissioner Notes:

Notes:

Next regular meeting scheduled for February 17
We are meeting on February 11 with the FF testing company we used last
time to get info to bring to the commissioners

Staffing

o The third medic student from last year's class has received their
Paramedic license.

o Two full time members have resigned. One took a full-time position
with Downers Grove where his dad currently works. The other one
had a full-time opportunity come up in a different career field. This
brings us to 34 full time members.

Stations
o Station 1
» The roof top unit for the station 1 training room has been
replaced.

* The roof project is complete and came in at $248,108.
o Station 2
o Station 3

IT has all the equipment for station internet project.
We have received this years IPRF grant for $23,799.
Safer Grant
o We will be meeting again on February 13th.
o There is some mixed information we are receiving on the amount of
funding given.
o We also learned there are several stipulations on how the grant is
awarded.
Budget
o Projections for staffing costs for FY27 have been completed
o We should be hearing back on insurance rates in February or March
o Budget requests have been received from everyone and plugged into
the workbook
o We are working on the first round of cuts now
FJM Architects
o We met with the architect to get some info on future buildings and
renovations
o Station 2 Renovation
» Creating space for a Battalion Chief
» 3 months to complete
» Wil look to do the project in winter as costs can be cheaper due
to less work around
= Estimating $250,000
o Maintenance Facility
* Free standing building with room for us to grow and also room
to add on down the road
* Would be a drive-through layout with some office space
* 18-20 month build time to include documentation and site prep

4



» Cost would be around $7 million
o Station 4
* Similar to station 3 with an Admin wing on opposite side of the
living quarters
» 20 month build time to include documentation
» $12 million dollar cost today with a 5% increase each year
* He also brought option of building a free-standing Admin
building and putting it on the Maintenance Facility
* All options depend on property size and layout
o Station 5
* Verified a parcel had enough property to build a smaller station
in case an opportunity arises



Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District

Kendall County
State of lllinois

Ordinance Number 2026-01

AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING FIRE PREVENTION CODES FOR
THE BRISTOL KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

WHEREAS, the Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District (“District”) is a fire protection district
duly organized under the laws of the State of lllinois; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Trustees of the District has express power pursuant to 70 ILCS
705/11, to adopt and enforce fire prevention codes and standards parallel to national standards
to promote fire prevention; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Trustees of the District also has full power pursuant to 70 ILCS
705/6, to pass all necessary ordinances, and rules and regulations for the proper management
and conduct of the business of the Board of Trustees of the District for carrying into effect the
objects for which the district was formed; and

WHEREAS, the Fire Protection District Act, 70 ILCS 705/11, (the “Act”) empowers and
makes it the legal duty and obligation of this Board of Trustees to provide as nearly adequate
protection from fire for all persons and property within the district as possible and to prescribe
necessary regulations for the prevention and control of fire therein; and

WHEREAS, the District is empowered by the Act to provide reasonable safeguards
through Fire Prevention Codes to protect the Public Health and Safety against the hazards of fire
in buildings and structures; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to its statutory authority, the Board previously determined it to be in
the best interest of the district to adopt a fire prevention code for the control of fire protection in
buildings and structures as herein provided; and each and all of the regulations, provisions,
penalties, conditions, and terms are provided in Bristol Kendall FPD Ordinance No. 2026-01.

WHEREAS, the 2018 Edition of the ICC (International Code Council) International Fire
Code is a comprehensive compilation of codes designed to meet the needs of the local fire
jurisdictions through model code regulations that prescribe safeguards for the safety and public
health of all communities; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Trustees of the District deem it in the best interest of the district
to amend and adopt a new Fire Prevention Code using the 2018 Edition of the International Fire



Code as the District's model for the control of fire protection in buildings and structures as herein
provided; and

WHEREAS, a copy of the 2018 International Fire Code has been on file with the district
for at least (15) days and has, during that time, been available for public use, inspection and
examination.
The Board of Trustees of the Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District does ordain as follows:

SECTION 1 — RECITALS

The facts and statements contained in the preamble to this Ordinance are hereby found by the
Board of Trustees to be true and correct and are hereby adopted as part of this Ordinance.

SECTION 2 - REPEALING PRESENT FIRE CODE
The Fire Prevention Code of the Bristol-Kendall Fire Protection District (hereinafter referred to as
the “Fire Prevention Code”) is hereby amended to delete and repeal the present language in its

entirety.

SECTION 3 — ADOPTION OF NATIONALLY RECOGNIZED CODES

Pursuant to the authority granted in the Fire Protection District Act 70 ILCS 705/6 to pass all
necessary ordinances for the management of the Fire District, The Board of Trustees of the Bristol
Kendall Fire Protection District in accordance to 70 ILCS 705/11 fulfills their legal duty and
prescribes necessary regulations and codes for the prevention and control of fire parallel to

national standards, those codes known as the

INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE - 2018, including APPENDICES B, C, D, E,F,G,H,l, KN as
recommended by the INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL (“ICC”).

Each and all of the regulations, provision, penalties, conditions, and terms of the aforesaid
documents are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this
Ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions, and changes, if any, prescribed in Exhibit

One of this Ordinance.

Three copies of the aforesaid codes have been available for inspection for at least 15 days prior
to the adoption hereof and are now on file in the office of the Secretary of the Board of Trustees
of the Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District, and have been there kept available for public use,
inspection, and examination, and the same hereby adopted and incorporated as fully as if set out

2



at length herein, and from the date in which this ordinance shall take effect, the provisions thereof
shall be controlling within the corporate limits of the Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District, Kendall

County, lllinois

SECTION 5 — COMPLIANCE WITH ORDINANCE REQUIRED
That it shall be unlawful to design, construct, alter, enlarge, repair, demolish, remove, use, or
maintain any building or structure within the boundaries of the Bristol Kendall Fire Protection

District in violation of any terms or provisions of this Ordinance.

SECTION 6 — REPEALING ORDINANCE ADOPTING PREVIOUS CODE
All prior fire code ordinances of the Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District are repealed to the
extent they conflict with this Ordinance. “All prior fire code ordinances of the Bristol Kendall Fire

Protection District are repealed to the extent they conflict with this Ordinance.”

SECTION 7 - FINES
All persons in violation of the Fire Prevention Code shall be subjected to fines as set forth and

established in the Codes, and all otherwise applicable District Ordinances.

SECTION 8 — PENALTIES
The International Fire Code 2018 edition as adopted includes the following penalty provision, as
amended in the current Exhibit One:

“110.4 Violation penalties. Any person who violates any provision of this Ordinance,
or who fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof, shall be guilty of a
misdemeanor, punishable by a fine not less than $100.00, nor more than

$500.00 in the case of a first offense. For continued violations fines shall be
$1,000.00. Each day that a violation continues shall be a separate offense.”

SECTION 9 — FUTURE REVISIONS
Future versions of the District’s Fire Prevention Code shall be revised by Board approval of
additional exhibits hereto that amend the current Exhibit One. All such revisions shall be dated

and shall be effective upon approval by the Board of Trustees.



SECTION 10 — SEVERABILITY
The Board of Trustees of the District hereby declares that should any section, paragraph,

sentence, or word of this Ordinance or of the Code hereby adopted be declared for any reason to
be invalid, it is the intent of said Board of Trustees that it would have passed all other portions of

this Ordinance independent of the elimination of such portion as may be declared invalid.

SECTION 11 — VALIDITY OF PRIOR ORDINANCES
Neither the enactment of this Ordinance nor the repeal of any ordinance or parts of ordinances
as provided for herein shall be construed to affect or abate any action or cause of action for

violation of said prior ordinance or ordinances.

SECTION 12 — EFFECTIVE DATE
That this Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage, approval, and

publication in accordance with the law.

PASSED by the Board of Trustees of the Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District,

Kendall County lilinois this___12 day of _February , 2026, by roll call vote.

Ken Johnson Darin Peterson
Mark Hartford Marty Schwartz
Jeff Farren
Attest
President of the Board of Trustees Secretary, Board of Trustees
Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District



STATE OF ILLINOIS )

COUNTY OF KENDALL )

SECRETARY’S CERTIFICATE

I, Darin Peterson, the duly qualified and acting Secretary of the Board of Trustees of the
Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District, Kendall County, lllinois, do hereby certify that | am the keeper
of its books and records and that the attached hereto is a true and correct copy of an Ordinance

entitled:

ORDINANCE NO. 2026-01

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE FIRE PREVENTION CODE
FOR THE BRISTOL KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

which Ordinance was duly adopted by said Board of Trustees at a regular meeting held on the
12 day of February, 2026.
| do further certify that a quorum of said Board of Trustees was present at said meeting and

that the Board complied with all requirements of the lllinois Open Meetings Act.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, | have hereunto set my hand this _12_day of February, 2026.

Secretary, Board of Trustees
Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District



EXHIBIT ONE
AMENDMENTS TO THE 2018 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

1. Section 101.1 Title, shall be amended to insert name of jurisdiction Bristol Kendall Fire
Protection District

2. Section 105.4.1 Submittals, shall be amended as follows
Construction documents and supporting data shall be sealed with a "NICET IlI" or higher
certification and submitted for review and approval by the Fire Code Official. A minimum
of two sets of plans and specifications shall be included in the submittal along with a copy
of an approved electronic file.

3. Section 105.6 Required operational permits. Create section 105.6.51
Laboratory/Research facility, an operational permit is required to operate any laboratory
or research facility which conducts testing or experiments.

4. Section 105.6 Required operational permits. Create section 105.6.52
Child Care (home occupation), an operational permit is required to operate a child care
facility as a "home occupation" for 6 or more children that are cared for at any one time.
The operational permit shall not include provisions for permanent residence or overnight
accommodations. All local and state laws shall be adhered to in conjunction with the
registration and licensing requirements of the Department of Children and Family
Services (DCFS).

5. Section 106.2 Schedule of permit fees, shall be amended as follows:

a. Reviews by outside agency / consultant: To the extent that the district needs to
utilize the services of an outside agency/consultant, the applicant shall pay all fees
charged by the outside agency/consultant, and shall pay the district an additional
administrative fee equal to 15% of the outside agency/consultant fee.

b. Fire Detection and Alarm systems, Emergency Responder Communication
Enhancement System (ERCES) review fees: Any applicant for a building or
structure having (or required to have) a fire alarm system or ERCES shall pay to
the district the following fee, in addition to the other fees set forth herein, for
performing fire alarm system plan reviews and inspections.

¢ $350 up to 10,000 sq ft plus $10 for each additional 1,000 sq ft.
« Alterations to existing: less than 10% of devices $150.00
e Includes 1 re-review, each additional review will be 75% of original

plan review cost
* Includes 1 Inspection, each additional inspection will be

$150/inspection



c. Fire Sprinkler Systems(13,13D,13R) Review Fees: Any applicant for a building
or structure having (or required to have) a fire sprinkler system shall pay to the
district the following fees, in addition to the other fees set forth herein, for
performing fire sprinkler system plan reviews and inspections:

* $400.00 plus .75 per sprinkler head over 100 heads

« Alterations to existing: 1 to 20 sprinkler heads, $100

« Alterations to existing: 21 to 40 sprinkler heads $300

» Alterations to existing: over 40 Sprinkler heads $400 plus .75 per sprinkler

head over 100 heads
*  $50.00 shall be paid for witnessing of the underground flushing for the

sprinkler system
* Includes 1 re-review each additional review will be 75% of original

plan review cost
* Includes 2 inspections each additional inspection will be

$150/inspection

d. Fire Suppression other: stand pipe, fire pump, water tank review fee: Any
applicant for a building or structure having (or required to have) a standpipe, fire
pump, or water tank, shall pay to the district the following fees, in addition to the other
fees set forth herein, for performing plan review and inspections.

« $300.00
* |ncludes 1 re-review, each additional review will be $100.00
* Includes 1 inspection, each additional inspection will be
$150/inspection.

e. Hood Suppression, wet chemical system: Any applicant for a building or
structure having (or required to have) Hood Suppression, wet chemical system
shall pay to the district the following fees, in addition to the other fees set forth
herein, for performing fire pump plan review and inspections:

«  $350.00
* Includes 1 re-review, each additional review will be $100.00

* Includes 1 inspection, each additional inspection will be
$150/inspection.

f. Clean Agent/Dry Chemical systems review fee: Any applicant for a building or
structure having (or required to have) a Clean Agent/Dry Chemical system shall
pay to the district the following fees, in addition to the other fees set forth herein,
for performing alternate extinguishing system plan review and inspections:

*  $400 up to 10,000 cubic feet
e $0.10/cubic foot over 10,000
* Includes 1 re-review, each additional review will be 75% of
original plan review cost
* Includes 1 inspection, each additional inspection will be
$150/inspection.



g.

h.

Site Plan Review Fee: A site plan is defined as a document that describes how a
parcel of land is to be improved. It includes the outlines of all structures and site
improvements, such as driveways, parking lots, landscaping and utility
connections. Any applicant shall pay to the district the followings fees, in addition
to the other fees set forth herein, for performing site plan review.

+ A fee of $50.00 per hour with a minimum of 1 hour. Includes 1 re-review.

+ Afee of 50% of the site plan review fee shall be paid for each additional set

of revised site plan drawings

Operational Permits
e Fire Work $200.00
* Carnival/Amusement Rides $25.00/ride
* Mobile Food Trucks $25 annual permit
¢ Other $50.00 each

6. Section 108, Maintenance. Create section 108.7
False Alarm, an alarm signal given needlessly, which indicates the existence of any
emergency situation; when in fact, no such emergency exists, shall constitute a false alarm
and shall be subject to penalty as prescribed in the schedule of fees A false alarm shall
include any alarm signal generated by any fire protection system by whatever means, but
shall not include alarms resulting from any of the following causes:

a.

b.

A fire causing structural damage to the protected premises - verified by the fire
district.

A tornado or hurricane winds causing structural damage to the protected premises,
verified by the fire district.

Flooding to the protected premises due to overflow of natural drainage, verified by
the fire district.

Telephone line malfunction verified to the fire district by an authorized telephone
company supervisor within seven days of the occurrence.

Electrical service interruption verified to the fire district by the local power company
within seven days of the occurrence.

Plumbing or electrical malfunctions unrelated to the fire protection system, verified
by the fire district.

7. Section 108 Maintenance, create section 108.7.1
False Alarm Fee Schedule

a.

No fee shall be assessed for the first three (3) false alarms within the same
calendar year.

The third (3rd) false alarm within the same calendar year: a warning letter will be
issued.

The fourth (4th) false alarm within the same calendar year: a fee of $300.00 shall
be assessed.

The fifth (5th) false alarm within the same calendar year: a fee of $350.00 shall be
assessed.

The Sixth (6Th) false alarm within the same calendar year: a fee of $400.00 shall
be assessed.



10.

1.

12.

13.

14.

f. False alarm fee will double after the sixth false alarm in the same calendar year.
(Example: seventh (7th) false alarm in the same calendar year, a fee of $800.00

shall be assessed, eighth (8th) false alarm in the same calendar year, a fee of
$1,600.00 shall be assessed. Etc.).

g. Ifthe false alarm is given intentionally, an additional fee of $500.00 shall be added
assessed.

Section 109, Board of Appeals create section 109.1.1
The Board of appeals shall consist of the trustees of the district.

Section 110.4 Violations, shall be amended as follows:

Any person who violates any provision of this Ordinance, or who fails to comply with any
of the requirements thereof, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine not less
than $100.00, nor more than $500.00 in the case of a first offense. For continued violations
fines shall be $1,000.00. Each day that a violation continues shall be a separate offense.

Section 112.4 Failure to comply, shall be amended as follows:

Any person who shall continue to work after having been served with a stop work order,
except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than 100 dollars or more than 500 dollars.

Section 202 General Definitions, shall be amended to include the following definition: Fire
Alarm User the owner of the property, including but not limited to, any individual,
partnership, corporation, organization or other entity occupying the property with a fire
alarm, with permission of the owner.

Section 507 Fire Protection Water Supplies, create section 507.5.1.2

Hydrant for sprinkler systems, a fire hydrant shall not be more than 100 feet travel
distance from the fire department connection that it serves. Exception: The distance shall
be permitted to exceed 100 feet were approved by the fire code official.

Section 507 Fire Protection Water Supplies, create section 507.5.8

On all private parking areas of multiple-family residential, commercial and industrial uses,
a "No parking... Fire Hydrant" sign shall be placed in a conspicuous location to identify the
restricted parking area. In addition to the required sign, the curb or pavement (only when
a curb is not present) directly in front of the fire hydrant, shall be painted yellow with an
approved material. The designated area shall be 15 feet (7.5 feet on each side of the fire
hydrant) in total length.

Section 901.6.3 Records, create section 901.6.3.2

The most recent records of all system inspections, tests, and maintenance required shall
be maintained on premises and a copy shall be forward to the Fire Prevention Bureauvia
e-mail, mail, or fax within 14 days after completion of inspection.



15.

16.

17

18.

19.

20.

21.

22,

Section 903.2.1.1 Group A-1, Condition 1 shall be amended as follows: The fire area
exceeds 5,000 square feet (465m2).

Section 903.2.1.3 Group A-3, Condition 1 shall be amended as follows: The fire area
exceeds 5,000 square feet (465m2).

Section 903.2.1.4 Group A-4, Condition 1 shall be amended as follows:
The fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet (465m2).

Section 903.2.2 Ambulatory care facilities shall be amended as follows:
Section 903.2.2 Group B, an automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
Group B occupancies when the fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet.

Section 903.2.2 Group B, create section 903.2.2.1
Ambulatory care facilities, an automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout
the entire floor containing an ambulatory care facility where either of the following
conditions exist at any time:

a. Four or more care recipients are incapable of self-preservation.

b. One or more care recipients that are incapable of self-preservation are located at

other than the level of exit discharge serving such facility.

In buildings where ambulatory care is provided on levels other than the level of exit
discharge, an automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout the entire floor as
well as the floors below where such care is provided, and all floors between the level of
ambulatory care and the nearest level of exit discharge, the level of exit discharge, and all
floors below the level of exit discharge. Exception: Floors classified as an open parking
garage are not required to be sprinklered.

Section 903.2.3 Group E, 1 shall be amended as follows:
Throughout all group E fire areas greater than 5,000 square feet (465m2) in area.

Section 903.2.7 Group M, condition 1 shall be amended as follows: A group M fire areas
exceeds 10,000 square feet (929m2).

Section 903.2.8. Group R, shall be amended as follows:
An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3 shall be
provided throughout all buildings with a Group R fire area with the following exceptions:
a. Adult care facilities that provide accommodations for five or fewer persons of any
age for less than 24 hours.
b. Child care facilities that provide accommodations for five or fewer persons of any
age for less than 24 hours.
c. Single-family detached homes.

23. Section 903.3.1.2 NFPA 13R sprinkler systems Create section 903.3.1.2.4 Control Valve

24.

Control valve with waterflow sensor shall be required for each floor.

Section 903.3.1.3 NFPA 13D sprinkler systems Create Section 903.3.1.3.1 Garage
Attached garages in town-houses shall have a minimum of 1 dry sprinkler head.

10



25. Section 903.3.1.3 NFPA 13D sprinkler systems Create section 903.3.1.3.2 Monitoring
Town-houses shall be monitored by a UL approved Central Station for water flow.

26. Section 903.3.5 Water Supplies, shall be amended as follows:
Water supplies for automatic sprinkler systems shall comply with this section and the
standards referenced in Section 903.3.1. The potable water supply shall be protected
against backflow in accordance with the requirements of this section and the lllinois
Plumbing Code.

27. Section 903.4.1 Monitoring Shall be amended as follows:
Alarm, supervisory, and trouble signals shall be different and shall be automatically
transmitted to a U.L listed Central Station utilizing NFPA 72. Fire Alarm systems shall
transmit and report the electronically supervised signal by point address to the monitoring
station such that specific fire alarm point address is available and reported on Fire
department dispatch.

28.Section 903  Automatic  Sprinkler = Systems  Create  section  903.7

Commercial/residential Occupancies, all sprinklered multi-tenant occupancies shall
have an isolation control valve and water flow switch for each tenant space.

29. Section 904.12 Commercial cooking Systems, create section 904.12.6
Required, all occupancies with a commercial cooking operation shall have a monitored
fire alarm system in accordance with applicable requirements of NFPA 70 and NFPA 72.

30. Section 905.3.1 Height, shall be amended as follows:
An approved standpipe system shall be installed in all buildings three (3) stories or more
in height in each stairwell at each level. Standpipe systems shall be installed in all buildings
where any portion of the building floor area is more than 200 feet travel distance from the
nearest point of the fire department vehicle access.

31. Section 907 Fire Alarm Detection Systems, create section 907.1.2.1
Required

a.
b.

> @

Location of the annunciator panel shall be approved by the Fire Code Official.

An annunciator panel or the main fire alarm control panel shall be placed nearthe
fire sprinkler riser.

A red strobe light shall be installed by the annunciator panel or above the closest
entrance to the fire alarm control panel as approved by the Fire Code Official

The annunciator panel shall indicate and have all of the functions of the fire alarm
control panel.

The annunciator shall be properly marked to show each zone.

A detailed floor plan illustrating each zone shall be provided on each fire alarm
control panel and located adjacent to each annunciator panel.

All fire alarm systems shall be the addressable type.

All multi-tenant occupancies shall be provided with a red strobe light at the
entrance to the tenant space that activate upon all alarm conditions in that tenant
space.

11



32.

33.

34.

35.

36.

37.

Section 907.2.1 Group A. shall be amended as follows:

An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system that activates the
occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed.
Exception: An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system is not required
where the building is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and the occupant notification appliances will activate
throughout the notification zones upon sprinkler water flow.

Sprinkled Building: An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system
shall be provided at the top of all stairs within a sprinkled building

Section 907.2.2 Group B shall be amended as follows:

An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system that activates the
occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed.
Exception: An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system is not required
where the building is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and the occupant notification appliances will activate
throughout the notification zones upon sprinkler water flow

Sprinkled Building: An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system
shall be provided at the top of all stairs within a sprinkled building

Section 907.2.3 Group E shall be amended as follows

An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system that activates the occupant
notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed.

Exception: An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system is not required
where the building is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and the occupant notification appliances will activate
throughout the notification zones upon sprinkler water flow.

Section 907.2.4 Group F shall be amended as follows

An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system that activates the
occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed.
Exception: An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system is not required
where the building is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and the occupant notification appliances will activate
throughout the notification zones upon sprinkler water flow.

Section 907.2.5 Group H shall be amended as follows:
An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system that activates the
occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed.

Section 907.2.7 Group M, shall be amended as follows:

An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system that activates the
occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed.
Exception: An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system is not required
where the building is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and the occupant notification appliances will activate
throughout the notification zones upon sprinkler water flow.

12



38. Section 907.2.8.2 Groupe R1 Automatic smoke detection shall be amended as follows.
An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system that activates the occupant
notification system shall be provided.
a. All corridors and common areas
b. All waiting areas that open to corridors
c. Top of all stairways
d. All Laundry, trash, electrical rooms, mechanical rooms, and storage rooms

39. Section 907.2.9.3 Group R-2 shall be amended as follows:
An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system that activates the occupant
notification system shall be provided.
a. All corridors and common areas
b. All waiting areas that open to corridors
c. Top of all stairways
d. All Laundry, trash, electrical rooms, mechanical rooms, and storage rooms

40. Section 907.2 where required, create Section 907.2.24 Group S
An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system that activates the
occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed.
Exception: An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system is not required
where the building is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and the occupant notification appliances will activate
throughout the notification zones upon sprinkler water flow.

41. Section 907.2 where required create Section 907.2.25 Groups, R-3 and R-4
An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system that activates the occupant
notification system shall be provided.
a. All corridors and common areas
b. All waiting areas that open to corridors
c. Top of all stairways
d. All Laundry, trash, electrical rooms, mechanical rooms, and storage rooms
Exception: One and two family occupancies and townhomes built under the IRC.

42. 907.6.6 Monitoring shall be amended as follows:
Fire alarm systems required by this chapter or by the International Building Code shall be
monitored by a U.L. listed central station in accordance with NFPA 72.

43. 907.6.6 Monitoring Create section 907.6.6.3 Transmission
Fire Alarm systems shall transmit and report the electronically supervised signal by point
address to the monitoring station such that specific fire alarm point address is available
and reported on fire department dispatch.

44. Section 912.1 Installation, shall be amended as follows:

Fire department connections shall be installed in accordance with the NFPA standard
applicable to the system design and shall comply with Sections 912.2 through 912.6. The
fire department connection shall be an approved five-inch (5") connection with a thirty (30)
degree down turn. A white strobe light shall be placed above the fire department
connection and the white strobe light shall indicate on water flow only. A two and one- half
inch (2 %") NST single fire department connection shall be acceptable where piped to a
three inch (3") or smaller riser.

13



45. Section 912.6 Backflow Protection, shall be amended as follows.
The potable water supply to automatic sprinkler and standpipe systems shall be protected
against backflow as required by the lllinois Plumbing Code.

46. Section 1206 Electrical Energy Systems, create section1206.1.1
NFPA 855 Standard for the Installation of Stationary Energy Storage Systems:
current Edition shall be used.

14



116 E. Washington Street TAWNYA R. MACK, CPA
Suite One LAURI POPE, CPA
Morris, lllinois 60450

CATE MOULTON, CPA

. Phone: (815) 942-3306 MADISON SCHEEL, CPA
& associlat © S| Fax: (815) 942-9430 CHRIS CHRISTENSEN
www.mackcpas.com JESSIKA MCGARVEY

CERTIFIED PUBLIC ACCOUNTANTS OLIVIA SMITH |

February 2, 2026

To the Fire Chief and Board of Trustees
Bristol-Kendall Fire Protection District
103 Beaver St.
Yorkville, IL 80560

We are pleased to confirm our understanding of the services we are to provide Bristol-Kendall Fire
Protection District for the year ended April 30, 2026.

Audit Scope and Objectives

We will audit the modified cash basis financial statements of the governmental activities, each major fund,
and the aggregate remaining fund information, including the related notes to the financial statements, which
collectively comprise the basic financial statements of the Bristol-Kendall Fire Protection District as of and
for the year ended April 30, 2026.

We have also been engaged to report on supplementary information other than RSI that accompanies
Bristol-Kendall Fire Protection District’s financial statements. We will subject the following supplementary
information to the auditing procedures applied in our audit of the financial statements and certain additional
procedures, including comparing and reconciling such information directly to the underlying accounting and
other records used to prepare the financial statements or to the financial statements themselves, and other
additional procedures in accordance with GAAS, and we will provide an opinion on it in relation to the
financial statements as a whole in a report combined with our auditor's report on the financial statements.

1) Combining & Individual Fund Financial Statements

We have not been engaged to report on the other information which accompany the financial statements.
Our responsibility with respect to this other information in documents containing the audited financial
statements and auditor’s report does not extend beyond the financial information identified in the report.
We have no responsibility for determining whether this other information is properly stated. This other
information will not be audited and we will not express an opinion or provide any assurance on it:

1) IMRF pension schedules

2) Assessed valuations, tax rates, tax extensions and tax collections
3) Notes to other information

4) Statement of expenditures by station

The objectives of our audit are to obtain reasonable assurance as to whether the financial statements as a
whole are free from material misstatement, whether due to fraud or error; issue an auditor's report that
includes our opinion about whether your financial statements are fairly presented, in all material respects,
in conformity with the modified cash basis of accounting and report on the fairness of the supplementary
information referred to in the second paragraph when considered in relation to the financial statements as
a whole. Reasonable assurance is a high level of assurance but is not absolute assurance and therefore is
not a guarantee that an audit conducted in accordance with GAAS will always detect a material
misstatement when it exists. Misstatements, including omissions, can arise from fraud or error and are
considered material if there is a substantial likelihood that, individually or in the aggregate, they would
influence the judgment of a reasonable user made based on the financial statements.



Auditor’s Responsibilities for the Audit of the Financial Statements

We will conduct our audit in accordance with GAAS and will include tests of your accounting records and
other procedures we consider necessary to enable us to express such opinions. As part of an audit in
accordance with GAAS, we exercise professional judgment and maintain professional skepticism
throughout the audit.

We will evaluate the appropriateness of accounting policies used and the reasonableness of significant
accounting estimates made by management. We will also evaluate the overall presentation of the financial
statements, including the disclosures, and determine whether the financial statements represent the
underlying transactions and events in a manner that achieves fair presentation. We will plan and perform
the audit to obtain reasonable assurance about whether the financial statements are free of material
misstatement, whether from (1) errors, (2) fraudulent financial reporting, (3) misappropriation of assets, or
(4) violations of laws or governmental regulations that are attributable to the government or to acts by
management or employees acting on behalf of the government.

Because of the inherent limitations of an audit, combined with the inherent limitations of internal control,
and because we will not perform a detailed examination of all transactions, there is an unavoidable risk that
some material misstatements may not be detected by us, even though the audit is properly planned and
performed in accordance with GAAS. In addition, an audit is not designed to detect immaterial
misstatements or violations of laws or governmental regulations that do not have a direct and material effect
on the financial statements. However, we will inform the appropriate level of management of any material
errors, fraudulent financial reporting, or misappropriation of assets that comes to our attention. We will also
inform the appropriate level of management of any violations of laws or governmental regulations that come
to our attention, unless clearly inconsequential. Our responsibility as auditors is limited to the period
covered by our audit and does not extend to any later periods for which we are not engaged as auditors.

We will also conclude, based on the audit evidence obtained, whether there are conditions or events,
considered in the aggregate, that raise substantial doubt about the government's ability to continue as a
going concern for a reasonable period of time.

Our procedures will include tests of documentary evidence supporting the transactions recorded in the
accounts, tests of the physical existence of inventories, and direct confirmation of receivables and certain
assets and liabilities by correspondence with selected customers, creditors, and financial institutions. We
will also request written representations from your attorneys as part of the engagement.

We may, from time to time and depending on the circumstances, use third-party service providers in serving
your account. We may share confidential information about you with these service providers but remain
committed to maintaining the confidentiality and security of your information. Accordingly, we maintain
internal policies, procedures, and safeguards to protect the confidentiality of your personal information. In
addition, we will secure confidentiality agreements with all service providers to maintain the confidentiality
of your information and we will take reasonable precautions to determine that they have appropriate
procedures in place to prevent the unauthorized release of your confidential information to others. In the
event that we are unable to secure an appropriate confidentiality agreement, you will be asked to provide
your consent prior to the sharing of your confidential information with the third-party service provider.
Furthermore, we will remain responsible for the work provided by any such third-party service providers.

Audit Procedures—Internal Control

We will obtain an understanding of the government and its environment, including internal control relevant
to the audit, sufficient to identify and assess the risks of material misstatement of the financial statements,
whether due to error or fraud, and to design and perform audit procedures responsive to those risks and
obtain evidence that is sufficient and appropriate to provide a basis for our opinions. The risk of not detecting
a material misstatement resulting from fraud is higher than for one resulting from error, as fraud may involve
collusion, forgery, intentional omissions, misrepresentation, or the override of internal control. An audit is
not designed to provide assurance on internal control or to identify deficiencies in internal control.
Accordingly, we will express no such opinion. However, during the audit, we will communicate to
management and those charged with governance internal control related matters that are required to be
communicated under AICPA professional standards.



We have identified the following significant risk(s) of material misstatement as part of our audit planning:

According to GAAS, significant risks include management override of controls, and GAAS presumes that
revenue recognition is a significant risk. Accordingly, we have considered these as significant risks.

Audit Procedures—Compliance

As part of obtaining reasonable assurance about whether the financial statements are free of material
misstatement, we will perform tests of Bristol-Kendall Fire Protection District's compliance with the
provisions of applicable laws, regulations, contracts, and agreements. However, the objective of our audit
will not be to provide an opinion on overall compliance and we will not express such an opinion.

Other Services

We will also prepare the financial statements of Bristol-Kendall Fire Protection District in conformity with
the modified cash basis of accounting based on information provided by you.

We will perform the services in accordance with applicable professional standards. The other services are
limited to the financial statement services previously defined. We, in our sole professional judgment, reserve
the right to refuse to perform any procedure or take any action that could be construed as assuming
management responsibilities.

Responsibilities of Management for the Financial Statements

Our audit will be conducted on the basis that you acknowledge and understand your responsibility for
designing, implementing, and maintaining internal controls relevant to the preparation and fair presentation
of financial statements that are free from material misstatement, whether due to fraud or error, including
monitoring ongoing activities; for the selection and application of accounting principles; and for the
preparation and fair presentation of the financial statements in conformity with the modified cash basis of
accounting.

Management is responsible for making drafts of financial statements, all financial records, and related
information available to us and for the accuracy and completeness of that information (including information
from outside of the general and subsidiary ledgers). You are also responsible for providing us with (1)
access to all information of which you are aware that is relevant to the preparation and fair presentation of
the financial statements, such as records, documentation, identification of all related parties and all related-
party relationships and transactions, and other matters; (2) additional information that we may request for
the purpose of the audit; and (3) unrestricted access to persons within the government from whom we
determine it necessary to obtain audit evidence. At the conclusion of our audit, we will require certain
written representations from you about the financial statements and related matters.

Your responsibilities include adjusting the financial statements to correct material misstatements and
confirming to us in the management representation letter that the effects of any uncorrected misstatements
aggregated by us during the current engagement and pertaining to the latest period presented are
immaterial, both individually and in the aggregate, to the financial statements of each opinion unit taken as
a whole.

You are responsible for the design and implementation of programs and controls to prevent and detect
fraud, and for informing us about all known or suspected fraud affecting the government involving (1)
management, (2) employees who have significant roles in internal control, and (3) others where the fraud
could have a material effect on the financial statements. Your responsibilities include informing us of your
knowledge of any allegations of fraud or suspected fraud affecting the government received in
communications from employees, former employees, grantors, regulators, or others. In addition, you are
responsible for identifying and ensuring that the government complies with applicable laws and regulations.

You are responsible for the preparation of the supplementary information in conformity with the modified
cash basis of accounting. You agree to include our report on the supplementary information in any
document that contains and indicates that we have reported on the other and supplementary information.
You also agree to make the audited financial statements readily available to users of the supplementary
information no later than the date the supplementary information is issued with our report thereon. Your
responsibilities include acknowledging to us in the representation letter that (1) you are responsible for
presentation of the supplementary information in accordance with the modified cash basis of accounting;



(2) you believe the supplementary information, including its form and content, is fairly presented in
accordance with the modified cash basis of accounting; (3) the methods of measurement or presentation
have not changed from those used in the prior period (or, if they have changed, the reasons for such
changes); and (4) you have disclosed to us any significant assumptions or interpretations underlying the
measurement or presentation of the other and supplementary information.

You agree to assume all management responsibilities for the financial statement preparation services and
any other nonattest services we provide; oversee the services by designating an individual, preferably from
senior management, with suitable skill, knowledge, or experience; evaluate the adequacy and results of the
services; and accept responsibility for them.

Engagement Administration, Fees, and Other
We understand that your employees will locate any documents selected and requested by us for testing.

The audit documentation for this engagement is the property of Mack & Associates, P. C. and constitutes
confidential information. However, subject to applicable laws and regulations, audit documentation and
appropriate individuals will be made available upon request and in a timely manner to the office of the
lllinois State Comptroller or its designee. We will notify you of any such request. If requested, access to
such audit documentation will be provided under the supervision of Mack & Associates, P. C. personnel.
Furthermore, upon request, we may provide copies of selected audit documentation to the office of the
lllinois State Comptroller or its designee. The office of the lllinois State Comptroller or its designee may
intend or decide to distribute the copies or information contained therein to others, including other
governmental agencies.

Tawnya Mack is the engagement partner and is responsible for supervising the engagement and signing
the report or authorizing another individual to sign it.

Our fee for services will be at our standard hourly rates plus out-of-pocket costs (such as report
reproduction, word processing, postage, travel, copies, telephone, etc.) except that we agree that our gross
fee, including expenses, will not exceed $10,000. Our standard hourly rates vary according to the degree
of responsibility involved and the experience level of the personnel assigned to your audit. Our invoices for
these fees will be rendered each month as work progresses and are payable on presentation. In accordance
with our firm policies, work may be suspended if your account becomes 60 days or more overdue and may
not be resumed until your account is paid in full. If we elect to terminate our services for nonpayment, our
engagement will be deemed to have been completed upon written notification of termination, even if we
have not completed our report. You will be obligated to compensate us for all time expended and to
reimburse us for all out-of-pocket costs through the date of termination. The above fee is based on
anticipated cooperation from your personnel and the assumption that unexpected circumstances will not
be encountered during the audit. If significant additional time is necessary, we will discuss it with you and
arrive at a new fee estimate before we incur the additional costs.

Reporting

We will issue a written report upon completion of our audit of Bristol-Kendall Fire Protection District’s
financial statements. Our report will be addressed to the Fire Chief and Board of Bristol-Kendall Fire
Protection District. Circumstances may arise in which our report may differ from its expected form and
content based on the results of our audit. Depending on the nature of these circumstances, it may be
necessary for us to modify our opinions, add a separate section, or add an emphasis-of-matter or other-
matter paragraph to our auditor’s report, or if necessary, withdraw from this engagement. If our opinions
are other than unmodified, we will discuss the reasons with you in advance. If, for any reason, we are
unable to complete the audit or are unable to form or have not formed opinions, we may decline to express
opinions or withdraw from this engagement.



We appreciate the opportunity to be of service to Bristol-Kendall Fire Protection District and believe this
letter accurately summarizes the significant terms of our engagement. If you have any questions, please
let us know. If you agree with the terms of our engagement as described in this letter, please sign the
attached copy and return it to us.

Very truly yours,

Wack & dassciataa, PL

Mack & Associates, P. C.
Certified Public Accountants

RESPONSE:
This letter correctly sets forth the understanding of Bristol-Kendall Fire Protection District.

Fire Chief signature:
Title:
Date:

Trustee signature:
Title:
Date:




Bristol-Kendall Fire Protection District
103 Beaver Street
Yorkville, IL 60560-1704
Phone: 630-553-6186
Fax: 630-553-1482

I@ﬁ“;} R N T A R R O R S TR A TR AR AR R T T R T O R R T L S A DR R U e T %

Memorandum

Date: February 6, 2026
To: Board of Trustees
From: Fire Chief Jeremy Messersmith

RE: Personnel Status

President Johnson,

| am requesting trustees to approve the following change.
e Luke Babich- Has resigned from his full time position to pursue another career path opportunity.
He would like to remain on part time. He did work part time for us prior to being hired full time.



= * Bristol Kendall Fire

%& Protection District

103 East Beaver Street
Yorkwville, IL. 60560-1704
Phone: 630-553-6186
Fax: 630-553-1482

Memorandum

Date: February 5, 2026
To:  Board of Trustees
From: Fire Chief Jeremy Messersmith

RE: Declare Items Surplus

President Johnson,

| am requesting board review and approval for the following items to be declared as surplus.

Vehicle Parts

Justice Light Bar
Wheel Simulators
Kussmaul air pump
2 Alternators

These items are for vehicles we no longer own. Quad County Fire Equipment is purchasing them for
$500.



Bristol Kendall Fire
Protection District

103 East Beaver Street
Yorkville, IL 60560-1704
Phone: 630-553-6186
Fax: 630-553-1482

Memorandum

Date: February 4t 2026
To:  Asst. Chief Cihak & Asst. Chief McCarty
From: LT. Audrey Enlow

RE: Surplus EMS Equipment

Chiefs,

| am requesting board review and approval for 12 long spine boards to be declared surplus and
donated. The Sugar Grove Fire Protection District has expressed interest in obtaining 6 of the long
spine boards that would be donated.

Respectfully,

%, L%—(/}cyj @2/@(&



