TRUSTEE MEETING
PACKET

March 12, 2026



Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District
Trustee’s Regular Meeting Agenda
March 12, 2026 5:00 PM
103 Beaver Street — Yorkville, IL 60560

Call meeting to order and determination of a quorum. President Ken Johnson

Pledge of allegiance

Approve minutes of the February 12, 2026 regular meeting. As electronically mailed
Approve minutes of the February 12, 2026 closed session — Approve, but not release
Semiannual review of closed session minutes. Approved but not released
Comments from the public

NOo a b~ 0 Nh -

Present District bills for payment. — Fire Chief Jeremy Messersmith
a. approve tuition/travel/meal expenses-roll call (N/A)
b. approve District bills - rolf call
Present payroll for review and approval - roll call
Present financial statements for review
10. Staff Reports
a. Fire Bureau- Fire Marshal Michael Torrence
i. Reports from Planning Council
b. EMS, Training, and Safety- Assistant Chief Ryan Cihak
¢. Operations- Assistant Chief Scott McCarty
d. Administration- Fire Chief Jeremy Messersmith
11. Closed session per 5 ILCS120/2 ¢ 1

The appointment, employment, compensations, discipline, performance, or dismissal of specific employees of the
public body including hearing testimony on a complaint lodged against an employee of the public body or against
legal counsel for the public body to determine its validity.

12. Action taken after closed session

13. Oid Business
a. Discuss and Approve Ordinance 2026-01 Fire Prevention Codes

b. Other Old Business
14. New Business
a. Open Session Audio Destruction — November 13, 2025
b. Closed Session Audio Destruction — None
¢. Other New Business
15. Any Other Business
16. Comments from the Public
17. Next regular meeting will be on April 9, 2026 5:00 PM
18. Adjourn regular board meeting

Posted by: Date and time:




TRUSTEE MEETING MINUTES
OF THE
BRISTOL KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
KENDALL COUNTY, ILLINOIS
HELD IN THE TRAINING ROOM, 2ND FLOOR
103 E. BEAVER STREET, YORKVILLE, IL 60560
THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 12, 2026

REGULAR TRUSTEE’S MEETING

BOARD PRESIDENT JOHNSON CALLED THE MEETING TO ORDER AT 5:00 P.M. and
DETERMINATION OF QUORUM

Roll Call
Board President Ken Johnson — yea; Board Treasurer Marty Schwartz — yea;
Board Secretary — Darin Peterson - yea; Trustee Jeff Farren — yea; Trustee Mark Hoffert — yea

Administration present: Fire Chief Jeremy Messersmith, Assistant Chief Scott McCarty, Fire Marshal Michael
Torrence, Fire Inspector Rand Roberts, and Katie Miller (minutes recorder).

The Pledge of Allegiance was recited.

APPROVE MINUTES OF THE JANUARY 8, 2026 REGULAR TRUSTEE'S MEETING

Board President Johnson entertained a motion to approve the January 8, 2026 Regular Trustee's Meeting
Minutes. Motion to approve by Board Secretary Peterson. Seconded by Board Treasurer Schwartz. All in favor say
aye. All those opposed say no. Motion passed.

COMMENTS FROM THE PUBLIC

N/A

DISTRICT BILLS

The Board List of Bills was presented for approval:

Fire - $31,681.47; EMS - $851.82 Operations - $33,187.51; Capital - $90,092.30; Foreign Fire - $0.00
Insurance - $84,083.25; Online ACH payments - $71,986.71; Memorial - $0.00
Total: $311,883.06

Board President Johnson entertained a motion to approve the District bills. Motion from Trustee Hoffert and

seconded by Trustee Farren.
Roll Call
Board President Ken Johnson — yea; Board Treasurer Marty Schwartz — yea;
Board Secretary — Darin Peterson — yea; Jeff Farren — yea; Trustee Mark Hoffert- yea
Motion Carried.

PAYROLL

The Payroll Summary Report was presented for a total gross payroll of $600,264.22 for the month of
January 2026 for 2 pay periods.

Board President Johnson entertained a motion to approve the Payroll. Motion from Board Treasurer Schwartz and

seconded by Board Secretary Peterson.
Roll Call

Board President Ken Johnson — yea; Board Treasurer Marty Schwartz — yea;



Board Secretary — Darin Peterson — yea; Jeff Farren — yea; Trustee Mark Hoffert- yea
Motion Carried.

GOVERNMENTAL ACCOUNTING TO DISCUSS THE FINANCIAL REPORT

Tom Coughlin presented Governmental Accounting’s financial report. The report was placed on file.

FIRE MARSHAL TORRENCE’S REPORT

Fire Marshal Torrence's report was presented and placed on file.

ASSISTANT CHIEF CIHAK’S REPORT

A/C Cihak’s report was presented and placed on file.

ASSISTANT CHIEF MCCARTY’S OPERATION REPORT

A/C McCarty’s report was presented and placed on file.

FIRE CHIEF MESSERSMITH’S REPORT

Chief Messersmith’s Fire Chief report was presented and placed on file.

CLOSED SESSION

President: At this time I would ask for a motion to suspend the special meeting to enter into a closed
session per 5 ILCS 120/2(c)(2) — Collective negotiating matters between the public body and its
employees or their representatives, or deliberations concerning salary schedules for one or more
classes of employees.

Motion by: Board Treasurer Schwartz Second by: Board Secretary Peterson
All those in favor of a closed session say aye. All those opposed say no. Motion passed.
President: The following members are present; will the clerk please take a roll call:
Roll Call

Board President Johnson — yea; Board Treasurer Marty Schlapp - yea
Board Secretary Darin Peterson — yea; Trustee Jeff Farren — yea; Trustee Mark Hoffert - yea

President: Also joining the board in closed session are:

Administration present: Chief Messersmith, A/C McCarty, A/C Cihak and Katie Miller (minutes
recorder).

Closed Session began at 5:25 p.m.

President: At this time a discussion can be conducted on the subject as described in the exception list
for closed sessions. No other business should be discussed. No official action may be taken

in closed session.

President: At this time I would ask for a motion to adjourn the closed session and return to the regular
meeting.



Motion by: Trustee Farren Second by: Board Treasurer Schwartz
All those in favor of a closed session say aye. All those opposed say no. Motion passed.

The closed session was adjourned at 6:07 p.m. and the regular Trustee Meeting reconvened
at 6:10 p.m.

President: Will the clerk please take a roll call.
Roll Call

Board President Johnson — yea; Board Treasurer Marty Schlapp - yea
Board Secretary Darin Peterson — yea; Trustee Jeff Farren — yea; Trustee Mark Hoffert - yea

ACTION AFTER CLOSED SESSION

N/A

OLD BUSINESS

N/A

NEW BUSINESS

A. Open Session Audio Destruction — October 9, 2025 meeting

Board President Johnson entertained a motion to approve destroying all open session audio recordings from the
Trustee meeting on October 9, 2025. Motion to approve from Board Treasurer Schwartz and seconded by Trustee
Farren. All in favor say aye. All those opposed say no. Motion passed.

B. Closed Session Audio Destruction — July 11, 2024 meeting

Board President Johnson entertained a motion to approve destroying all closed session audio recordings from the
Trustee meeting on July 11, 2024. Motion to approve from Trustee Hoffert and seconded by Board Secretary
Peterson. All in favor say aye. All those opposed say no. Motion passed.

C. Discuss Ordinance 2026-02 Fire Prevention Codes

The Fire Prevention Codes draft ordinance was discussed. Changes were discussed and will bring back in March’s
meeting for approval.

D. Approve Audit Engagement letter with Mack & Associate’s

Board President Johnson entertained a motion to approve the audit engagement letter from Mack & Associate’s. This
approval will allow Mack & Associate’s to move forward with this year’s audit. Motion to approve by Board
Secretary Peterson and seconded by Trustee Farren.

E. Approve Personnel Changes

Board President Johnson entertained a motion approve the resignation from Luke Babich’s full time firefighter
employment, but remain on part time. Motion to approve from Trustee Hoffert and seconded by Board Treasurer
Schwartz. All in favor say aye. All those opposed say no. Motion passed.



F. Approve Surplus of truck parts and EMS equipment

Board President Johnson entertained a motion approve the surplus of truck parts. Motion to approve from Board
Secretary Peterson and seconded by Board Treasurer Schwartz.

Board President Johnson entertained a motion approve the surplus of EMS equipment. Motion to approve from
Trustee Farren and seconded by Board Treasurer Schwartz.

Roll Call
Board President Ken Johnson — yea; Board Treasurer Marty Schwartz — yea;
Board Secretary — Darin Peterson — yea; Jeff Farren — yea; Trustee Mark Hoffert- yea
Motion Carried.

G. Other New Business

Trustee Hoffert discussed wanting to look into getting a chaplain for the department AC McCarty let him know that
AC Cihak has already started that process and will update the board next month on the status.

ANY OTHER BUSINESS OR COMMENTS FROM THE PUBLIC
N/A

NEXT REGULAR TRUSTEE’S MEETING

The next Regular Trustee’s Meeting is scheduled for March 12, 2026 at 5:00 p.m. at 103 E.
Beaver Street, Yorkville, IL 60560.

ADJOURNMENT

Board President Johnson entertained a motion to adjourn the Regular Trustee’s Meeting. Motion by Board Treasurer
Schwartz and seconded by Trustee Hoffert. All in favor say aye. All those opposed say no. Motion passed.

The Trustee Meeting of February 12, 2026 was adjourned at 6:25 p.m.

Minutes Approved and Accepted:

President Secretary



1 eBey

86609~ Aousbrawa uasntoeyy €10}
95699~ “'3PIYSA WRY - 9965 v0BLEd  P0BLSH  920Z/THED g
AsueBiawg usenpoey
z9esg'e- {1} swaysAgiamog aiessaiuy e10),
zoesze “3IBA WRY - 2095 669651400V “ZYOY 9202/2L4€0 [H52]

{1} swejshgiemoy sreysinug
90°565'}- ou ‘aowuag Bunig seisiow) fejot
8b'98p- TAOMUSA WYY - 9955 BLESEOH IOV LGOS 9202124180 i}
88°192- TIOIBAWEH - 9955 BLESEIH IOV OSHOE 92Z0ZIZLIE0 =}
06'36- e B Jleday - 0985 6L6GESH VOV TEHPOE 920Z12L/E0 g
0000t~ “BIOIUBA WRY - 9956 6/6SES# POV BYPOE 9Z02/ZL 10 g
09'v6E- S dOUS WBM 8095 6LBGESH POV OSHOE 920ZIZHIED ig

ay| ‘eo1ales Buylig ejeisieju;
80°2L1'5- "0ul "S3 oouRIS [Blo).
80°LIL'S- T sopwon-ens - czog 29220 9ZOZIZLIEO e

*au) ‘g4 osuIRIg
1r2ee- ‘apudiesq (e1o L
ee6eE TOPIMSA WY - 2455 B9090SZEIA AUl TOSZEL 92021211€0 g
80°€6- TIEN R H1edaY - 085S CO09LEIEIR AN STZEL 920ZIZLILO ng
*apudyesldy
9E'L 61~ Aiddng fioges 19914 )01
80'p5E- T apiyeA WeY - pass 09588  9ZOUZL/EO wa
8T'LE1- “BOIBA WRY - 2955 65598 9Z02/Z LD e
Kiddng fjejes j80)4
[ YA A od ) feamspodg g S80S SANQ JBI0L
o THRSWIOMUN - GOLG  TUW ‘piswidozs  ZoeLLl 9202121150 na
Jeamspods R ssoyg s.4nq
5417184 OIS pue S3JRS SUIWND (BI0L
€851~ TUBOBA WBY - 9965 BL# SWOISND  9Z-Zd 9TOUZLED g
82Alag pue sejeg suluwng
00°062°2- OT1AUIA B WL WOISNg ALD 18101,
00°062'2- RN R Hedey - 095G WIS AMPAYIY  1L0/0 920ZZLED "a
OTTIAUIA B W1 wosn) ALD
28ev8- QT ‘punos pue sped obeayg 1ei0)
€8 “OIPAWSY - €955 B/#JBWOISND  TLOAOP  SZOZ/ZLIEO g
£6°49¢- “BOINBA W'BY - €958 TBL#JBWOISNT  LOADY 920Z/ZLIE0
16°€54- UOPIPAWRY - €95 TBLRISWOISND  LOAOY 9Z0ZIZLIED
1685t SOINSA WY - 2955 TB#OWOISND U LOADK 9ZOZZUED
86°CL- ey B HedaY - 0955  UBZ#JOWOISND  LOAOY 9z02ITHED ik}
77 ‘punos pue sped o8esiys
85°1€92- $22W3G jelde) uozewy [ejog
8612 g BupuBuend 01SS  -OAPE-EMML  EMML  920Z/2HE0
L16°E11- ‘b3 sonduod - 6829 -OAVE-EMML  TEMYL 9Z0Z/TH/EC
66'YTr- UH g SUNOIUN - 5OLG  T-DAPE-EMYEL  TEMYL 9202/Z4/50
£8°9€8'}- 3 6unubyand - 0255 -OAVE-EMYL  EMML 9ZOZIZLIE0
00'691- g Bunubyond - 0158 T -OAPE-EMYL  TEMML 920Z/ZLIE0
¥8°v9- s Bunybyedd - 0LSS  THINZO-QHAL QML 920Z/2HE0
$821AI0S Jejides uozewy
junowy unNoaoy owspy wnN 8jeq odAyL
9Z0Z ydiew

aild - siiig jo 3sI pieog
1913810 UONI0Iy Bitd [jepua) [ojsug



Z 8ey

——meeee

SLZov'iz- “vi0L
zeTiee- ‘00 'SUSHNOS 193} JB|ITYAA {2101
e USIOIYIA NRY - 9955 00690¥ZL# AL "Q0¥ZE S202/CHED ng
"00 'SUONN|OS j8alg 10(BOYM
SL2Le- "ou) ‘Aispioiqus3 g BuiuaalosIS SuaAslS jelo ]
05°28)- g g swuojun - 591G sulogiun) YEBYZ 92OZ/TLIED g
00°ze- 7" '8 SUNORUN - G9LG suuofiun SoLYE 92Z0Z/ZLIED g
$9°Z266- '8 g suiopun - 5918 Ssulogun ovLve 920Z12LIE0 g
*au) ‘Kiepiolquiy g Bujussiosiiig s.usasls
£S°vLL- U] 00 uoLBH,O AeY [BI0)
eSviL- - T8 9 SUUOJUN -GBLE  CULO# JBWOISND  09PSOPZ ReAvArANIN e g
“3uj 00 uoLeH,Q Aey
$0'625- SHEd OINY YdWN [e10L
mmw - IPIYBA WY - 2955 VCLLOVE AU yeLLor 92022 1IE0
$6'92- II0IYIA WBH - £98S 904201 V) 90LL0% 9202/Z1iE0
ye'osl- " 3OINBA WBY - 2095 88B890Y# AUl 898901 92022 1/E0
2601 "IPIYBA WP - 6955 £89850%# AUy 89890 9202/Z3/£0
29°61- e g Jedoy - 0956 GBZLOYH AU} SBZL0V 9202Z/2i80
8LeY TIPIBA WY - €255 LBLL0V# AU} 18120 AT ArAN A1)
1 24°115 S3UBA - jand - 629G SB60L0v# AUy S60L0¥ 9202/24/80
08'69~ BN B Heday . 0955 COES0v# AUl Z9E90Y 920Z/ZL/ED
86°L2" ey 2 sedsy - ggss EVESOPR AW £9830Y R TATATAREAY]
89'vE- e g Jledsy - 0955 82BS0t# AW 82830% S202/211€0 ia
SHed oY vdviN
L1616~ 00 Alddng jeinsnpul DS [e1o],
118 —mu ,,,,,,,,,,,,,,, o TR R aeday - 0965 TOSZYESH IOV ZSEZ8 8202/21/20 ra
02 Addng jeuysnpu; oS
8¢'20z- 071 Auedwiod 20sg SIW jejoy
86202 CleWRiedoy-0LgS  OFIWONRD  “PINI  SZOZIZLIEG |
971 Auedwiog edjAleS SIW
Q561 RO - SPIRUSYY (B10)
05611~ g Bunubyany - 015 ZOVOLER 100V 6¥611 9202/ZLIE0 ik ]
BJJIAY40A - SPJRUBH
unoty uNoIdY owew wnN ajeq adAy
9202 yosen

a114 - s||ig jo Js17 pJeog
JOHISI(] UOI3OBI0Ad 3ll [|epUBY [OISLIg



1 sBey

Z9°0ZL'sy-

WIOL
‘Aoeusseyd As)doD ysny {e1o]
" 'SUOHEIPBY - 1GL29 Pxaird] 9Z02IZHIED e
*SUONEDIPBY - 16429 £ecze 9Z0Z/TLIED we
“suonedP3W - 1629 E2/SLIT 9ZOZIZLIED
“SUOREDIPBY - £5/29 £22VIT 9202/ZLIE0
“SUONEOIPS - £GLZ9 £2/6/T 9Z0Z/ZLIE0
“"SUCHEDIPA - 15229 £2/8rT 9202721150
“"SUCREIIPS - Z6/29 ordi-r4 920Z/21IE0
*SUOHEDIPY - 76429 €2THL 9Z0ZITHED
“SUOHEDIPS - 15/29 A ArAS 9Z02/Z IS0
"SUONEPOY - 26229 zesLZL 920272150
“'SUOBEdPA - £6/29 ad T4 00 9Z0Z/21/E0 na
“Aorusieyy Asjdos ysny
€SPLL- UL 0D UouB,O Aey ejo]
SSPLL- C@PSUIOMN-GOIS CLO#JOWOISND  6S9SSKZ  9Z0ZIZLIED ng
Ut “0D BOLIGH, Aoy
z9°59¢- shied 0Ny YdyN (2101
WeEL- S3IIYAA - 184 - G285 SBUIOVR AUl GBY/OP 9Z02/23/E0
£9°S8L- SBIOIGAA - (9N - 6295 LIVIOWE A 11bI0Y 9202/ 1E0
96°52- ~ doys - Wy - 609G VZELOWE N pZELOV SZ0ZITLIED
Z9pL- DI WY - BLSS 2ETLOVE A Z6TLOP 9Z02/Z1IE0
sHed OINY YdYN
00°00%*L- ou| ‘2aneg Buing ajeisieuy (g0 L
0000v'-  “SOUSWEN 8095 GESEEIOV  LSKOE  SZ0ZIZL/E0 g
auf ‘ea1ntes Buiiiig erejsaviy)
v0'LL9'L- 1NO-suoRelado 1eosId Jo neaing S4H 1ejo),
vOLi9'te 19y 9sUadX3 - O£  DIZAALNID  TLAID 9202724E0
Lwao-suopesadg jeasty jo
e 6~ {1} 2ut ‘sefes yoeos seiso4 (Bj0]
YET6-  “O[0udA WRM 0865 6SSOCE AUl 6GGOE SZOZIZLICO e
{1} ‘ouy 'setes yseos se1s04
66211~ ‘apudiaald jetoy,
66ZL1- TOPBA INRY - 0865 . TOLSZELL# AU uG2EL 9202721150 wg
-epudisely
00'€5.- Auedwos 10 80994 te10L.
0054~ T W g 1edoy - g9ss OSE99W# 190V 2SSt 9Z0ZIZLIEN wa
Auedwon )0 8380y
0L bSS- OT1 Punog pue sued oSeayd jejo)
0biss- TOPIUBA NPY - 08SS  TBL# JAWOISND  TLOAOK 9202/21/80 g
971 ‘punog pue speq oBesjyy
junowy Junooay owsp wnN ajeq edk),
9202 Ysiey

ST - siiig 30 3s11 pJeog
19LISIQ UOHIB0Ld 41 ||EPUDY [OJSUIG



} ebeg

$0'€60'9-

Yajedsiq Aivjes anang wooua (e

8b Li6C 1B BIEMYOS - 0GLL YGL# S010AY] ¥SL 9ZO2IZHED e
95'GL)- 4 Buyoledsiq - 0545 052 D010AU] 052 9Z02/ZHED e
ydjedsiq Aejes sland woguey
¥S60L- {1} sebuiRi0) [EI0).
¥5'604- BN RABAIY - LODLL T 6ZIOLBEROY 92086 9202/ZL/E0 e
{1} seBuieiny
00osee- 77 ‘Bununoooy [BIUBLUIBAOL) 18101
0005872 oooy gieban - ggls g Bununoooy PO 9202721150 g
o711 ‘Bup Vi 10A0S)
00°60€°L- 3SNOY3IRM JJUBY) Bl 1BJ0 ]
00s0E L “TBY IBMOS - 0542 Z0S0ZO-ANI  OANI  9Z0ZIZLIEO e
BSNOYIUBAN J2JUSD BIRg
00'80z°2- uosuUN Xoiwye (8301
oogocz UL -UOHEONPT . Q05 TUASY UORINE  GruIdY 9202/2LIg0 g
UoSNY YonuYyeQq
8r'Le- JPuwBl} Z 1S 1Se2wWo) |0y
stie- IRLPUB BRQ - 090L T LLIBRIOOY  TTL0Z0 920ZITHIE0 g
Jewaau| Z IS IsEOWOD
z166- 118 1520WOD [Rj0 L
zi'66- 81 pue ejeq - 10902 9GED LIS “"Z¥2Z0 9Z0Z/ZLIEQ ng
} 1S iseswo)
+8°262- OT1 '[edlpsy 831 punog je3oL
8958~ ~ddng jeatpapy - 5929 8rb9Lo8 9Z02/ZLIED e
£L2ie “rddng |eowpaw - 6929 “$6098 9Z0ZR ML e
071 'fed1pe sesf punog
00PI6'L- 'ou "suog pue difuy [el0]
00°p16')- e R Jeday - 1001 LSVOL# AU §9Z6LZ 9Z0ZZLIED e
3uj "suog pue diypy
89°184 S90IA19G fejdes) uozewy (Bjog
6¢'€2- RN R aeday - €00L  ddMODALEL  TRALESL 9Z0ZITHED (]
8509 TANS UOHBIS - 1SELS  T-OAVE-EMYME  EMNE 920ZIZLIEO ]
0L°26¢- TINb3 (EIPS - 0829 T-OAVE-EMML  CEMYL SZ0ZIZHED Lz}
£321A105 [eides uozewy
£P'165'Y ou) Ajejes sebiry jejo
8E"L45- usbAx0 - 0229 1200z#Ioked " 9ZZSS 9Z0T/TLIED
0Z'5.8- usbAxQ - 029  “"1z00Z#oked  '9ZZGS 9ZOZIEHIED
£1°269- usbAxO - 0229  “1Z00Zhieked  9Z2SS 9Z0ZIZHED
16'50€- usbAXG - 0429 "LZ00Z#9REd  EBOLE 9Z0Z/ZLIED
og'oLy- uabAxQ - 0229  ""1Z00Z#109Aed  "EEOLE 9202/ZLIES
28295 UsbAXO - 0229 LzoDzAseked  0ZZSS 9Z0Z/Z1iE0
78'826- usbixG - 0229  “'Lz00ZH#1ked T 0ZZGS 920ZITYED
92464 usbAxQ . 0229  'LzooZ#leked  GZZGS 9ZOTZLIES g
-~auj Asjes seBiyy
Juncuwy unoossy owep wny ajeq adiy
9202 yaJen

suoyesadQ - s||Ig 40 }si paeog
}1S1q uoydajoLd 3114 [fEpuUd)Y |ojsug



Z afegy

9£°08y°2E-

IvLOL
85°9£9- uonesodio [edpal |07 (€101
95'9¢£9- "ddng |eoIpa - G9z9  (ddng jedipeN  0L0SEhb 920Z/ZLIE0 k|

uogesodson [estpa 1oz
00°006 {1} Awapeay 14 ajiA03w0Y JO aBeNIA €101
0005 “'{~UONEBDNDT - 00/5  060-0Z0Z# AUl STOZIZLE0
00°054~ TL-UCHEONDT . 00LS  £0-920Z# AU 9Z0Z/ZHEO
{1} Auepeay a4 sjacewoy jo aBejya
89°'8b2- *di09 831G g S1ONPOId enbiury jelo L
89'8p2- 'ng Buuea)) - 2oL £L8b6Y 9202/21/£0 g
‘d107) 8mmes g sjonposg enbiun
SE'66~ ‘Koeuueyd Lsidog ysny jejo,
SE'66- SUORBIIPBNY - G429 SUONEDIPIIN  "/2ZI0L 9Z0Z/IZLED na
-Aoruueyqd Aejdos ysny
[Ar g U 'VS Yoony fejol
ZeTLS | Ixed/AdoD - 0ZVL  CHSBZIOGHAU  BZ0S  GZ0ZIZLE0 i
U] ‘YN Yooy
00°04¢8- oU| ‘¥SN yoory Jejog
00°0£8- T IxedjAdon - 0zL.  859860ME MUY 88601 9Z0Z/ZLIED ng
Sup 'YSn Yooy
00°05¢- M7 ‘opeises B Blequasey ojjoul] UISoNQ (2101
as'841L- “'000Yy g 1e6ay . 0g1  "roIssajoud Jod 12564 SZOZIZLILO na
05'tL- 000V P 1eBaY - 0Ll 0ISS9j0ud 404 0zs61 9Z0ZITHEQ g
P37 ‘opjeise) g Brequesey ojjouiq uesong
00°065- "0 JojeAsls) SO [Bl0L
00°055- BN R ARdRY - LODLL  RZEIBWOIND  ULSAD 920ZI1ZLIE0 g
"0 40)2AGT SHO
90°152- 1odaq 20O [ejo L
88'v22- “jddng uopels - gELg 1711 9Z02IZLIE0 ng
2L'92z- iddng uoHels - SELS “BPLSY 9ZOTITHED g
jodag] 8030
62°925- SIMOA ~Spreuaiy ejo)
ol 'ge- “ng Buuesio - €0LLL  2OpLEH 1oy 51744 9202IZLIE0
vL69 “ng BUEsD - LOLLL  ZOVYLE#R oY orizy SZOZZLIED
£6°69- RN paRdaY - L0OLL  Z0PILER IOV LY00¥ 9Z02/2LIg0
e “ZOVSIE# 100V Ly00Y 9Z0ZZLIE0
2Lee- / “TOV9LE#R WOV AL:18 4 920Z/ZLIE0
88'611- BONPI AN - ZvLS T ZOYOLER 100V 88y 920Z/ZLIEC
zL6e- NS BUBAD - LOLLL  Z0YOLER OV 8€91LY 9202Z/ZVED
LY “ng Buwesig - Z0LLL  Z0pOLEH WOV SI9LY 92022410
8622 ng Buweald - LOLL.  CZOPILERIOOY  L0pLp SZOZZLIEO
YLLL- BN R Heday - €001L  ZOPILEH 100V £9ELY 8Z02r2LIE0
96°9¢- B pdiedaY - ZO0LL  TZOPOLER WOV Leziy 9202124160 ]
BIANIOL - SpIeuay
junoury juriodsoy owsy WnN aeq odAy
9202 yatew

suogesadQ - s|jig 40 }si1 pieog
Jo1ysIq uonosjoId Bty jlepuay [ojsug



| oBeg

O
e ——

[2:4%: 40 TGvioL

SIS0l 2qnog ut JyBry sAIQ jej0L
m.x 36~ e3deD 3dd - 0918 CEYSLZH AUL £EP9L2 920221/€0 g
ST'Ly0'e- 12yded 3dd - 0918 286YLZ# AU( 86vie 92022 LIE0 ng

eqnag ul 3yBiy eaig

90051 e~ Sa1A195 [elide) uozetuy [B30)
mm..zmm_‘.m. euded 3dd - 0918 T-OAVE-EMHL EMYEL 920Z24/E0 jLiz]

S831M8S [ejides uozeuly

00'922'9- U uaudinbl aug iy jeI0L
00€6t'  lende03dd . 0ol8 OLLEEZH AUl OLLEEZ  9Z0Z/ZHED g
00°€09- (ended Add - 0918 19L2ETH AUt 1942€C 8202/TL/ED g
00912~ lended Idd - 0918 2042e2# AUy 2042¢e2 9Z02/ZLIED Ha
00YLZ'L- {ended 3dd - 0918 GSOEETH AU( 9%9ged 9202Z/ZLiED ma

-ou| Juswdinb3z sup uy

Junouny unNossy owap wny ajeq adAy
9202 ydsen

lende) - sjug jo 3si] pieog
1RSI UOPOR]OI 3l [[epud)y| jojsug



3 ebeg

TSI

00'6i8'81 1oL
cosLeRr pun{ Ysig Hgnd Siou) 1101
0061881~ O SUSWMIOM - 0SZL  00-98S#WOV 26666  SZ0Z/ZM/ED e
pun.1 yspy oGRA Stouly
junowy JUNODdY owa wnN aleq o0k}
9202 yodsew

aoueiInsuj - sjjig 4o }si pleog
10M}SIQ UORID)0Id Ui [[EPUSY joISLIg



| abed

000 M4~ 10 TUEgSWIopUN - G9LS  rewied sujuo ] uojesediod sejuin
000 aud- 1o BJ-NYD - L1l swhed suug T uonesodio) seuln
00°0£9'E and- 10 B4 =YD - L1l awhed auijuo  uswhojdwg jdaq )
00°0£9°c alid-10  THNO3S [100S - 690G owhAed sujjuo  juswhojdws jdaq i
$5'810°S aid- 10 UG -NUD - LLLL awhed suuo  vgdA - eduswesuel|
sTiLL'e “19dQ - ¥0 a4 -MyD - LLLL  “Uswhed sujuo Buonsy ABisuin
000 13dQ - 0 a4 -MYD - LLLL  “Uswded suluo 181y
22'89¢2 4ed0 - #0 BMA-AD - LLLL  rawhed SUUO  TIMOA Jo Al pajiun
99'€5z “1dQ - 40 U4 -NYD - LY Towhed SuiuQ  TUIMIOA Jo D psiun
82'25¢ 49dQ - $0 BNA-MUD - LLLL UswiAed SUUQ  TUIMMOA Jo AD pajun
€526/ “18dQ - $0 B4 -NYD - LLLL  “Uswhed sujuo Z1S pawog
05°02.'L 19dQ - %0 Sl -WD - LLLL  awded sujuo L 1S pgwog
9$'62Z's and - 10 3u4-Q0 - L1} rswhed sujug  Ueinsu| ey fediound
9€'9/6 “18dQ - $0 34 -WD - LLLL  “swhed sujuo €15 J02IN
$8°98. 19d0 - +0 i MU0 - LLLL  rawhed sujuQ Z1s JooiN
Sh'0ve'e 18d0 - 0 3ud-3UD - LLLL  “rawdhed sujuo SED JOOIN
15°6£6'9¥ an4-10 U -ND - LU rawhed sulug IS 8njg sso1) anig
Z6'615'G and - 10 Bll4-MYD - LiLL  “TawAed suiuo oV1dv
¥S'8L0'e alld-10 UemsujylesH - OpLL  ewded SUIUC  vE3IA - eouswesues]
sZT'LLL'T “Jedo-v0 | -ouoydelsy - L0G0L  aliked auljug ucleiN ABraul)
000 "yedo-$0 L -suoydejel - L0G0L  “auwked auluQ 191y
22'892 1edO-$0 UMM R IOMIS - €0E0L  USWARd SUIUO  TIAMIOA J0 AND pajun
99'¢52 "1RdO-$0 UAMPIemes - Z0g0L  TawAed auluQ AMIOA 4O AUD papun
82'25¢ 8O- $0 MR 19MSS - LOE0L  TTWAed BUUQ  TIANIOA JO A pejun
LvL6 13d0 - $0 ald-dUD - LLLL  awhed suyuQ £1S pgwo)
LrvLe 18d0 - ¥0 €-0U09F - £01L02  “BWABRd BUUQO €18 p3woy
£9°.G/ 18d0o - 10 Z-oupP9ig - 20L0L  awded sujuQ 23S pgwog
05°0Z.'l “5adQ - 0 L -0uosiT - L0L0L  rewded auiuQ L IS pgwo)
S6'6EL 19d0 - 0 AL =YD - LLLL  awhed sujug T sssuisng jseawod
000 "u8dO-p0  g-suoydelel - 20g0L  “TawAed auluQ Z1s Iseowog
98°2.9 18dQ - #0 a4 -NYD - LLLL  rawAed sujuo jpuonapy
000 ...._mQO -v0 ""8] pue 9ed - £090. ...mE%mn_ [UNUQO 7 ssaulsng jsedwo)
000 .:._mQO -0 ) pue Bleq - 20904 ...®E>mn_ [UNUO T ssaulsng jseswo)
G6'6EL :.._mao “$0 8] pue ejeq - L.090.L ...mE>m& [UIUO T ssaulsng jseawo)
00°0 ...._maO -0 c- mcocaw_m._. - £080.2 ...mE>m& SAUINO T ssaulsng jseawod
000 ...LwaO - $0 Z- mco:aw_m._. - 20502 .:mE>m& aujuQ T gssulsng jseswo)
98'2.9 “1ed0 -0 L -8uoydelaL - L0GOL  “aWwAed SuluQ JsuonBi
95'622'G aid- |0 CUBINSUlUYedH - opz.  awed sujjuO  “eunsul ay fediaund
9€'9.6 "18dQ - 40 £-se9.g0z0L “owAhed suuo €15 J09IN
¥8°98. 12d0 - 0 Z-SeD -z020L rawAed sujuo Z1S 109N
SY0¥2'T 18dQ - #0 L-se9.1020L ewAed sujuo SED JOJIN
15'6€6'9Y QU4-10 URINSUl UNESH - OvZ.  TAWABG SUUO  “UIYS anjg ssoi) enig
26'615'G alld - 1.0 JelY - €2LE  TUalAed BUNUO OV14Y
0.'v66 Ai4-10 A -NYD - LiLL  rowhed suljuo Jjueg Xxap
000 3ll4-10  SIPWBA-aNd - G295 awhed suiuo yued XapA
0L'v66 3U4-10 SIPIYBA-eNd - G296 Udwked suluo Aued xapy ed dv
Hpain nqag sse|n Junosoy owsy aweN wnp
920z ‘gz Aenigagq sised [enJody

uoljoesuel] [eulnop [eJauas)
101381 UOIBJ0Id 31 [[epua)] |o)slig

92/60/¢0
Nd ¥2:6



Z abed

Tre8LiLL r88LLL Ivi0oL
2r'88.' L. Zr'88L L
2869 “1d0 - +0 M4 -3y - LLLL  TawAed sujuQ "ouj ‘semog Asulid
28’59 edo-40  rdyg/efelsod - Gyls  awiked suluQ ‘au] ‘samog Asulig
Hpa1p iqea sse|D Junosdy oway aweN wnnN
9202 ‘gz Aenigay siseq [enioay

uoljoesuel] [eulnor [elauas)
JOU3SIg Uoljo9joid Bl [[epud) jo3slig

92/60/€0
Nd v2:6



| abeg

¥L°99b SINZ - €0 sauees - 110 dINOD
G1'99% and - 10 saueles - 110G dINOD
000 al4-10 "TOD 8wl Med - SZ0S 6601
000 all4-10 "USISIWO JBIYD - 0E0S uoyeoeA
LE'68L'% ald- 10 sauefes - 110§ uoyedeA
000 ald - 10 saueles - L 10§ AepijoH
85¥€6'S SINZ - €0 sayeles - 1109 ¥l
857E€6'C ang- 10 saueles - 1106 IS
000 3lld- 10 TONUSUL- ¥dD - €205 TTUsdWoD MdD
000 ST - €0 SalieleS - LL0S  TUOHBIBANOIS
000 aud - 10 ssleles - L0 TUCHBOBANPIS
000 SW3-€0 “lesswil ind - 0L0S 1
000 au4-10 Ulegswilind - 0L0S 11
000 3i4-10 "oy [eduyosy - JE0S 1¥1
000 Qi4- 10  "eonpz olqnd - 8€05 p3 and
00°0 dig-10 “royo Buels - 2zos oo Bures)
§Z'zZL'9l SINE - €0 saueles - 110§ 00 awi] Hed
TAAANC)] a4 - 1g sauelesS - 110§ "0 awi] Wed
00°0 Sud-10 OO Sl Hed - 5205 [eD uo pied
000 a4~ 10 "TOD 8wl Med - §Z0S [evtshyd
000 814~ 10 TODOWEBYIB - ZHOS 0D DMUBYISN
000 all4-10 UleSdwil Ind - 0106 8044
000 J8dd-10  TUlegewil Ind - 0106 JOHD
000 ald-10 “lesawiliind - 0408 ¥vsno
000 SINZ - €0 Saleles - L 10G AepijoH
0070 and - 10 sauefes - | 1L0g KepijoH
00'9¢¢ SINZ - €0 saueles - 1L0g v
00'9g€ and- 10 saliees - 110G v
21828 SINT - €0 saliees - 110 )2
zi'gz8 ald - Lo sallejes - 1109 )2
00°0 SN - €0 BS Swil §nd - 0L0g 4407
000 ald-10 RS SwIL |nd - 0L0S EEl4
§8'16.'e SINT - €0 saleles - 1105 10
g8'L6L'e and - 10 sapeles - 110§ 10
0070 all4-10 T ISIRM BIMS - LYOS HILYM
000 A4~ 10  “UYsel endsay - 9g0s ve0s
000 SNZ-€0  "onAsul - 44O - €205 oS3
98°956 SINF - €0 sslieles - 110G “jdQ @oueinsuj
18'956 ald - 10 seueles - LLOG  “1dQ @ouesnsul
000 SINI-€0 “Tlesauwill fInd - 0L0S snuog ojay
000 al4-10 Ulesawll |nd - 0LOS snuog oney
00°0 SW3-€0 “leSawWiL(ind-QL0§  “Uog Uoisusiey
000 8lid-10 UleSSWILng - 0L0g  TUog uolsusjey
91°680'89 SN - €0 saleles - 110§ 93
95'680'89 and - 10 soleles - 1105 ER!
000 SN -€0 dwod SISO - 020§  “UHUBASIH SSOT
000 8lid-10 rdwodiedyo - 0208 dwoD Jsowo
99'L¥0'6 SIN3 - €0 Saueles - 110§ T SISOYO JBIYD
99'L¥0'6 alld - 10 saueles - 10§ T SISOWO By "9e/SIZ
Hpalo Hqaqg sse|n JUNoIIY owap aweN wnN
9202 ‘g Aenugad siseg [eniooy

uoljoesuel] |euinop [eisuax)
1013SIQ UolIaj0.Id 3l [[epus)y |ojslig

92/90/¢0
INd S0:1



Z abed

6L'v60v82

61°960°v82

Tviol
6176082 61°v60'¥82
09'88%'L a4 - 10 AMA-NUD - LLLL v Bulg loshed fedbuong
657805} a4 - 10 CUeINsul ylesH - 0pL2 vg3aA
99°95/°L€ aid- 10 Bl -MUD - LLLL uoisuad
G8PEY LY a4 - L0 Bl -MYD - LiLL Aunqery xey
1828L'19 alld - 10 A=Y - L1l usodsq 1oang
88°2EL'L9 alld - 10 a4 =YD - LiLL  usodaq 1eang
¥0°518'9 aud-10  Xel swoou[T|-QELE  Xel awoou|
£6°ZL6'gL all4-10  "Uodu|[esepsd - ZLE L SWodu| pa4
9r'SEL'y al4-10 egiePog 33 -gzle  Anosg [ewos
167216 ald-10 "U9S [eR0S I3 - gZLE alesipapy
1129521 ald-10  UoiSuUdd Ubly - LZLE uoisuad
£GPE6'Y al4- 10 yiesH - zZL€ [edipay
12°66G aid- 10 JdN - 92LE JHNI
12°66G aid- 10 JHINT - 9ZLE SN
1G€G2°L 8i4 - 10 oBlY - £21E oBlY
82°€56 ali4 - 10 oBlY - €218 oely
vLLEL'D ald-10  Xepid 33 LSy - 22LE .59
60°802 ald-10  Xejaud 33 LGv - ZZLE isv
65°829°0 alid-10  Xeldid 33 LGY - 22LE /5%
10'8€2'2 alli-10  Xeld 33 LS - 22LE P14
09'88Y'L al4-10  9omueg jolhed - 0906 T Bulpg lioiAed fedbuong
or'eie'ol ali-10  Xeoid 33 JSY - ZZLE LS UOISIA VSH
000 SW3-€0 "SIOOWYOIBIND - 0S0S " U9 JOID
00°0 alld-10 USIOYOBID - 0E0S T JSJIO PID
000 al4-10  uoisued Uply - LZLE uoisuad
1129521 and-10  uoisued Yvly - LZLE uoisuad
o'seLy ald- 10 “UHN09S [B100S - G905 SIRCE
161162 alld-10  UNOSS [BI00g - G905 PO ¥3
$0'G18'8 dl4-10  Xel ®woou] | -0ELE Xl awodu |
£6'216'81 al4-10  "TOJU| [eJOPSH - ZLE "L SWOdU| pa4
or'seL'y elid- 10 e |enos 33 - gzl Aunosg jeos
16'216°C ald- 10 "es{enog 33 - 8ZLE 21B2IP3IN
000 alid- 10 UUSIIED S - $ZLE sjualysiules
000 ali4- 10  uoIsuad Uply - 1Z1E uoisuad
000 ald-10  UYSIED SO - pZLE sjuslysiues
000 al4- 10 LO¥Xd - 22LE ML0¥
000 alld- 10 ebgseaul and - 6EQS JHid
000 alli-10  "T0DJUBYIB - ZHOS diNOD
Hnpain Hqsq sse|D junoosody OW3N aweN wnN
920z ‘g Aenugay siseg [eniaoy

uoljoesuel] [euinop [etsuas)
JoL}SIQ UOIIBJ0Ld Al [[EPUSY [O)SLIg

92/90/¢0
INd S0:1



| abed

9¢°€2Z SINZ - €0 souees - 1105 diNoD
9e'€22 a4 - 10 saueles - 1105 diNOD
00°C eNd- L0 "TOoD 8wl Ued - G205 6601
621182 ald-10 TUSISOHIO JOND - 0E0S uoneseA
ZEVvLY'S aid- 10 soueles - L10S uonese
000 a4~ 10 souees - L10g AepijoH
10'826' SINT - €0 souees - 1105 IS
80°926°C ali4 - 10 saueles - 110 IS
00°0 Sid-10 CTONNSUI - ¥dD - €20 uadwod ¥dD
00°0 ST - €0 SaueleS - 110G “TUOHEIBAMDIS
000 3K - 10 SoueleS - 110G 'TUOHEOBANDIS
000 ST -€0 ""lesswil ling - 0L0S 11
000 ald-10 “Uesewil find - 010§ 1
000 alld- 10 oY [edUyII] - 2€0S 1L
000 ald-10  “UeOonp3 Algnd - 8E0S p3 and
000 all4-10 oo Buwies) - gzos oo Buwres|
18°680°9L SINZ - €0 ssueleS - LL0S 0D swi) Hed
7968091 a4~ 10 saleles - [0S 0D swil Hed
000 an4-10 oD 8wll Hed-Gzog [ uo pleg
00°0 3l4-10 U0 9wl Wed - SZ0S featsAyd
000 Sl4-10 TUODOWBYOSN - ZPOS OO SlUBUIBH
000 and-10 Ulesaun ynd - 0LOS $S8044
000 alid-10 UleSauwll find - 0LOS JOHD
000 ald-10 UlesswiL nd - 010§ 4vsno
000 SINT - €0 ssyeles - 110§ AepijoH
00°0 a4 - 10 saueles - 110G Aepijoy
P°992 SN - €0 saueles - 110§ v
St'992 al4 - 10 saueles - 110G v
96°LYS SINZ - €0 ssuees - 110G 9L
96°LYS alid - 10 saue[es - 110G 9L
000 SINZ - €0 eg awll find - 010G 440%
000 Alld-10 Uleg Wil (ind - 0L0S 440%
$0°'926'7 ST - €0 salees - | 10g 10
$0'926'p alld - 10 selees - 110G 10
000 AUH-L0 T ISIBM MIMS - 110G HALVYA
00°0 al4-10 “YSeL anasay - 9L0G vda0Ss
000 ST -€0  “ongsu| - ¥dD - €205 ISIE!
92°€88 SN - €0 saleles - 110§ 1O soueinsuy;
9z'c88 all4 - 10 saueles - 1105 ~1dO 9oueinsyy
000 SNZ-€0 "TIeS8wil jInd - 0L0S snuog oJjey
000 aAU4-10 S SWiL Ind - 0L0S snuog onsy
00°0 SW3-£0 ""[eSBWIL |In4 - 0L0§  ""og uoisudiey
000 al4-10 UlegsWILINg - 0L0G  TTog uoisudley
90°96%'59 SINT - €0 seleles - 110§ o34
10'96%'G9 all4- 10 salees - 110G o3y
000 SWZ-€0 " 'dwoDJB0WO - 020§  TlUBARIY SSOT
000 aid-10 TdwoDJeoC - 0Z0§  Tdwied Jeoo
81°609'2 SWA - €0 SoUEleS - 110§ T SI90IQ JaID
6.°609°2 ald - 10 solees - LL0S T SISO JOID ZBLIT
Hpain Hnqgaqg sse|o Junoaay OwaN aweN wnn

9202 ‘61 Areniqog

uoljoesuel] [eulnor [elauas)
1913S1Q UOIBJ0.d 314 |[epUS) |o}sLIg

s|seg |eniooy
92/90/¢0

INd S0-L



Z abey

£8'65'6.42

£87656.2

VLOL
£8'¥65°6.2 £8'V65'6.2
L8 vbe ai4-10 A -NUD - LLLL T Bulng jloshed Aedbuons
$6'60SL ald- 10 “emsul yjesH - 0L vd3A
1€°169'LE ald- 10 Sl -MYD - LLLL uoisuad
80'P¥0'2P al4- 10 BI4-MYD - LiLL Aupnqery xet.
68°686'S9 aid- L0 alld-NYD - LiLL  “usodsq oang
06°686'S9 ald- 10 a4 =MD - LLLL  usodeq 108uQ
80°/G.'8 Ali4-10  Xel swooul|-0ELE  Xe] swodu| |
v voL'6l alld- 10  UoduU| [eiSpa4 - BZLE L SWOSU| pad
66651V alld-10 U9g[enog g7 -9Z1Ee  Aunosg [eros
62°106'C all4-10 oS [eog 33 - gZLe aledipaiy
19°eee2L alld-10  uoIsudd Uplp - LZLE uoisuad
£S'vE6'Y a4 - 10 uieaH - sZLe [eatpa
£2°009 and - 10 JdINE - 9Z1LE ]
£2°009 ald- 10 JHINE - 9Z1€ ENT]
16°2€2°1 ald - 10 oByyY - £Z1E oBpy
81'€E6 CHERN) oBlY - £21E orlY
61'¥99'9 al4-10  xelld 33 ISP - 22LE sy
60°802 ald- 10  Xejld I3 LGP - ZZLE sy
§0°526'9 alid- 10  Xxeld 33 ISy - 22LE a.6v
10'8€2°C alld- 10  Xepid 33 ISP - 22LE 1G¥
18'vve al4-10 @omeg jjoihed - 0906 T Buid [loiked fedbuong
19°255'91L - 10  XePid 33 LGP - ZZLE LGP UOISIA VSH
000 SNZ-€0 "SIPOPOJBIND - 0E0S T JROWQ JBIUD
000 all4-10 USISOYOIBIYD - 00§ T 19OUIQ JBID
000 all4-10  UOISUad Ubl - LZLE uoisuad
Lo'eee’zL ald-10  uoisuad Uply - LZLE uolsusd
66651V alld-10 "UHN08S |BISOS - G905 SS u3
621062 alld-10  “TMNO9S |BIS0S - S90S PO Y3
80°/6.'8 8li4-10  Xelswoou||-QELE  Xel awodu( T
8'v9l 6l all4-10  oduj[esepad - ZlLE L dwodu| pag
66651t ai4-10 "8g(e00g 93 -9ZLE  AuUnosg [eroos
621062 al4-10 U8g[ewos 33 - gzZLE aJedipaly
00°0 A4 - 10 TYSIURD SdD - p2LE sjusuwysiues
000 ald-10  uolsuad Uply - LZIE uoisuad
000 aAl4-10 YSIUED SO - YZLE sjuswiysiues
000 and- 10 LOPXd - L2LE MLop
000 aiid- 10 “ebyssaul aud - 6E0S 314
00°0 8i4-~10 "0 OBYISW - ZHOS dINOD
Hpain Hngaq ssej) Jjunoaady [JTTETT] aweN wnN

9202 ‘6l Areniqag

uofjoesuel] |eulnop [eJauax)
J313S1g UoN}I9}0.d il [[epus)y [0)sSiig

siseq [eniooy
92/90/€0

INd S0:1



Financial Report

For the 10 Month(s) Ended February 28, 2026
FISCAL YEAR 2026

- S
o
(%)

.‘%

Page 1 of 11



BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Summary

For the 10 Month(s) Ended February 28, 2026

83% of Fiscal Year

Account Description Total Actual Total Budget % of Budget
REVENUE
Property Tax 8,683,349 8,646,000 100.4%
Ambulance / Response Fees 1,697,222 1,865,000 85.6%
Replacement Tax 24,588 65,000 37.8%
Foreign Fire Insurance 93,961 70,000 134.2%
Interest 315,395 175,000 180.2%
Unrealized Gain/Loss 32,102 - 0.0%
Development Fees 139,617 125,000 111.7%
Donations 550 - 0.0%
Plan Review / CPR /Report Fees 19,494 15,000 130.0%
GEMT Expense Reimbursement (280,967) (500,000) 56.2%
Sale of Assets 4,500 - 0.0%
Misc. Income 155,678 60,000 259.5%
Transfer From Fund 2,285,070 4,570,140 50.0%
Loan Proceeds - ‘ - 0.0%
Grants 48,714 485,000 9.6%
Actual Revenues 13,117,274 15,576,140 84.2%
Budgeted Revenues 15,576,140
% Diff 84%
EXPENDITURES
Personnel 5,263,911 7,317,175 71.9%
Pension Fund Contribution 650,000 650,000 100.0%
Equipment 84,285 147,550 57.1%
R&M 383,601 469,090 81.8%
Administrative 321,325 505,995 83.5%
Medical Supplies 46,827 58,500 80.0%
Utilities 130,827 202,500 64.6%
Insurance 233,801 315,000 74.2%
Foreign Fire 66,177 70,000 94.5%
Memorial Expense 2,577 7,000 36.8%
Actual Expenditures 7,183,331 9,742,810 73.7%
Budgeted Expenditures 9,742,810
% Diff 74%
SURPLUS / (DEFICIT) FROM OPERATIONS 5,933,943 5,833,330 101.7%
CAPITAL EXPENDITURES
Capital Projects 1,253,082 2,115,225 59.2%
Transfer To Funds 2,285,070 4,570,140 50.0%
Actual Expenditures 3,638,152 6,685,365 52.9%
Budgeted Expenditures 6,685,365
% Diff 53%
TOTAL SURPLUS / (DEFICIT) 2,395,791 (852,035) -281.2%
BEGINNING FUND BALANCE 10,068,081
ENDING FUND BALANCE 12,463,872

Page 2 of 11



BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Summary
For the 10 Month(s) Ended February 28, 2026

Revenue Distribution

Unrealized
Gain/Loss
. . 0.3%
F|°re'9" Fire |nterest Plan Review / CPR
nsurance 2.8%
0.8% o /Re%o;to/l:ees
Replacement Tax Misc. Income
0.2% 1.4%
Sale of Assets
0.0%

Ambulance /
Response Fees
14.1%

Property Tax
76.5%

Operational Expenditure Distribution

Medical Supplies
0.7% Utilities
1.8%
Insurance
3.3%

Administrative
4.5%
R&M
5.3%

Foreign Fire
0.9%

Equipment
1.2%

Pension Fund
Contribution
9.0%

Personnel
73.3%

Page 3 of 11



18,000,000

16,000,000

14,000,000

12,000,000

10,000,000

8,000,000

6,000,000

14,000,000

2,000,000

(2,000,000)

BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

Budget vs. Actual Summary

For the 10 Month(s) Ended February 28, 2026

$16,428,175

$13,117,274

$10,721,483

$2,395,791

Revenues

Expenditures

$(852,035)

BYTD O Budget

Page 4 of 11




83% of Fiscal Year

BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Summary
For the 10 Month(s) Ended February 28, 2026

Account Description Fire EMS Operations FFIB Capital Memorial Total Actual Total Budget % of Budget
REVENUE
Property Tax 4,580,314 3,864,985 228,051 - - - - 8,683,349 8,646,000 100%
Ambulance / Response Fees 12,100 1,585,122 - - - - - 1,597,222 1,865,000 86%
Pension Fund Contributions - - - - - - - - - 0%
Repiacement Tax 24,588 - - - - - . 24,588 65,000 38%
Foreign Fire Insurance - - - - 93,961 - - 83,961 70,000 134%
Interest 104,067 3,524 - - 2,957 204,728 130 315,395 175,000 180%
Unrealized Gain/Loss 39,888 - - - - (7.788) - 32,102 - 0%
Development Fees 139,617 - - - - - - 139,617 125,000 2%
Heaith Insurance W/H - - - - - - - - - 0%
Employee Pension Contribution - - - - - - - - - 0%
IITF Reimbursment - - - - - - - - - 0%
Donations 50 - - - - - 500 550 - 0%
Plan Review / CPR /Report Fees 18,284 - - 1,200 - - - 19,494 15,000 130%
GEMT Expense Reimbursement - {280,967) - - - - - {280,967) {500,000) 56%
Sale of Assets 4,500 - - - - - - 4,500 - 0%
Transfer From Fund - - - 213,475 - 2,071,695 - 2,285,070 4,570,140 50%
Loan Proceeds - - - - - - - - - 0%
Grants - - - 23,799 - 22,916 - 46,714 485,000 10%
Misc. Income 119,803 - 32,775 - - 3,000 - 155,678 60,000 269%
Actual Revenues 5,063,311 5,172,664 260,826 238,474 96,819 2,284,451 830 13,117,274 | 16,576,140 84%
R 4,457,000 5,204,000 689,950 242,000 4,913,190 70,000 - 16,676,140
% Diff 113% 99% 38% 99% 2% 3278% 0% 84%
OPERATING EXPENDITURES
Personne! 3,062,772 2,201,139 - - - - - 5,263,911 7,317,176 72%
Pension Fund Contribution 325,000 325,000 - - - - - 650,000 650,000 100%
Equipment 67,684 15,344 - 1,257 - - - 84,285 147,650 57%
R&M 211,080 86,694 - 85,807 - 20 - 383,601 469,080 82%
Administrative 7,432 916 - 312,583 - 394 321,325 505,985 64%
Medical Supplies . 9,582 - 37,246 - - - 46,827 58,500 80%
Utitities - - - 130,827 - - - 130,827 202,500 65%
Insurance - - 231,01 2,780 - - - 233,801 315,000 74%
Foreign Fire - - - - 66,177 - - 66,177 70,000 95%
Memorial Expense - - - - - - 2577 2577 7,000.00 37%
Actual Exg 3,673,968 2,638,675 231,021 570,499 66,177 M 2,577 7,183,331 9,742,810 74%
4,332,930 4,257,930 759,950 315,000 - 70,001 7,000 9,742,810
% Diff 85% 62% 30% 181% 0% 1% 37% 74%
SURPLUS / (DEFICIT) 1,379,343 2,633,988 29,804 (332,025) 30,741 2,294,038 (1,947) 5,833,943 5,833,330 102%
CAPITAL EXPENDITURES
Capital Projects - - - 2,478 - 1,250,604 - 1,253,082 2,115,225 58%
Debt Service - - - - - - - - - 0%
Transfer To Funds 1,062,035 1,223,035 - - - - - 2,285,070 4,570,140 50%
Actual Exp 1,062,035 1,223,035 - 2,478 - 1,250,604 - 3,538,152 6,685,365 53%
d dE 2,124,070 2,446,070 - - 2,115,225 - - 6,685,365
% Diff 50% 50% 0% 0% 0% 0% 0% 53%
Fire EMS o) i FFIB Capital orial Total Actual Total Budget
TOTAL SURPLUS / (DEFICIT) 317,308 1,310,853 29,804 (334,503) 30,741 1,043,434 (1,947) 2,395,791 {852,035)
BEG FUND BAL 4,033,063 3,222,495 367,245 514,906 196,583 1,722,112 11,677 10,068,081
END FUND BAL 4,350,371 4,533,448 397,049 Paotgonhibh 227,324 2,765,646 9,730 12,463,872
Fund Bal to Exp Ratio 92% 17% 172% 3% n/a n/a 378% 116%



BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Summary
For the 7 Month(s) Ended November 30, 2025

BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Detail
February 28, 2026

Monthly Monthly

Revenues

4011 -
4031 -
4041 -
4224 -
4225 -
4310 -
4301 -
4511 -
4605 -
* Plan Review / Permit Fees
+ Public Education Fees

* CPR - Training Income

* Training Reimbursements
- Expense Reimbursements
+ Report / Copy Fees

- Sale of Assets

+ Grants

+ Miscellaneous Income

Tax Levy

Replacement Tax

Foreign Fire Insurance Tax (2%)
Interest - Money Market
Gain/Loss From Investements
Transfer-In

Development Fees-Yorkville
Donations

Response Fees

Total Revenues

Expenditures
Personnel

5011 - Salaries

5012 - Contract Salaries

5045 - Trustee's Compensation

5055 - 401K / IMRF Dist. Contributions
5056 - Pension Fund - Contribution
5060 - Payroll Service

5065 - Social Security & Medicare
7730 - Accident,Sick & Disability

7740 - Health Insurance

Subtotal

Equipment

5165 - Uniforms & Brass

5167 - Uniforms - Mechanic Uniform
5510 - Firefighting Supplies

5520 - Firefighting Equipment

5527 - Equipment - Fire Investigation

Total Budget YTD Total YTD Budget $ Over Budget % of Budget
0.00 720,500.00 8,683,349.26 8,646,000.00 37,349.26 100.43%
0.00 5,416.67 24,588.07 65,000.00 -40,411.93 37.83%
0.00 5,833.33 93,961.12 70,000.00 23,961.12 134.23%
40,167.70 14,583.33 315,395.42 175,000.00 140,395.42 180.23%
2,557.83 0.00 32,101.82 0.00 32,101.82 100.0%
0.00 380,845.00 2,285,070.00 4,570,140.00 -2,285,070.00 50.0%
0.00 10,416.67 139,617.30 125,000.00 14,617.30 111.69%
0.00 0.00 550.00 0.00 550.00 100.0%
129,650.41 155,416.67 1,597,221.83 1,865,000.00 -267,778.17 85.64%
2,635.75 1,250.00 18,973.75 15,000.00 3,973.75 126.49%
113.50 0.00 113.50 0.00 113.50 100.0%
520.00 0.00 520.00 0.00 0.00 100.0%
0.00 0.00 2,250.00 0.00 0.00 100.0%
0.00 -41,666.67 -280,966.55 -500,000.00 0.00 56.19%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
0.00 0.00 4,500.00 0.00 4,500.00 100.0%
23,799.00 40,416.67 46,714.00 485,000.00 -438,286.00 9.63%
36,343.08 5,000.00 153,314.47 60,000.00 93,314.47 255.52%
235,787.27 1,298,011.67 13,117,273.99 15,576,140.00 ~2,458,866.01 84.21%
420,254.93 509,139.58 4,508,958.28 6,109,675.00 -1,600,716.72 73.8%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
0.00 2,708.33 0.00 32,500.00 -32,500.00 0.0%
3,674.46 7,500.00 53,877.99 90,000.00 -36,122.01 59.86%
0.00 54,166.67 650,000.00 650,000.00 0.00 100.0%
1,243.79 0.00 6,575.10 0.00 6,575.10 100.0%
17,744.71 18,333.33 152,801.91 220,000.00 -67,198.09 69.46%
0.00 1,250.00 0.00 15,000.00 -15,000.00 0.0%
52,165.13 70,833.33 541,697.55 850,000.00 -308,302.45 63.73%
495,083.02 663,931.25 5,913,910.83 7,967,175.00 ~2,053,264.17 74.23%
2,201.82 4,041.67 31,122.64 48,500.00 -17,377.36 64.17%
0.00 666.67 3,221.97 8,000.00 -4,778.03 40.28%
295.86 1,708.33 10,229.39 20,500.00 -10,270.61 49.9%
3,137.16 £395 6701 11 32,972.05 51,500.00 -18,527.95 64.02%
0.00 250.00 0.00 3,000.00 -3,000.00 0.0%



BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Summary
For the 7 Month(s) Ended November 30, 2025

BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Detail
February 28, 2026

Monthly Monthly

Total Budget YTD Total YTD Budget $ Over Budget % of Budget
5530 - Station Equipment 0.00 595.83 1,765.79 7,150.00 -5,384.21 24.7%
55301 - Station Equipment - 1 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
55302 - Station Equipment - 2 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
55303 - Station Equipment - 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
5540 - Fire Numbers & Maps 620.00 0.00 1,034.51 0.00 1,034.51 100.0%
6285 - Computer Equipment 68.98 741.67 3,938.21 8,900.00 -4,961.79 44.25%
6285 - Computer Equipment - Other 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
Subtotal 6,323.82 12,295.83 84,284.56 147,550.00 -63,265.44 57.12%
R&M

5560 - Repair & Maintenance Vehicles 2,611.06 20,833.33 53,503.88 250,000.00 -196,496.12 21.4%
5562 + R&M Vehicles 101 0.00 0.00 2,074.25 0.00 2,074.25 100.0%
5563 - R&M Vehicles 102 586.06 0.00 1,284.36 0.00 1,284.36 100.0%
5564 - R&M Vehicles 103 0.00 0.00 1,976.36 0.00 1,976.36 100.0%
5565 - R&M Vehicles 104 471.45 0.00 1,583.39 0.00 1,583.39 100.0%
5566 - R&M Vehicles 121 10,672.48 0.00 15,617.25 0.00 15,517.25 100.0%
5567 - R&M Vehicles 122 195.50 0.00 7,289.45 0.00 7,289.45 100.0%
5568 - R&M Vehicles 123 2,608.09 0.00 33,617.68 0.00 33,617.68 100.0%
5569 - R&M Vehicles 107 0.00 0.00 480.01 0.00 480.01 100.0%
5569 - R&M Vehicles 108 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
5572 - R&M Vehicles 124 3,041.81 0.00 18,516.38 0.00 18,516.38 100.0%
5573 - R&M Vehicles 106 27.96 0.00 27.96 0.00 27.96 100.0%
5576 - R&M Vehicles 131 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
5577 - R&M Vehicles 136 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
5578 - R&M Vehicles 141 0.00 0.00 1,405.78 0.00 1,405.78 100.0%
5579 - R&M Vehicles 142 0.00 0.00 91.62 0.00 91.62 100.0%
5580 - R&M Vehicles 143 0.00 0.00 3,777.34 0.00 3,777.34 100.0%
5581 - R&M Vehicles 144 0.00 0.00 6,732.04 0.00 6,732.04 100.0%
5582 - R&M Vehicles 145 0.00 0.00 498.09 0.00 498.09 100.0%
5590 - R&M Vehicles 151 0.00 0.00 8,565.51 0.00 8,565.51 100.0%
5591 - R&M Vehicles 158 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
5592 - R&M Vehicles 156 0.00 0.00 9,187.11 0.00 9,187.11 100.0%
5594 - R&M Vehicles 161 0.00 0.00 3,523.48 0.00 3,523.48 100.0%
5595 - R&M Vehicles 162 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
5598 - R&M Vehicles 175 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
5600 - R&M Vehicles 177 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
5602 - R&M Vehicles 181 58.86 0.00 25,262.12 0.00 25,262.12 100.0%
5605 - R&M Boats and Trailer 0.00 0.00 55.59 0.00 55.59 100.0%
5608 - R&M Shop Supplies 0.00 P&tR.670f 11 4,585.28 5,000.00 -414.72 91.71%
5609 + R&M - Shop Tools 103.73 833.33 12,958.86 10,000.00 2,958.86 129.59%



5610
5615
5620
5625
7100

+ Repair & Maintenance Equipment
* R&M Electronic Equipment

* R&M Personal Protective Equip

+ Fuel - Vehicles

+ Repair & Maintenance

71001 - Repair & Maintenance - 1
71002 - Repair & Maintenance - 2
71003 - Repair & Maintenance - 3
7100 - Repair & Maintenance - Other

Admin
5130
5135

Subtotal

+ Legal & Accounting
- Station Supplies

51351 - Station Supplies - 1
51352 - Station Supplies - 2
51353 - Station Supplies - 3
5135 - Station Supplies - Other

5140

+ Office Supplies -Op

51401 - Office Supplies - 1
51402 - Office Supplies - 2
51403 - Office Supplies - 3
5140 - Office Supplies -Op - Other

5145 -
5535 -
5545 -
5690 -
5700 -
5705 -

5720

5725 -
5736 -
5737 -
5740 -
5742 -
5750 -
7110 -

Postage/Shipping

Station Furnishings - Other
Membership Appreciation Expense
Travel / Meeting Expenses
Education - Tuitions

Education - Supplies & Equip

+ Education - Conferences
Education - Travel Expenses
Education - CPR - Cards
Training Computers & Software
Dues & Subscriptions

Public Education Supplies
Dispatching Fees

Cleaning Supplies

71101 - Cleaning Supplies - 1
71102 - Cleaning Supplies - 2
71103 - Cleaning Supplies - 3

BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Summary
For the 7 Month(s) Ended November 30, 2025

BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Detail

February 28, 2026

“Wonthly .~ = Wonthly

Total Budget YTD Total YTD Budget $ Over Budget % of Budget
30.74 1,432.50 15,183.54 17,190.00 -2,006.46 88.33%
0.00 0.00 59.30 0.00 59.30 100.0%
0.00 516.67 704.28 6,200.00 -5,495.72 11.36%
6,873.59 7,500.00 68,500.98 90,000.00 -21,499.02 76.11%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
4,500.04 5,442.00 50,061.60 65,304.00 -15,242.40 76.66%
512.72 1,020.38 10,888.42 12,244.50 -1,356.08 88.93%
736.60 1,095.96 20,115.14 13,151.50 6,963.64 152.95%
0.00 0.00 5,573.49 0.00 5,573.49 100.0%
33,030.69 39,090.83 383,600.54 469,090.00 -85,489.46 81.78%
3,433.54 8,750.00 45,277.34 105,000.00 -59,722.66 43.12%
0.00 541.67 0.00 6,500.00 -6,500.00 0.0%
75.95 0.00 872.54 0.00 872.54 100.0%
0.00 0.00 376.82 0.00 376.82 100.0%
0.00 0.00 270.43 0.00 270.43 100.0%
0.00 0.00 2,822.59 0.00 2,822.59 100.0%
0.00 125.00 0.00 1,500.00 -1,500.00 0.0%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
0.00 0.00 37.00 0.00 37.00 100.0%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
0.00 0.00 2,082.99 0.00 2,082.99 100.0%
254.63 141.67 1,331.03 1,700.00 -368.97 78.3%
234.87 1,533.33 20,300.00 18,400.00 1,900.00 110.33%
94.82 833.33 1,979.04 10,000.00 -8,020.96 19.79%
0.00 333.33 168.60 4,000.00 -3,831.40 4.22%
7,523.83 5,083.33 25,521.41 61,000.00 -35,478.59 41.84%
0.00 333.33 525.37 4,000.00 -3,474.63 13.13%
90.00 416.67 1,651.56 5,000.00 -3,348.44 33.03%
0.00 416.67 3,676.16 5,000.00 -1,323.84 73.52%
0.00 0.00 768.75 0.00 768.75 100.0%
0.00 0.00 129.95 0.00 129.95 100.0%
1,100.00 74.58 3,072.90 895.00 2,177.90 343.34%
79.87 1,250.00 11,050.46 15,000.00 -3,949.54 73.67%
0.00 4,000.00 43,725.94 48,000.00 -4,274.06 91.1%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
672.60 333.33 5,369.84 4,000.00 1,369.84 134.25%
302.82 P3323.3%f 11 3,384.15 4,000.00 -615.85 84.6%
253.58 333.33 6,749.87 4,000.00 2,749.87 168.75%



BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Summary
For the 7 Month(s) Ended November 30, 2025

BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Detail
February 28, 2026

Monthly Monthly

Total Budget YTD Total YTD Budget $ Over Budget % of Budget

7110 - Cleaning Supplies - Other 0.00 0.00 1,132.00 0.00 1,132.00 100.0%
7120 - Copy / Fax Lease 497.80 416.67 5,001.74 5,000.00 1.74 100.04%
7150 - Software Maintenance 2,875.00 8,500.00 86,961.55 102,000.00 -15,038.45 85.26%
7170 - Computer Equipment Repair -100.55 83.33 0.00 1,000.00 -1,000.00 0.0%
71701 - Computer Equipment Repair - 1 39.85 0.00 39.85 0.00 39.85 100.0%
71703 - Computer Equipment Repair - 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
7170 - Computer Equipment Repair - Oth 100.55 0.00 100.55 0.00 100.55 100.0%

7200 - News Letter & Web Site Expenses 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
7250 - Employee Testing & Vaccinations 2,988.60 6,666.67 45,000.09 80,000.00 -34,999.91 56.25%
7255 - New Hire & Promotional Testing 0.00 0.00 1,905.60 0.00 1,905.60 100.0%
Countywide Fire Records Management Syst 0.00 1,666.67 0.00 20,000.00 -20,000.00 0.0%
7999 - Miscellaneous Expenses 0.00 0.00 39.00 0.00 39.00 100.%
Subtotal 20,517.76 42,166.25 321,325.12 505,995.00 -184,669.88 63.5%

Medical
6260 - Medical Supplies - Reusable 750.00 166.67 6,505.94 2,000.00 4,505.94 325.3%
6265 - Medical Supplies - Non-Reusable 4,214.41 2,083.33 17,692.19 25,000.00 -7,307.81 70.77%
6270 - Oxygen - Other 2,323.29 2,000.00 21,725.15 24,000.00 -2,274.85 90.52%
6275 - Medications 0.00 208.33 0.00 2,500.00 -2,500.00 0.0%
6275 - Medications - Other 0.00 0.00 904.15 0.00 904.15 100.0%
6280 - MedMedical Equipment 0.00 416.67 0.00 5,000.00 -5,000.00 0.0%
Subtotal 7,287.70 4,875.00 46,827.43 58,500.00 -11,672.57 80.05%
Utilities

7010 - Electric 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
70101 - Electric - 1 1,720.50 2,916.67 21,109.11 35,000.00 -13,890.89 60.31%
70102 - Electric - 2 757.53 1,458.33 7,964.03 17,500.00 -9,635.97 45.51%
70103 - Electric - 3 914.41 1,458.33 8,859.97 17,500.00 -8,640.03 50.63%
7020 - Gas 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
70201 - Gas -1 2,240.45 958.33 8,652.71 11,500.00 -2,947.29 74.37%
70202 - Gas - 2 786.84 47917 3,128.70 5,750.00 -2,621.30 54.41%
70203 - Gas - 3 976.36 479.17 4,047.90 5,750.00 -1,702.10 70.4%
7030 - Sewer & Water 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
70301 - Sewer & Water - 1 873.28 229.17 4,586.02 2,750.00 1,836.02 166.76%
70302 - Sewer & Water - 2 588.66 114.58 2,776.02 1,375.00 1,401.02 201.89%
70303 - Sewer & Water - 3 898.22 114.58 4,371.24 1,375.00 2,996.24 317.91%
7050 - Telephone 0.00 1,562.50 0.00 18,750.00 -18,750.00 0.0%
70501 - Telephone - 1 3,483.23 4,687.50 37,478.51 56,250.00 -18,771.49 66.63%
70502 - Telephone - 2 0.00 Page.omf 11 10.51 0.00 10.51 100.0%

70503 - Telephone - 3 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%



BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Summary
For the 7 Month(s) Ended November 30, 2025

BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT
Budget vs. Actual Detail
February 28, 2026

Monthly Monthly

Total Budget YTD Total YTD Budget $ Over Budget % of Budget
7050 - Telephone - Other 358.00 0.00 12,823.06 0.00 12,823.06 100.0%
7060 - Data and Television 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
70601 - Data and Television - 1 739.95 2,083.33 2,272.88 25,000.00 ~22,727.12 9.09%
70602 - Data and Television - 2 10.48 0.00 62.88 0.00 62.88 100.0%
70603 - Date and Television - 3 0.00 0.00 736.65 0.00 736.65 100.0%
7060 - Data and Television - Other 0.00 0.00 12,046.53 0.00 12,046.53 100.0%
7070 - Alarm Monitoring 0.00 333.33 0.00 4,000.00 -4,000.00 0.0%
Subtotal 14,347.91 16,875.00 . 130,826.72 202,500.00 -71,673.28 64.61%
Insurance
7705 - General Liability Insurance 56,434.25 4,583.33 56,661.25 55,000.00 1,661.25 103.02%
7720 - Umbrella /Excess Liability Ins. 8,830.00 1,250.00 8,830.00 15,000.00 -6,170.00 58.87%
7750 - Workmens Compensation Insurance 18,819.00 20,416.67 168,310.00 245,000.00 -76,690,00 68.7%
Subtotal 84,083.25 26,250.00 233,801.25 315,000.00 ~81,198.75. 74.22%
Foreign Fire :
5170 - Annual Station Disbursement 1,010.10 5,833.33 66,177.45 70,000.00 -3,822.55 94.54%
1,010.10 5,833.33 66,177.45 70,000.00 -3,822.85 94.54%
Memorial Expense
8060 - Charitable Donations 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
8200 - Firemen's Park Expenses 0.00 583.33 2,577.086 7,000.00 -4,422.94 36.82%
Subtotal 0.00 583.33 2,577.08 7,000.00 -4,422.94 36.82%
Capital
8000 - Capital Projects 59,139.30 122,281.67. 808,849.05 1,467,500.00 -658,650.95 55.12%
6280 - Medical Equipment -319.82 12,833.33 133,501.67 154,000.00 -20,498.33 86.69%
8160 - PPE Capital 2,148.00 14,666.67 91,131.75 176,000.00 -84,868.25 51.78%
8285 - Computer Equipment Capital 21,535.00 4,393.75 35,690.64 52,725.00 -17,134.36 67.5%
8525 + Apparatus 7,270.00 8,333.33 80,473.69 100,000.00 -19,526.31 80.47%
8538 - Equipment Purchases over $5,000 0.00 13,750,00 103,535.18 165,000.00 -61,464.82 62.76%
8010 - Debt Service 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.0%
8020 + Transfer Out 0.00 380,845.00 2,285,070.00 4,570,140.00 -2,285,070.00 50.0%
Subtotal 89,772.48 557,113.75. 3,5638,151.98 6,685,365.00 -3,147,213.02 52.92%
Total Expenditures "T751,456.73 1,363,181.25 10,721,482.94 16,428,175.00 -5,706,692.06 65.26%
Net Income -515,669.46 -65,169.58 2,395,791.05 -852,035.00 3,247,826.05 -281.18%

Page 10 of 11



BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

Budget vs. Actual Summary
For the 10 Month(s) Ended February 28, 2026

Bristol-Kendall Fire Protection District

Investments
February 28, 2026

Bank Account Current Rate Book Balance
First National - CK 3048 1.46% 436,784
First National - FFIB CK 0353 1.46% 4,288
First National - MM (EMS) 8274 1.97% 205,169
First National - MM (FFIB) 6591 1.97% 225,966
First National - MM (Memorial) 0220 1.97% 10,970
Charles Schwab - Investments 9163 N/A 5,010,060
Charles Schwab - Building Investr 2959 N/A 1,030,755
Charles Schwab - Capital Investm 1789 N/A 5,609,096
Total $ 12,533,088

First National - CK

3.5%

Charles Schwab - =
Capital Investments_{
44.8%

Charles Schwab -

First National - MM

Building Investmetr

Page 11 of 11

(EMS)

1.6%

First National - MM

(FFIB)

1.8%

First National - MM
(Memorial)

0.1%

Charles Schwab -
Investments
40.0%



920T ‘ST ATeNIqay PIpUH (S)YIUoIN O 93 10
SISAJeUY TeIoueur]

IPLISI(] UOI}D3301J SIL] [[epuUd-[0ISLIg



198png Jo 9%0CT 10 F6F'61¢ PIdR[[0D -
S99 110daY /YD / MITAY ue[]

13png Jo %081 10 G6L'STE PAIdSI0D -
}SaI91U]

193png Jo 9%98 10 T7TL6GT$ PRIR[I0D -
S99, Iduenqury

198png Jo %001 I0 6F£'€89°8$ PAIdR[0D -
soxe], Ayodor]

(szoysuer; feurayur oN) w@@ﬁsm 107, Jjo %86 10 “WON\NWW\OH% U@wU@EOU

Teax 393png Jo %¢3

SJUSIYSIL] SNUSAY



SAANAATY

%8 7da %
OY1°9LS"ST sanuLAYY patedpng

%0T L6701 %P8 0PT9LSST WES::: SONULAYY [ENIOY

%LYT 998 %Y %65CT 000°09 w%ﬁﬁ woou] “OSTIA
%€95C YSL'1 %01 000°58% miﬁﬁ sjue1n)
%0 - %0 - Hl SPa9001J UBO]
%SEl 0£8°€L6 %05 OPT0LS Y mosﬁmwmﬁm pun, wox IaJsuer]
%0 - %0 - Woo? $108SV JO oles
%0V~ L8SUIT %9S (000°005) Wpomdw@ Juswes MUy asuadxy JINAO
%ELL PPIL %0€1 000°ST Wgta $99 110doy/ YD / MeIAY Ue[d
%98~ 010F %0 - om S SuoOnBUO(]
%8 00S°v6 %11 000°5C1 W:qmﬁ $09,] Juowrdoreas
%98- LSS°6TT %0 - WmSnmm SSOT/uren) pazifearu )
%ES $€T90C %081 000°SLT wm@mﬁ € 1se107U]
%0€ 6C1°TL. %PeEl 000°0L msqm@ S0UBINSU] OIT U110 ]
%9~ 0€2°9¢C %8¢ 00059 Wwwﬂ& xe] juswaoe[doy
%61 €SE°0L0°T %98 000°698°1 WNNS%J $99 ssuodsay / eoue[nquIy
%9 LYTTTT'8 %001 000°9v9°8 Wﬁmnm%ﬂw xe], Kadoig

Jeax Jeox Jseg 198png 198png [e)0L [en)dVy )01, uondrLIdsa( Junoddy
JSBT WOoay : Jo 9,
(@a@)/pur

SONUIAJY



0SL'88  OSL'€IT  LI¥'SST  108png "DAV
S6T'I6  SS8ETT  TTL'6ST DAV
PCO0CAd ™ STOCAdO 970CAdm 06€°L6 I1S€°08C :.a<
> L & & 66€TOT  €SS°GET YoTeIN
> ové@ @»%\w @00@/ & & %@O S
Y = ] 08I°VCI  TYLL9T  0S9°6TI ATeniqa 1
- R 1B 10 §
% | m m (Ivv'ov)  T18'9¥T  €65°81C ATenuef
- 8|18 g 00005
L m 8LSOET  TTOSLT  €LT'SLI 3quI0d(]
_W_l | w 00000T  ZpS'yTl  YIT'69T  L86°861 I2qUIdAON
m ooo'ost  LILOIT  (bO¥'8IT)  TIT'LET 1240100
st wes | i LOTT6  L9EOTT  OVS'E0T 1oquisidog
: 00000
b O e 965T9  688°TTI  698°0ST Jsn3ny
i €658TC
: U0 pe0'IL  LLIT6 898°01 Ay
ooo'00s  8ELCOT  66£°98 TI89¢1 sunf
suopa9||03 8LS60T  ¥IT8OL  BIv'ewl KeN
PT0TAd  STOTAA  9T0TAA YIUOTA

(5994 TINFD Jo 19U 627 /92Ad) S H =ouenquiy



%S 9L
xe| Auadoid

%l ¥l
S99
asuodsey / souenquiy

%¥’L
awoou| "SI
%0

S99 Hoday/
ddO / M3InSY ueld

%<0
Xe| juswaoe|day

%80

souelnsu| all4 ubiaio
%<0 %8'C

SSO7/ules) pazijeaiun }saiau|

uonnqLISI(] SNUIAJY

SONUIAJY]



SIOTYBA ‘FOT'CLS o
rended 3dd ‘$86°88% o
juswade[day surdug 'CYS69$ .

P 9PIYSA “88Y'TCE o
juauwreoe[day JOOY ‘780°9674 e
934G BunIsTy Uonels aILy 966°707%

yuswdmby TestpaIN ‘CHC TETS

198png Jo 966 10 780'¢ST a -
syoelorg reyidey o

198png Jo %69 10 /7R0CT$ -
SOOI e

198png Jo %¥9 10 GTE ITES -
ATIENSIUTWPY

18png Jo %78 10 109¢8cs -
adUeUSJUIRIA] pue sitedoy e

13png Jo 97/ 10 T16°€9T°SE -
[PUUOSID

1o3png Jo %%/ 10 TEC'C8T/$
sormrpuadxyg Sunerad(y
Ted X 193png Jo %¢g

SISIYSIH Smyrpuadxy



%ES 7da %
$9£°689°9 samyipuadxg paje3png
%9¢ 17€965°C %E€S G9€°$89°9 Wmﬁnwmmhm sermpuadxy [enoy
%SEl 0£8°€L6 %08 0PT0LS Wosﬁmwmﬁm Spun,j oJ, Iejsuel],
%001~ viv8rl %0 - 901AIRG 195(]
%S1- L60VLY T %6S STTSIIT meoﬁmmﬁ s1oelo1q reyde)
| STINLIANAIXA TVLIIdVD
Wxi Ta %
0I8ChL'6 sarmipuadxy pajespng
%01 6119059 %bL 018TYL'6 ﬁ €E°E8TL sermipuadxy [enjoy
%€9 851 %LE 000°L WRQN asuadxy [eLOWaA
%LYT SP061 %56 000°0L WRS@ ax1 u31e10]
%81- $85°98¢ %bL 000°S1€ mswnmmm oouEISU]
%L~ LIT°THI %S9 005°20C wmwﬁoﬂ senIuN
%2 0l+'8¢ %08 005°8S w%é sorpddng [eorpoy
%]1- 18T°vC¢ %9 $66°50S WNSNM SATJENSTUTWPY
%ET Y60°CIE %8 060°69t woqmwm Y
%6~ pIS P91 %LS 0SS°Ly1 WM&% yuawdmbgy
%0¢ 000005 %001 000°059 Wooqo@ UonNqLIuoy) pun, UoISuSJ
%Cl 16V°LIL Y %CL SLILTEL H 16°€9C°S [ouuosIog
. SAYNLIANAIXA ONIIVIAIO
Jeax JBox IS 193png 193png [e)oL [en)OV [B10L wondLIdSI( JUN0dIY
jser] woay Jo o,
(Gaq@)pug

saInjipuadxyg



%E €L
[suuosied

%06
uonnqguIuoY
pun4 uoisuad

%C’L
Juswdinbg

%6°0
all4 ublaio4 %e'C

(o]
ks

%E'E
aouelnsu|
%S'¥
%8’ aAljeISIUIWLPY
seniIN %, 0

sal|ddng [eolIps|y

uonnqrysi(q amrpuadxy reuoneradp

saInjrpuadxyg



yoyaq / sN|dINS == SaUIN)IPUSAXJ=fll=  SONUSNSY =p=m woyaq / snidins o sainypuadx3m senuanay @

9202 5202 920¢ Gcoc
PR | T 000'000‘
- ety 0000002
16.'GBEC . - ¢ c
000'000"
000'000‘9 ok
000'000°8
+ 000'000'8
0000000}
- 000'000°0}
000°000°Z
000'000‘%}
0000007}
%911 %8.¢€ e/u e/u %LE %cll %L1 %6 oijey dx3 o} [eg pun4
'2/8'€oV'Cl 0€L'6 o¥G'G9/C veclic cov' 08l 6%70°L6€ 8YY' €Sy LIS 0SEV 7vda ANN4 aN3
Mrwo.moo.or 11911 2Lzl €8G'961 906'¥LS G¥Z'L9€ G6¥'22Z's  €90'€£0‘'v 7vda ANN4 939
L6L'seec  (Lv6°L) vev'evo'L LvLog (cos‘vyee) Vo862 €66'0LE‘L  80€‘LLE (LI12143a) / SN1dYNS TV.LOL
|en}oy [ejo]  [eLIOWS|\ ey ded qa144 suoneladQ adueinsuj SIN3 allq

920¢ ‘1€ Arenue[ psapuy (S)UIuoN 0T 9Y} 104
duefeq puny



%0°0%
SIUSWIISAAU| - GEMYIS S3j4eY)

%T°0
(leiows )
NN - [eUOIEN 1S4

%8'T
(g144)
INIA - |euoiie 1s114

(SIN3)

ININ - [eUORIeN 15114

%C'8
1UBWISaAU|
3UIp|Ing - qemyds ssjey)

%877
SIUSWISOAU|
|ende) - gemyods sajiey)

%S°€

YD - [euonen 3sui4

880°C€S‘Zl |ejol
960'609'S V/N 681  sjuswisaAu| [eyde) — qemyss sajey)
GG/'0€0'L V/N 6SG6C  Sluswisanu| Buipling — gemyss sspey)
090°0L0°‘S V/N €916 SJUSWISaAU| - geMyoS ssapiey)
060l %161 0220 (ledows\) ININ - [euonEeN }siiq
996°62¢ %16 1659 (d144) ININ - [euonen 3sui
691°G0¢2 %161 ¥/28 (SIN3) ININ - [euoneN s
88Z'Y %9%" | €G€0 MO 444 — leuonen 1s.i4
78.'9¢h %9%"L 8¥0¢ MO - [euoneN isii
aduejeg )Yoog o)y juaaing JUNoddYy jueg

SJUSWI}SIAU]



Paramedic Services of Illinois, Inc.

Invoice

One Pierce Place, Suite 750W Dot o
Itasca, IL 60143
2/28/26 9562
Bill To
BRISTOL-KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION
DISTRICT
103 E. BEAVER STREET
YORKVILLE, iL 60560-1704
Terms Due Date
Net 15 Days 03/15/26
Quantity Description Amount
Total February 2026 Income (IL. 108) $ 147,893.08
INTEREST EARNED -FEB (NO fees) $ 155.51
REFUNDS PAID : $101.47 -$101.47
Income - Park Ridge Bank $147.891.61
GEMT Portion Excluded from Billing Fee - $ 27,325.97
EFTS Directly paid to BK:
2/25/26 $428.81
Total EFTS paid direct to BK: $ 428.81
Total for 5% Billing Charge $ 120.994.45
5% Billing Charge (on $) 120,994.45 -$6,049.72
Pavable to Bristol-Kendall -$141,997.40
Total $0.00




ES°TV6'ES
06°¥6T'TTS

60'v08°2$
26°T1S'19$
SLI9VSTITS
T0°008'TTS
90°269%

LTSLY'Lrs
96°STY LEVS

2:3:0
00°0$
0L°0€2'V8TS
00°055°2$
8TBEE'EVES

S1viol

Adewwns 3uijjig jenuuy

920¢
PUISIQ UOII31044 .14 |[epUBY-[OIslig

zz281°1$
ST°L45'2S

16°VELS
L8°99€'8€S

€2°0L6°0TS
95°9L9%
61°108°Z$
SL'SPT'ETS

VEEI06ZZS. |

18°65L°2%
SLLY9'8S
81°695'2$
SO'9YT'ELS
SL'9PS'I9TS
BL'6285

3A0qe woy sJuRWISHIpY |230)
5334 SUOIPI|jo)
Ipy dwo) sueunyiom

SpunIY
sjuaunsnipy Juapisay
SUORIDJ|0) 03 JuRS
Hoaaum
3duernsuj
VA
PlEApaN
enpaN
Suaunsnipy
pauaes 3sa193u]

it 03 AR22:1p pred suopdsjod
SUORR3}{0D Sulig 2.4 oL
FUCIIO) IdueNqUIY [enPY [e30)
PajjrE Junpg 2.4 je3or
Pa|I!g Junowy [e301.




L6°S2E° [T $ 92'569C $ €2'1200e$
66°299°'CT S
2C'195C $ vpeer's $ z8'ive $ P6°SIT $ 9T0/v's$ € 9202 514401
LLTOTTT $ ©9°e02'ze $ wrivee $ zoser $ £6°05S'vzs ct 9¢0c LCYOV
JWYPamMQIapIAGLd  SSBAIOUILWADION  JWYIWGIUS9ald 9)BYIWS93Id  JWVPIEGIEIOL SIJIIS  IESAIBPUSIED PI0Id

920¢ Aieniged L W39 - 11epus)) j01sug

-LW3Q SJH 03384 8nQ unouwy 1e10}

Tiepusa) 101slg
nepus) joisug
aweNJapiaolg



Monthly Investment Performance Report

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District

Presented by:

Thomas S. Sawyer, Managing Partner
John J. Falduto, Managing Partner
Edward J. Lavin, Chief Investment Officer

SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Sawyer Falduto Asset Management, LLC
589 S. York Street
Elmhurst, IL 60126
0: (630) 941-8560
www.sawyerfalduto.com

As of February 28, 2026




SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Table of Contents

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection DiStrict - OPerations FUNG ........cc.ececeiiiriririeieteisieit sttt e sttt b st e s st b bt e bbb aseaeseseseseeesnsbenes 3
ACCOUNT OVEIVIEW ..ttt bbb bbb bbb bbb b e RS b b e bbb e b e R8s b e b s b e b b e s b e b e bbb e b e b e b e b e b e bbb bbb b e bbb bbb 3
PEIFOIMANCE HISTOIY ...viiiiitiiiisiiisiecistise sttt ettt st e b e b e e e e e R R s e b e e b e R et e s e b e b e e b e s e b en s e b e ebe s e ke be e e beae b ese et e be s et ebebe b ebennebentts 4
BONT ANGIYSIS .eveuieviiesiriiiieteerte ettt st et st sbe st s s beb et s b e s e seebe saebe b e ebe s e b ebe s e eaebes b e s e st ebes e s ebes e bebeRs e b e R e s e R et e Re e b e R b e be R e R e eb ek e e b eReehe R e bebeR e be R e s e b e Re s et e b e R e b e e e b nes 5
HOIAINES vttt sttt sttt e b e e b a e s e e e e e saesa e s e e b e e se b ansesaeseaReebeshessesaesessersenserseseeReeRse s essesserseshesbeeheeben s e bebsebesbeebenaeseetenberenseraere s 6
i [ ol Lo gL Y 7

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - CApital FUNG ......cccccvevieiirisieneiisereeseeesesse s sa e e s e sbese s s esee e ebesbeebesbaesesssessessessessessssesssssessensensesansensesessensessenses 8
ACCOUNTIOVEIVIEW sossnsssivsrsssssssvmsissonsossanissssmsosssyss sesssisssoisssssss somosessemsyons svvassssEuess oouy s oss 0o a3 oA SR Eu R oo a s o0 SV SH SN SN e F OSSO ON SR SRR RS TR 8
PErfOrMANCE HISTOMY' sissinsssursusssvusssssvivionisvsvs sussse iy esssuenssssvassssss sy syt ans sissdssssas s ssysssmsmssvnssssssAvse S5 63T S TR F R USSR SR SO ST B S UR SV HO RSB AHs s RN 9
BONT ANAIYSIS :ssusvuvssssensonevivuovinnessssress s seesssssssms s s ssdiesssessssuessssvess 5ot s susrev s sy vsn s su oy oA SR SR S T AR F RS SR S RN S S PO PR S VAR 10
L6 11
TranSaCtONS, wssseisssssessuessisssssssusssnisssms sneesssssvismesssss s ooiesisssyeEss o086 s¥8 48 EFSREE RS FERE SR A Fo S EE S SE TR TNV AH SRR RN aH S S H e TSR U HH R PSR TV EVREs oo P H VAT SRRSO SO RO S H e F Gaa R 13

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Bullding Capital cuisssisessmsisssssssommsminsnss i sssss sssieissssrssnssias s s osss0as svus sessiass vavssonasmesosneasssussoshesussunsnsanss 14
ACCOUNt OVEIVIEW: sussusessussusserssvsssssveisssssssins s ioersisssnssonss00asus o saessusnsaiussiossmissvsonsss s sunesuisvensves oo ieeses Ron e uiss sosRes oY EE s am o O oo s s AR N o s owaviny 14
Performance HISTOTY cssimsaissmmessssvsniossnesscosmsssssssmsissssasssisisessensss soiasssssssnsssusvssssssssesssoses sossseossssvssssssssvaass sssssssnsssnsossos oassvasvssmssonvsuavmsvimvaesvasmisssvsnens 15
HOIAINGS sssssmmsmemsnsmsmmsssmmnmssosmvms e o s aes o s o S s s P TR e Ao T VA S oo T S e o SR AT A Ve S SR T e A T ar s T oA S e e S W v an s 16
Transactions srasvarmssss s T T AT Y e Fro T R Th o T T ST TR AT oAb T TR BT Do R A PSR ET  S R R R 17

FiXEd INCOME MATKET UPUATE ...vouiiiiiiiiiiiitiee ettt h et e b bbb bbb et b s bbb e bbb e e b et et e b et b b et b b e b e bt s 18

There may be a slight difference in the ending value between this report and the Schwab statement due to accrued income, timing of transactions,
and/or rounding. The Schwab statement continues to be the official custodial record for the account.

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 2 of 18 As of February 28, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Account Overview

Portfolio Allocation

Cash Flow Review

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Operations Fund

Subsector

Current Current
Value Percent

B U.S. Treasury
{7 ICash Equivalent

Total

$2,028,232 44.8%
$2,495,815 55.2%

$4,524,047 100.0%

Inception to Date

Month to Date Quarter to Date Year to Date (11/8/2023)
Beginning Market Value $5,609,610 $6,095,018 $6,095,018 S0
Contributions / Additions S0 S0 S0 $28,214,268
Distributions ($1,100,000) ($1,600,000) ($1,600,000) (524,450,000)
Capital Appreciation $3,311 $7,808 $7,808 $274,314
Income/Expenses $12,044 $18,285 $18,285 $503,700
Change in Accrued (5917) $2,936 $2,936 (518,235)
Ending Market Value $4,524,047 $4,524,047 $4,524,047 $4,524,047
Investment Gain $14,438 $29,029 $29,029 $759,779
Projected Income
Description Q2 2026 Q3 2026 Q4 2026 Q12027 Total
U.S. Treasury $18,581 $18,581
Cash Equivalent $22,150 $22,150 $22,150 $22,150 $88,600
Total $40,731 $22,150 $22,150 $22,150 $107,181
Projected Income and Maturities
Description Q2 2026 Q3 2026 Q4 2026 Ql 2027 Total
U.S. Treasury $1,009,581 $1,009,581
Cash Equivalent $22,150 $22,150 $22,150 $22,150 $88,600

$22,150 $22,150

$1,098,181

$1,031,731

$22,150

Information in this report was compiled using data from the custodian available as of the publishing date. While we believe the data to be reliable, we
do not independently verify pricing and valuation data. Please refer to the official statements provided by the account custodian. All date period
references are on a calendar year basis. Fiscal year reports are available by request. Past performance does not guarantee future investment results.

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District

SFAM Page 3 of 18

As of February 28, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO
ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Performance History

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Operations Fund

Start Value Inflows Outflows End Value Investment G':ier:
Since Inception
First Quarter 2026 $6,095,018 S0 ($1,600,000) $4,524,047 $29,029
Fourth Quarter 2025 $7,322,003 $205,769 ($1,500,000) $6,095,018 $67,246
Third Quarter 2025 $6,926,701 $3,886,524 ($3,550,000) $7,322,003 $58,777
Second Quarter 2025 $5,188,740 $4,599,728 ($2,900,000) $6,926,701 $38,233
First Quarter 2025 $6,827,602 S0 ($1,700,000) $5,188,740 $61,138
Fourth Quarter 2024 $10,553,539 $228,918 ($4,050,000) $6,827,602 $95,145
Third Quarter 2024 $9,571,792 $3,704,838 ($2,850,000) $10,553,539 $126,909
Second Quarter 2024 $8,735,342 $4,288,491 ($3,550,000) $9,571,792 $97,959
First Quarter 2024 $10,477,709 S0 ($1,850,000) $8,735,342 $107,633
Fourth Quarter 2023 S0 $11,300,000 ($900,000) $10,477,709 $77,709
Since Inception Total S0 $28,214,268 ($24,450,000) $4,524,047 $759,779

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District

SFAM Page 4 of 18

As of February 28, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Bond Analysis

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Operations Fund

150.0%
100.0%
50.0%
0.0%
2026
B Percent of Fixed Income
Maturity by Year
Yield to Yield to
Current Maturity Maturity Modified
Weight Description Principal Value Yield (Cost) (Market) Duration
100.0% U.S. Treasury $2,016,000 $2,028,232 1.8% 4.0% 3.5% 0.1

' 100.0% Total e ) 016/0008 52028232

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 5 of 18 As of February 28, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Holdings

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Operations Fund

Yield
Maturity Current to Maturity Annual
Weight Description Symbol Date Quantity Value Yield (Market) Income
Fixed Income
Taxable Bonds
U.S. Treasury
22.6% US Treasury Bill 912797PV3 3/19/2026 1,025,000.00 $1,023,245 0.0% 3.3% S0
03/19/2026
22.2% US Treasury Note 91282CGV7  4/15/2026 991,000.00 $991,000 3.8% 3.7% $37,163
04/15/2026 | 3.750%
Accrued Income $13,987
44.8% Fixed Income Total $2,028,232 1.8% 3.5% $37,163
Cash Equivalent
Cash Equivalent
Cash Equivalent
0.0% Schwab Government SWGXX $718 3.3% $24
Money Fund
55.2% Schwab Treasury Money SCOXX $2,495,097 3.6% $88,576
Market Fund
55.2% Cash Equivalent Total $2,495,815 3.5% $88,600

100.0% Total e : : 44,524,047 3.5% $125,762

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 6 of 18 As of February 28, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Transactions

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Operations Fund
From January 31, 2026 to February 28, 2026

Accrued
Trade Date Activity Description Quantity Amount Interest
2/27/2026 Income (Reinvested Schwab Treasury Money 7,426.93 $7,427
Dividend) Market Fund
2/27/2026 Withdrawal Schwab Government $500,000
Money Fund
2/17/2026 Income (Reinvested Schwab Government 530.28 $530
Dividend) Money Fund
2/15/2026 Income (Interest) US Treasury Note $4,087
(912828P46)
02/15/2026 1.625%
2/15/2026 Sell US Treasury Note 503,000.00 $503,000
(912828P46)
02/15/2026 1.625%
2/9/2026 Withdrawal Schwab Government $600,000
Money Fund

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 7 of 18 As of February 28, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO
ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Account Overview

Portfolio Allocation

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Capital Fund

Current Current

Subsector Value Percent

B U.S. Treasury $5,151,634 91.0%

|7 | Certificate of Deposit $496,603 8.8%

[ ICash Equivalent $14,659 0.3%

Total : $5,662,895  100.0%

Cash Flow Review
Inception to Date
Month to Date Quarter to Date Year to Date (4/15/2024)
Beginning Market Value $5,042,904 $5,033,008 $5,033,008 S0
Contributions / Additions $600,000 $600,000 $600,000 $5,350,000
Distributions S0 S0 S0 S0
Capital Appreciation $3,944 $49 $49 $86,958
Income/Expenses $22,045 $47,043 $47,043 $234,429
Change in Accrued ($5,998) ($17,205) ($17,205) ($8,491)
Ending Market Value $5,662,895 $5,662,895 $5,662,895 $5,662,895
Investment Gain $19,991 $29,887 $29,887 $312,895
Projected Income

Description Q2 2026 Q3 2026 Q4 2026 Q12027 Total
U.S. Treasury $49,479 $49,932 $36,984 $40,557 $176,952
Certificate of Deposit $3,114 $6,018 $3,131 $6,118 $18,381
Cash Equivalent $121 $121 $121 $121 $482

Total

Projected Income and Maturities

- $52,714  $56,070 440,236

$46,796

Description Q2 2026 Q3 2026 Q4 2026 Q12027 Total
U.S. Treasury $731,479 $549,932 $974,984 $540,557 $2,796,952
Certificate of Deposit $3,114 $6,018 $3,131 $6,118 $18,381
Cash Equivalent $121 $121 $121 $121 $482

$734,714 $556,070 $978,236 : S

546,796 $2,815,815

Information in this report was compiled using data from the custodian available as of the publishing date. While we believe the data to be reliable, we
do not independently verify pricing and valuation data. Please refer to the official statements provided by the account custodian. All date period
references are on a calendar year basis. Fiscal year reports are available by request. Past performance does not guarantee future investment results.

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District

SFAM Page 8 of 18

As of February 28, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT., LLC

Performance History

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Capital Fund

Start Value Inflows Outflows End Value Investment G,:?r:
Since Inception
First Quarter 2026 $5,033,008 $600,000 S0 $5,662,895 $29,887
Fourth Quarter 2025 $4,982,525 S0 SO $5,033,008 $50,483
Third Quarter 2025 $4,383,585 $550,000 S0 $4,982,525 $48,939
Second Quarter 2025 $4,337,408 S0 S0 $4,383,585 $46,177
First Quarter 2025 $3,927,908 $350,000 S0 $4,337,408 $59,499
Fourth Quarter 2024 $2,243,224 $1,650,000 S0 $3,927,908 $34,685
Third Quarter 2024 $2,213,369 S0 S0 $2,243,224 $29,855
Second Quarter 2024 S0 $2,200,000 S0 $2,213,369 $13,369
Since Inception Total $0 $5,350,000 S0 $5,662,895 $312,895

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 9 of 18 As of February 28, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Bond Analysis

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Capital Fund

40.0%
20.0%
0.0%—
2026 2027 2028
B Percent of Fixed Income
Maturity by Year
Yield to Yield to

Current Maturity Maturity Modified

Weight Description Principal Value Yield (Cost) (Market) Duration

91.2% U.S. Treasury $5,084,000 $5,151,634 3.9% 4.0% 3.5% 1.1

8.8% Certificate of Deposit $495,000 $496,603 3.7% 3.9% 3.7% 1.8

1000% Total  $5579,000  $5648,236

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 10 of 18 As of February 28, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Holdings

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Capital Fund

Yield
Maturity Current to Maturity Annual
Weight Description Symbol Date Quantity Value Yield (Market) Income
Fixed Income
Taxable Bonds
U.S. Treasury
9.0% US Treasury Note 91282CLQ2 10/15/2027 500,000.00 $503,496 3.8% 3.4% $19,375
10/15/2027 | 3.875%
Accrued Income $7,292
8.8% US Treasury Note 91282CLH2  8/31/2026 500,000.00 $500,117 3.7% 3.7%  $18,750
08/31/2026 | 3.750%
Accrued Income $51
5.1% US Treasury Note 91282CMF5 1/15/2028 283,000.00 $287,289 4.2% 3.4% $12,028
01/15/2028 | 4.250%
Accrued Income $1,495
8.9% US Treasury Note 91282CJT9 1/15/2027 500,000.00 $501,914 4.0% 3.5% $20,000
01/15/2027 | 4.000%
Accrued Income $2,486
6.1% US Treasury Note 91282CMS7  3/15/2028 335,000.00 $338,206 3.8% 3.4% $12,981
03/15/2028 | 3.875%
Accrued Income $5,989
5.8% US Treasury Note 91282CKJ9 4/15/2027 320,000.00 $323,462 4.5% 3.5% $14,400
04/15/2027 | 4.500%
Accrued Income $5,420
8.8% US Treasury Note 91282CFB2 7/31/2027 500,000.00 $495,176 2.8% 3.4% $13,750
07/31/2027 | 2.750%
Accrued Income $1,102
10.8% US Treasury Note 91282CJP7 12/15/2026 600,000.00 $603,727 4.3% 3.6% $26,250
12/15/2026 | 4.375%
Accrued Income $5,481
3.9% US Treasury Note 91282CGV7  4/15/2026 215,000.00 $215,000 3.8% 3.7%  $8,063
04/15/2026 | 3.750%
Accrued Income $3,035
6.1% US Treasury Note 91282CLS8  10/31/2026 338,000.00 $339,043 4.1% 3.6%  $13,943
10/31/2026 | 4.125%
Accrued Income $4,660
8.3% US Treasury Note 91282CHBO  5/15/2026 467,000.00 $466,927 3.6% 3.7% $16,929
05/15/2026 | 3.625%
Accrued Income $4,957
9.5% US Treasury Note 91282CMN8  2/15/2028 526,000.00 $534,445 4.2% 3.4% $22,355
02/15/2028 | 4.250%
Accrued Income $865
Certificate of Deposit
2.9% Beal Bank 07371DNA1  12/22/2027 165,000.00 $165,204 3.7% 3.7% $6,188
12/22/2027 | 3.750%
Accrued Income $1,071
1.4% Capital One Bank 254673MP8  2/22/2028 80,000.00 $78,978 3.0% 3.7% $2,400
02/22/2028 | 3.000%
Accrued Income $46

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 11 of 18 As of February 28, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Holdings

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Capital Fund

Yield
Maturity Current to Maturity Annual
Weight Description Symbol Date Quantity Value Yield (Market) Income
Fixed Income
Taxable Bonds
Certificate of Deposit
4.4% Morgan Stanley Bank 61778EPC9 2/11/2028 250,000.00 $250,828 3.8% 3.7% $9,625
02/11/2028 | 3.850%
Accrued Income $475
99.7% Fixed Income Total $5,648,236 3.9% 3.5% $217,035
Cash Equivalent
Cash Equivalent
Cash Equivalent
0.3% Schwab Government SWGXX $14,659 3.3% $482
Money Fund
100.0% Total : $5,662,895 3.9% 3.5% $217,517

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 12 of 18 As of February 28, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Transactions

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Capital Fund
From January 31, 2026 to February 28, 2026

Accrued
Trade Date Activity Description Quantity Amount Interest

2/28/2026 Income (Interest) US Treasury Note $9,375
(91282CLH2)
08/31/2026 3.750%

2/26/2026 Buy US Treasury Note 8,000.00 $8,026 $108
(91282CLS8)
10/31/2026 4.125%

2/22/2026 Income (Interest) Capital One Bank $1,210
(254673MP8)
02/22/2028 3.000%

2/17/2026 Income (Reinvested Schwab Government 283.00 $283
Dividend) Money Fund

2/15/2026 Income (Interest) US Treasury Note $11,178
(91282CMN8)
02/15/2028 4.250%

2/10/2026 Buy US Treasury Note 222,000.00 $221,965 $1,956
(91282CHBO0)
05/15/2026 3.625%

2/10/2026 Buy US Treasury Note 375,000.00 $377,688 $2,614
(91282CJP7)
12/15/2026 4.375%

2/9/2026 Deposit Schwab Government $600,000
Money Fund

2/3/2026 Buy Morgan Stanley Bank 250,000.00 $250,000
(61778EPC9)
02/11/2028 3.850%

2/3/2026 Buy US Treasury Note 8,000.00 $8,099 $19
(91282CMF5)
01/15/2028 4.250%

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 13 of 18 As of February 28, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Account Overview

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Building Capital

Portfolio Allocation

Current Current
Subsector Value Percent
[ Icash Equivalent $1,030,755  100.0%
Total i $1,030,755  100.0%
Cash Flow Review
Inception to Date
Month to Date Quarter to Date Year to Date (5/8/2025)
Beginning Market Value $1,027,946 $1,025,350 $1,025,350 S0
Contributions / Additions N S0 S0 $1,000,000
Distributions S0 S0 S0 S0
Capital Appreciation ) S0 S0 S0
Income/Expenses $2,809 $5,405 $5,405 $30,755
Ending Market Value $1,030,755 $1,030,755 $1,030,755 $1,030,755
Investment Gain $2,809 $5,405 $5,405 $30,755
Projected Income
Description Q2 2026 Q3 2026 Q4 2026 Q1 2027 Total
Cash Equivalent $9,148 $9,148 $9,148 $9,148 $36,591

Total

Projected Income and Maturities

$9,148

Description

Q2 2026

Q3 2026 Q4 2026

Q12027

Total

Cash Equivalent
Total

$9,148

$9,148 $9,148

$9,148

$36,591

Information in this report was compiled using data from the custodian available as of the publishing date. While we believe the data to be reliable, we
do not independently verify pricing and valuation data. Please refer to the official statements provided by the account custodian. All date period
references are on a calendar year basis. Fiscal year reports are available by request. Past performance does not guarantee future investment results.

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District

SFAM Page 14 of 18

As of February 28, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Performance History

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Building Capital

Start Value Inflows Outflows End Value Investment G':?rt
Since Inception
First Quarter 2026 $1,025,350 S0 S0 $1,030,755 $5,405
Fourth Quarter 2025 $1,015,936 S0 S0 $1,025,350 $9,414
Third Quarter 2025 $1,005,713 S0 S0 $1,015,936 $10,223
Second Quarter 2025 S0 $1,000,000 S0 $1,005,713 $5,713
Since Inception Total S0 $1,000,000 i) $1,030,755 $30,755

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 15 of 18 As of February 28, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO

ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Holdings

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Building Capital

Yield
Maturity Current to Maturity Annual
Weight Description Symbol Date Quantity Value Yield (Market) Income
Cash Equivalent
Cash Equivalent

Cash Equivalent

0.0% Schwab Government SWGXX $196 3.3% $S6
Money Fund

100.0% Schwab Treasury Money SCOXX $1,030,559 3.6% $36,585
Market Fund

100.0% Cash Equivalent Total $1,030,755 3.5% $36,591

100.0% Total : $1,030,755

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 16 of 18 As of February 28, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO
ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Transactions

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District - Building Capital
From January 31, 2026 to February 28, 2026

Accrued
Trade Date Activity Description Quantity Amount Interest
2/27/2026 Income (Reinvested Schwab Treasury Money 2,808.36 $2,808
Dividend) Market Fund
2/17/2026 Income (Reinvested Schwab Government 0.61 S1
Dividend) Money Fund

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District SFAM Page 17 of 18 As of February 28, 2026



SAWYER FALDUTO
ASSET MANAGEMENT, LLC

Fixed Income Market Update — February 28, 2026

Key Takeaways:

*  Yields on bonds one year and shorter remained largely unchanged while yields in the 2-5 year range fell
*  The latest inflation data came in lower than expected at 2.4% (previously 2.7%)

. The U.S. economy grew at an annualized rate of 1.4% in Q4 2025 which was lower than expected

° Labor market conditions remain stable with unemployment dropping slightly to 4.3% (previously 4.4%)

U.S. Treasury Yield Curve

4.00%
3.75% /
3.50% \\ _——
3.25%

1 Month 3 Month 6 Month 1Year 2 Year 3 Year 5 Year

o 1 /31/2026 w2 /2812026

U.sS.

High Quality

Government

ield ISST Certifi f High li
ojasjaose | MonevMarker iRt CERART Govemment  Tasaple | FEN A
Fund B Agency Municipal D
Liquid 3.29% - - - - -
3 Month - 3.66% 3.70% 3.63% 3.69% 3.73%
6 Month - 3.62% 3.75% 3.59% 3.78% 3.79%
9 Month - 3.60% 3.75% 3.57% 3.73% 3.74%
1 Year - 3.48% 3.70% 3.48% 3.62% 3.61%
3 Year - 3.38% 3.80% 3.39% 3.81% 3.82%
5 Year - 3.50% 3.85% 3.49% 3.88% -
Economic Data Federal Open Market Committee
Median Fed Funds Rate Forecast
Indicator Current Previous R == amEp
} 3.375%
2 4% 2 7% 3.125% 3.125%
Pl - Inflati ) : 3.0%
CPI-liflatign (Jan 2026) (Dec 2025) ¢ 2.500%
4.3% 4.4% \ 1
U I t o
nemploymen (Jan 2026) (Dec 2025)
3.75% 3.75% ’
ds Rat W =1
FERRGSRES (Jan 2026) (Dec 2025)
1.4% 4.4% o
Real GDP Growth (4th Qtr 2025) | (3rd Qtr 2025) Current 2026 2027 4028 Long Term

Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District

SFAM Page 18 of 18

As of February 28, 2026




Bristol Kendall Fire Department

Fire Prevention Bureau

103 East Beaver Street
Yorkville, IL 60560-1704.
Tel: 630 553-6186
Fax: 630 553-1482

FIRE MARSHAL REPORT

03-12-2026
Inspections Life Safety (71)

Violations Found (52)

Re-Inspections (48)

Violations Corrected (76)

C.O. Inspections )

Alarm Investigation  (3)

Outside Agency Inspections (State (2) (Private (4)
Fire Alarm Plan Review (2)

Ansul Puff Test (0)

Ansul System Plan Review (0)

Site Inspection (8) Grande Reserve townhomes, Grande reserve north, Gerber
Fire Alarm Test (7)

Sprinkler Test (7)

Sprinkler Plan Review (5)

Hydrostatic Test (3)

Wet Kitchen System Plan Review (0)

Flush Test (2)

System Flow Test (2)

Above Ceiling Inspection (8)

Emergency Form Updates (5)

Knox Box Keys (2)



Tank Review (0)

Pre-Action system Test (0)
Knox Box Installations (2)
Knox Box Removal (0)

Food Truck Vendor Inspections (0)
Carnival Ride Inspections (0)
Fire Damper Inspection (6)
Fire Caulk Inspection (6)
Out of Business (0)

New Business (2)
Disconnect Inspection (0)
School Fire Drill (0)

School Inspections (0)
Special Meetings (2)
Occupancy Load (1)

Run Hide Fight Drill (0)

State Smoke Detector Program (Smoke detectors installed January- dec. 12

Total Contacts (Adults 12 ) (Children 35)

Fire Investigations (2)

Classes Attended (1)

Public Education

03-12-26



Bristol Kendall Fire

Protection District
103 East Beaver Street
Yorkville, IL 60560-1704
Phone: 630 553-6186
Fax: 630 553-1482

March 2026
Trustee Meeting
Training Report
Training:
Training Hours for February 2026, 2,506
e 2,976 Training Hours for January, 2026

e 2,490 Training Hours for December, 2025
e 3,343 Training Hours for November, 2025

Total hours for the month of Febuary 2,506




Notes:

« Crews continue to wrap up all required compliance training. We anticipate full
completion by the end of the month.

« Annual department physicals process began in February and is expected to be
completed by the end of the month.

« Life Star conducted a Difficult Airway and Torso Trauma class as part of their
outreach program. We will continue working with their organization to provide
ongoing EMS training opportunities.

« Yorkville School District met with all three shifts to review their safety protocols in
the event of an emergency. They discussed terminology and procedures, and we will
continue coordinating additional trainings as our involvement with the district grows.

« We hosted a training exercise for Division 14 Swift Water team members, focusing on
preplans, boat motors reviews, and real-world scenario applications.

+ Southern Fox EMS conducted their quarterly EMS training. The system provides
crews with a scenario-based exercise requiring performance-based response. This
process will continue throughout the year.

o Cadet Program 2026: We received 35 applications. Oral interviews will be
conducted this month.

« Jen Lynd continues to increase community involvement by completing CPR classes
for local organizations. This is the highest number of CPR classes we have hosted to
date, and community interest remains strong.

e Recent Certifications Obtain

o Advanced Fire Fighter- 9
o Fire Apparatus Engineering — 1

o Instructor 1-1



Bristol-Kendall Fire Protection District
103 East Beaver Street
Yorkville, IL 60560-1704
Phone: 630-553-6186
Fax: 630-553-1482
Imglﬂl R T e S S T D L A T T T O R S R T I e T S A T T T T V.@l&

March 2026
Trustee Meeting
Operations Report

Calls by Month:
CALLS PER MONTH FOR 2026

lanuary W February & W

Calls for Service by Year:

Sum of Calls for service

({00]
580
560

540

l;zo ——— - — e e —————

2022 2023 2024 2025




Calls per Stations:

Calls per Station in 2026

0 |
1

smioni| RN

|
|
|

[ﬁ Stétién 3 ,T

% Station 2 i

Sum of Calls

Calls by Shift:

Black =98
Red =98
Gold = 87



Calls by Major Incident Types:

Rescue: 3(1.1%) ~l Fire:6(2.1%)

Public Service: 36 (12.7%) \ Hazardous Situation: 14 (4.9%)

No Emergency: 24 (8.5%) —__

~

Staffing:
e Fulltime District
o 34 Personnel
e Part Time
o 22 Personnel
e Civilian Medics
o 2 Personnel

Fire Division:
e Mutual Aid to Lisbon Seward — Route 52 & Lisbon Rd — Semi Extrication —
Battalion 1 and Engine 122
e Mutual Aid to Lisbon Seward — 4063 Van Dyke Rd — Structure Fire — Battalion
1 and Engine 121
e Mutual Aid to Morris — 10035 N Nettle Creek Rd — Structure Fire — Engine 121

e Mutual Aid to Newark — 2966 N 42015 Rd — Brush Fire — Battalion 1 and UTV
157



Grant Funding;:

e Waiting to hear about the Firehouse Subs Grant

o Waiting to hear about the OSFM Small Equipment Grant
- o Applying for an AFG Grant for new mobile radios

Fleet Maintenance:
o Continuing to work on Engine 124
o Continuing on maintenance for Bristol Kendall, Little Rock Fox and made one
repair to a Sandwich FPD engine

Stations:
e Finalizing the new station alerting project
¢ Finishing up painting at Station 1
e The inside of Station 3 has been repainted



Bristol Kendall Fire

Protection District
103 East Beaver Street
Yorkville, IL 60560-1704.
Phone: 630 553-6186
Fax: 630 553-1482

March 2026
Trustee Meeting
Fire Chief Report
Bills out of Norm:
e Fire Fund
e EMS Fund

o HFS-$61,671 for GEMT
e Operations Fund

o Data Center Warehouse- $7305 for Aruba software
e Capital Fund

o Air One- $6,226 for PPE
e Insurance Fund

Staffing:
e Hours for February:
o Hours Worked- 11852 Hours
»  QOvertime Hours- 230 Hours
7G Building Maintenance- 12.5 Hours
7G Inspections- 26.75 Hours
7G Investigations- 3 Hours
7G EMS- 5.5 Hours
7G IT- 0 Hours
7G Fleet Maintenance- 6 Hours
7G Public Education- 0 Hours
7G Special Duties- 0 Hours
7G Training- 17 Hours
» Rider- 205
o Total Hours off- 1893 Hours
» Kelly & BKFPD Days- 504 Hours
= Sick Days- 428 Hours
» Vacation Days- 376 Hours
=  Comp Time Days- 51 Hours



= Bereavement Day- 39 Hours
=  Work Comp- 0 Hours

Hours Worked

Sum of January

B Sum of February

Hours Worked

Overtime

Sum of January

® Sum of February

Overtime Hours




Time Off

500

400

300 Sum of January
® Sum of February

200

100

0) DS .

Kelly & BKFPD Vacation

Finances:

e FNBO Checking- 0.95%

o Market Value- $456,423.40

o Interest- $435.82

o Year to Date Interest- $924.03
e FNBO Money Market- 1.26%

o Market Value- $205,169.38

o Interest- $321.06

o Year to Date Interest- $660.20
e Schwab Operation Account

o Market Value- $4,510,060.40

o Schwab Money Market is 3.61% (3-2026)

o Year to date net gain is $29,029
e Schwab Vehicle Capital Account

o Market Value- $5,609,095.90

o Year to date net gain is $29,887
e Schwab Building Capital Account

o Market Value- $1,030,754.82

o Year to date net gain is $5,405
e Fire Billing (PSI)

o $2,550 in Charges

o $0 received
e Little Rock Fox Fleet Maintenance Revenue-

o Labor- $25,500

o Consulting- $320

o Parts- $10,470.05
¢ Sandwich Fleet Maintenance Revenue-

o Labor- $350

o Consulting-

o Parts- $69.80
e Waubonsee Community College

o Fleet Services- $300

o Fall Semester Charge- $13,650

3



o City of Yorkville Impact Fees
o 2025 Q3- $25,250
o 2025 Q4- $13,900

Commissioner Notes:

¢ Next regular meeting scheduled for May 19

e The board was reorganized and Scott Harmon is now the Chairperson of the
board

¢ Discussed the next Firefighter Test

e Approved to sign a two-year contract with Public Safety Testing for the testing
process with a 20% discount on the first year

e Current list expires July 9 and we will be holding off on testing until we are
close to having a new contract with the union

Notes:
e Personnel
o Union negotiations are beginning with the first meeting on Thursday
March 12
o Health Insurance paperwork is being finalized
» Open Enrollment is scheduled for April
* A new law also went into effect for lllinois to allow parents on
Health plans under certain circumstances
o Work Comp rates are back
» The increases are very minimum, 1 to 2 cents per $1,000
»  With current payroll projections we will see an increase from
$210,456 to $239,238
» Once the union contract is finalized, | can send updated payroll
estimates back and they will adjust our monthly payment
e Stations

o Station 1 :
* The old shift officer’s office has been updated to give crews
additional work space
» The board room has been updated
o Station 2
o Station 3
» [nterior of the station is currently being painted

¢ GEMT Rates have come back for 2026
o BLS-$1,969.98 ($1,823.42- 2025)
o ALS-$2,147.58 ($2,060.85- 2025)
o Safer Grant
o We were back and forth with some more questions on the Safer Grant
and have decided to hold off this year because of too many unknown
numbers for the calculations
o Lexipol will be writing an AFG Grant for us instead
» |tis for 25 mobile radios to upgrade our current outdated ones
* These will have to be replaced by June of 2027
» Radios are $6500 each for a total of $162,500



Budget

O
O

| have made my first round of cuts in the budget

We will be meeting with crews next week to do some training on the
budget

Staff will meet at the end of the month to go through the budget a final
time

Planning to present tentative budget in April and final approval in May
This will give us 30 days to have the tentative budget posted



Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District

Kendall County
State of lllinois

Ordinance Number 2026-01

AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING FIRE PREVENTION CODES FOR
THE BRISTOL KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

WHEREAS, the Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District (“District”) is a fire protection district
duly organized under the laws of the State of lllinois; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Trustees of the District has express power pursuant to 70 ILCS
705/11, to adopt and enforce fire prevention codes and standards parallel to national standards
to promote fire prevention; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Trustees of the District also has full power pursuant to 70 ILCS
705/6, to pass all necessary ordinances, and rules and regulations for the proper management
and conduct of the business of the Board of Trustees of the District for carrying into effect the
objects for which the district was formed; and

WHEREAS, the Fire Protection District Act, 70 ILCS 705/11, (the “Act”) empowers and
makes it the legal duty and obligation of this Board of Trustees to provide as nearly adequate
protection from fire for all persons and property within the district as possible and to prescribe
necessary regulations for the prevention and control of fire therein; and

WHEREAS, the District is empowered by the Act to provide reasonable safeguards
through Fire Prevention Codes to protect the Public Health and Safety against the hazards of fire
in buildings and structures; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to its statutory authority, the Board previously determined it to be in
the best interest of the district to adopt a fire prevention code for the control of fire protection in
buildings and structures as herein provided; and each and all of the regulations, provisions,
penalties, conditions, and terms are provided in Bristol Kendall FPD Ordinance No. 2026-01.

WHEREAS, the 2018 Edition of the ICC (International Code Council) International Fire
Code is a comprehensive compilation of codes designed to meet the needs of the local fire
jurisdictions through model code regulations that prescribe safeguards for the safety and public

health of all communities; and



WHEREAS, the Board of Trustees of the District deem it in the best interest of the district
to amend and adopt a new Fire Prevention Code using the 2018 Edition of the International Fire
Code as the District’'s model for the control of fire protection in buildings and structures as herein
provided; and

WHEREAS, a copy of the 2018 International Fire Code has been on file with the district
for at least (15) days and has, during that time, been available for public use, inspection and
examination.

The Board of Trustees of the Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District does ordain as follows:

SECTION 1 — RECITALS

The facts and statements contained in the preamble to this Ordinance are hereby found by the
Board of Trustees to be true and correct and are hereby adopted as part of this Ordinance.

SECTION 2 — REPEALING PRESENT FIRE CODE

The Fire Prevention Code of the Bristol-Kendall Fire Protection District (hereinafter referred to as
the “Fire Prevention Code”) is hereby amended to delete and repeal the present language in its
entirety.

SECTION 3 — ADOPTION OF NATIONALLY RECOGNIZED CODES

Pursuant to the authority granted in the Fire Protection District Act 70 ILCS 705/6 to pass all
necessary ordinances for the management of the Fire District, The Board of Trustees of the Bristol
Kendall Fire Protection District in accordance to 70 ILCS 705/11 fulfills their legal duty and
prescribes necessary regulations and codes for the prevention and control of fire parallel to

national standards, those codes known as the

INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE - 2018, including APPENDICES B, C, D, E, F, G, H,l, KN as
recommended by the INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL (“ICC”).

Each and all of the regulations, provision, penalties, conditions, and terms of the aforesaid
documents are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this
Ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions, and changes, if any, prescribed in Exhibit

One of this Ordinance.



Three copies of the aforesaid codes have been available for inspection for at least 15 days prior
to the adoption hereof and are now on file in the office of the Secretary of the Board of Trustees
of the Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District, and have been there kept available for public use,
inspection, and examination, and the same hereby adopted and incorporated as fully as if set out
at length herein, and from the date in which this ordinance shall take effect, the provisions thereof
shall be controlling within the corporate limits of the Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District, Kendall

County, lllinois

SECTION 5 — COMPLIANCE WITH ORDINANCE REQUIRED

That it shall be unlawful to design, construct, alter, enlarge, repair, demolish, remove, use, or
maintain any building or structure within the boundaries of the Bristol Kendall Fire Protection
District in violation of any terms or provisions of this Ordinance.

SECTION 6 — REPEALING ORDINANCE ADOPTING PREVIOUS CODE

All prior fire code ordinances of the Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District are repealed to the
extent they conflict with this Ordinance. “All prior fire code ordinances of the Bristol Kendall Fire
Protection District are repealed to the extent they conflict with this Ordinance.”

SECTION 7 — FINES

All persons in violation of the Fire Prevention Code shall be subjected to fines as set forth and
established in the Codes, and all otherwise applicable District Ordinances.

SECTION 8 — PENALTIES

The International Fire Code 2018 edition as adopted includes the following penalty provision, as
amended in the current Exhibit One:

“110.4 Violation penalties. Any person who violates any provision of this Ordinance,
or who fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof, shall be guilty of a
misdemeanor, punishable by a fine not less than $100.00, nor more than

$500.00 in the case of a first offense. For continued violations fines shall be
$1,000.00. Each day that a violation continues shall be a separate offense.”

SECTION 9 — WAIVERS

The Fire Chief or his designee are hereby permitted to waive the warnings and/or fees due under
this Ordinance in cases of demonstrated financial hardship, intergovernmental cooperation, or in
cases where systems have been repaired or replaced and are operating properly. Special
consideration shall be granted to the unintentional alarms of users of newly installed systems
during the first three months after service to the system has commenced. Requests for the waiver
of fees must be made in writing to the Fire Marshal or Fire Chief, who shall make the initial
determination as to the validity of the waiver request. Any waiver or forbearance under this
Paragraph shall not be deemed a waiver by the District to pursue future violations by the user.

3



SECTION 10 — FUTURE REVISIONS

Future versions of the District's Fire Prevention Code shall be revised by Board approval of
additional exhibits hereto that amend the current Exhibit One. All such revisions shall be dated
and shall be effective upon approval by the Board of Trustees.

SECTION 11 — SEVERABILITY
The Board of Trustees of the District hereby declares that should any section, paragraph,

sentence, or word of this Ordinance or of the Code hereby adopted be declared for any reason to
be invalid, it is the intent of said Board of Trustees that it would have passed all other portions of
this Ordinance independent of the elimination of such portion as may be declared invalid.
SECTION 12 — VALIDITY OF PRIOR ORDINANCES

Neither the enactment of this Ordinance nor the repeal of any ordinance or parts of ordinances
as provided for herein shall be construed to affect or abate any action or cause of action for
violation of said prior ordinance or ordinances.

SECTION 13 - EFFECTIVE DATE

That this Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage, approval, and

publication in accordance with the law.

PASSED by the Board of Trustees of the Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District,

Kendall County lllinois this__12  day of _March , 20286, by roll call vote.

Ken Johnson Darin Peterson

Mark Hoffert Marty Schwartz

Jeff Farren

Attest
President of the Board of Trustees Secretary, Board of Trustees
Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District




STATE OF ILLINOIS )

COUNTY OF KENDALL )

SECRETARY’S CERTIFICATE

[, Darin Peterson, the duly qualified and acting Secretary of the Board of Trustees of the
Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District, Kendall County, lllinois, do hereby certify that | am the keeper
of its books and records and that the attached hereto is a true and correct copy of an Ordinance

entitied:

ORDINANCE NO. 2026-01

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE FIRE PREVENTION CODE
FOR THE BRISTOL KENDALL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT

which Ordinance was duly adopted by said Board of Trustees at a regular meeting held on the

12 day of March, 2026.
| do further certify that a quorum of said Board of Trustees was present at said meeting and
that the Board complied with all requirements of the lllinois Open Meetings Act.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, | have hereunto set my hand this _12_day of March, 2026.

Secretary, Board of Trustees
Bristol Kendall Fire Protection District



EXHIBIT ONE
AMENDMENTS TO THE 2018 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

1. Section 101.1 Title, shall be amended to insert name of jurisdiction Bristol Kendall Fire
Protection District

2. Section 105.4.1 Submittals, shall be amended as follows
Construction documents and supporting data shall be sealed with a "NICET [lI" or higher
certification and submitted for review and approval by the Fire Code Official. A minimum
of two sets of plans and specifications shall be included in the submittal along with a copy
of an approved electronic file.

3. Section 105.6 Required operational permits. Create section 105.6.51
Laboratory/Research facility, an operational permit is required to operate any laboratory
or research facility which conducts testing or experiments.

4. Section 105.6 Required operational permits. Create section 105.6.52
Child Care (home occupation), an operational permit is required to operate a child care
facility as a "home occupation" for 6 or more children that are cared for at any one time.
The operational permit shall not include provisions for permanent residence or overnight
accommodations. All local and state laws shall be adhered to in conjunction with the
registration and licensing requirements of the Department of Children and Family
Services (DCFS).

5. Section 106.2 Schedule of permit fees, shall be amended as follows:

a. Reviews by outside agency / consultant: To the extent that the district needs to
utilize the services of an outside agency/consultant, the applicant shall pay all fees
charged by the outside agency/consultant, and shall pay the district an additional
administrative fee equal to 15% of the outside agency/consultant fee.

b. Fire Detection and Alarm systems, Emergency Responder Communication
Enhancement System (ERCES) review fees: Any applicant for a building or
structure having (or required to have) a fire alarm system or ERCES shall pay to
the district the following fee, in addition to the other fees set forth herein, for
performing fire alarm system plan reviews and inspections.

«  $350 up to 10,000 sq ft plus $10 for each additional 1,000 sq ft.
+ Alterations to existing: less than 10% of devices $150.00
« Includes 1 re-review, each additional review will be 75% of original
plan review cost
+ Includes 1 Inspection, each additional inspection will be
$150/inspection



c. Fire Sprinkler Systems(13,13D,13R). Any applicant for a building or structure
having (or required to have) a fire sprinkler system shall pay to the district the
following fees, in addition to the other fees set forth herein, for performing fire
sprinkler system plan reviews and inspections:

»  $400.00 plus $0.75 per sprinkler head over 100 heads

+ Alterations to existing: 1 to 20 sprinkler heads, $100

» Alterations to existing: 21 to 40 sprinkler heads $300

» Alterations to existing: over 40 Sprinkler heads $400 plus $0.75 per sprinkler

head over 100 heads
+ $50.00 shall be paid for witnessing of the underground flushing for the

sprinkier system
* Includes 1 re-review each additional review will be 75% of original

plan review cost
* Includes 2 inspections each additional inspection will be

$150/inspection

d. Fire Suppression other: stand pipe, fire pump, water tank: Any applicant for a
building or structure having (or required to have) a standpipe, fire pump, or water
tank, shall pay to the district the following fees, in addition to the other fees set forth
herein, for performing plan review and inspections.

« $300.00
* Includes 1 re-review, each additional review will be $100.00
* Includes 1 inspection, each additional inspection will be
$150/inspection.

e. Hood Suppression, wet chemical system: Any applicant for a building or
structure having (or required to have) Hood Suppression, wet chemical system
shall pay to the district the following fees, in addition to the other fees set forth
herein, for performing fire pump plan review and inspections:

« $350.00
* Includes 1 re-review, each additional review will be $100.00
* Includes 1 inspection, each additional inspection will be
$150/inspection.

f. Clean Agent/Dry Chemical systems review fee: Any applicant for a building or
structure having (or required to have) a Clean Agent/Dry Chemical system shall
pay to the district the following fees, in addition to the other fees set forth herein,
for performing alternate extinguishing system plan review and inspections:

«  $400 up to 10,000 cubic feet
« $0.10/cubic foot over 10,000
* Includes 1 re-review, each additional review will be 75% of
original plan review cost
* Includes 1 inspection, each additional inspection will be
$150/inspection.



d.

Site Plan: A site plan is defined as a document that describes how a parcel of land
is to be improved. It includes the outlines of all structures and site improvements,
such as driveways, parking lots, landscaping and utility connections. Any applicant
shall pay to the district the followings fees, in addition to the other fees set forth
herein, for performing site plan review.

« A fee of $50.00 per hour with a minimum of 1 hour. Includes 1 re-review.

« Afee of 50% of the site plan review fee shall be paid for each additional set

of revised site plan drawings

h. Operational Permits

« Fire Work $200.00
« Carnival/Amusement Rides $25.00/ride
« Mobile Food Trucks $25 annual permit
» Other $50.00 each

6. Section 108, Maintenance. Create section 108.7
False Alarm, an alarm signal given needlessly, which indicates the existence of any
emergency situation; when in fact, no such emergency exists, shall constitute a false alarm
and shall be subject to penalty as prescribed in the schedule of fees A false alarm shall
include any alarm signal generated by any fire protection system by whatever means, but
shall not include alarms resulting from any of the following causes:

a.

b.

A fire causing structural damage to the protected premises - verified by the fire
district.

A tornado or hurricane winds causing structural damage to the protected premises,
verified by the fire district.

Flooding to the protected premises due to overflow of natural drainage, verified by
the fire district.

Telephone line malfunction verified to the fire district by an authorized telephone
company supervisor within seven days of the occurrence.

Electrical service interruption verified to the fire district by the local power company
within seven days of the occurrence.

Plumbing or electrical malfunctions unrelated to the fire protection system, verified
by the fire district.

7. Section 108 Maintenance, create section 108.7.1
False Alarm Fee Schedule

a.

No fee shall be assessed for the first three (3) false alarms within the same
calendar year.

The third (3" d) false alarm within the same calendar year: a warning letter will be
issued.

The fourth (4th) false alarm within the same calendar year: a fee of $300.00 shall
be assessed.

The fifth (5th) false alarm within the same calendar year: a fee of $350.00 shall be
assessed.

The Sixth (6Th) false alarm within the same calendar year: a fee of $400.00 shall
be assessed.



10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

f. False alarm fee will double after the sixth false alarm in the same calendar year.
(Example: seventh (7th) false alarm in the same calendar year, a fee of $800.00

shall be assessed, eighth (Sth) false alarm in the same calendar year, a fee of
$1,600.00 shall be assessed. Etc.).

g. If the false alarm is given intentionally, an additional fee of $500.00 shall be added
assessed.

Section 109, Board of Appeals create section 109.1.1
The Board of appeals shall consist of the trustees of the district.

Section 110.4 Violations, shall be amended as follows:

Any person who violates any provision of this Ordinance, or who fails to comply with any
of the requirements thereof, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine not less
than $100.00, nor more than $500.00 in the case of a first offense. For continued violations
fines shall be $1,000.00. Each day that a violation continues shall be a separate offense.

Section 112.4 Failure to comply, shall be amended as follows:

Any person who shall continue to work after having been served with a stop work order,
except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than 100 dollars or more than 500 dollars.

Section 202 General Definitions, shall be amended to include the following definition: Fire
Alarm User the owner of the property, including but not limited to, any individual,
partnership, corporation, organization or other entity occupying the property with a fire
alarm, with permission of the owner.

Section 507 Fire Protection Water Supplies, create section 507.5.1.2

Hydrant for sprinkler systems, a fire hydrant shall not be more than 100 feet travel
distance from the fire department connection that it serves. Exception: The distance shall
be permitted to exceed 100 feet were approved by the fire code official.

Section 507 Fire Protection Water Supplies, create section 507.5.8

On all private parking areas of multiple-family residential, commercial and industrial uses,
a "No parking... Fire Hydrant" sign shall be placed in a conspicuous location to identify the
restricted parking area. In addition to the required sign, the curb or pavement (only when
a curb is not present) directly in front of the fire hydrant, shall be painted yellow with an
approved material. The designated area shall be 15 feet (7.5 feet on each side of the fire
hydrant) in total length.

Section 901.6.3 Records, create section 901.6.3.2

The most recent records of all system inspections, tests, and maintenance required shall
be maintained on premises and a copy shall be forward to the Fire Prevention Bureauvia
e-mail, mail, or fax within 14 days after completion of inspection.



15.

16.

17.

18.

19.

20.

21.

22.

23.

Section 903.2.1.1 Group A-1, Condition 1 shall be amended as follows: The fire area
exceeds 5,000 square feet (465m2).

Section 903.2.1.3 Group A-3, Condition 1 shall be amended as follows: The fire area
exceeds 5,000 square feet (465m2).

Section 903.2.1.4 Group A-4, Condition 1 shall be amended as follows:
The fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet (465m2)‘

Section 903.2.2 Ambulatory care facilities shall be amended as follows:
Section 903.2.2 Group B, an automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all
Group B occupancies when the fire area exceeds 5,000 square feet.

Section 903.2.2 Group B, create section 903.2.2.1
Ambulatory care facilities, an automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout
the entire floor containing an ambulatory care facility where either of the following
conditions exist at any time: v

a. Four or more care recipients are incapable of self-preservation.

b. One or more care recipients that are incapable of self-preservation are located at

other than the level of exit discharge serving such facility.

In buildings where ambulatory care is provided on levels other than the level of exit
discharge, an automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout the entire floor as
well as the floors below where such care is provided, and all floors between the level of
ambulatory care and the nearest level of exit discharge, the level of exit discharge, and all
floors below the level of exit discharge. Exception: Floors classified as an open parking
garage are not required to be sprinklered.

Section 903.2.3 Group E, 1 shall be amended as follows:
Throughout all group E fire areas greater than 5,000 square feet (465m2) in area.

Section 903.2.7 Group M, condition 1 shall be amended as follows: A group M fire areas
exceeds 10,000 square feet (929m2).

Section 903.2.8. Group R, shall be amended as follows:
An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3 shall be
provided throughout all buildings with a Group R fire area with the following exceptions:
a. Adult care facilities that provide accommodations for five or fewer persons of any
age for less than 24 hours.
b. Child care facilities that provide accommodations for five or fewer persons of any
age for less than 24 hours.

Single-family detached homes.
Section 903.3.1.2 NFPA 13R sprinkler systems Create section 903.3.1.2.4 Control
Valve Control valve with waterflow sensor shall be required for each floor.

oo

Section 903.3.1.3 NFPA 13D sprinkler systems Create Section 903.3.1.3.1 Garage
Attached garages in town-houses shall have a minimum of 1 dry sprinkler head.

10



24. Section 903.3.1.3 NFPA 13D sprinkler systems Create section 903.3.1.3.2 Monitoring
Town-houses shall be monitored by a UL approved Central Station for water flow.

25. Section 903.3.5 Water Supplies, shall be amended as follows:
Water supplies for automatic sprinkler systems shall comply with this section and the
standards referenced in Section 903.3.1. The potable water supply shall be protected
against backflow in accordance with the requirements of this section and the lllinois

Plumbing Code.

26. Section 903.4.1 Monitoring Shall be amended as follows:
Alarm, supervisory, and trouble signals shall be different and shall be automatically
transmitted to a U.L listed Central Station utilizing NFPA 72. Fire Alarm systems shall
transmit and report the electronically supervised signal by point address to the monitoring
station such that specific fire alarm point address is available and reported on Fire
department dispatch.

27.Section 903  Automatic  Sprinkler  Systems  Create  section  903.7

Commerciallresidential Occupancies, all sprinklered multi-tenant occupancies shall
have an isolation control valve and water flow switch for each tenant space.

28. Section 904.12 Commercial cooking Systems, create section 904.12.6
Required, all occupancies with a commercial cooking operation shall have a monitored
fire alarm system in accordance with applicable requirements of NFPA 70 and NFPA 72.

29. Section 905.3.1 Height, shall be amended as follows:
An approved standpipe system shall be installed in all buildings three (3) stories or more
in height in each stairwell at each level. Standpipe systems shall be installed in all buildings
where any portion of the building floor area is more than 200 feet travel distance from the
nearest point of the fire department vehicle access.

30. Section 907 Fire Alarm Detection Systems, create section 907.1.2.1
Required '

a.
b.

Location of the annunciator panel shall be approved by the Fire Code Official.

An annunciator panel or the main fire alarm control panel shall be placed nearthe
fire sprinkler riser.

A red strobe light shall be installed by the annunciator panel or above the closest
entrance to the fire alarm control panel as approved by the Fire Code Official

The annunciator panel shall indicate and have all of the functions of the fire alarm
control panel.

The annunciator shall be properly marked to show each zone.

A detailed floor plan illustrating each zone shall be provided on each fire alarm
control panel and located adjacent to each annunciator panel.

All fire alarm systems shall be the addressable type.

All multi-tenant occupancies shall be provided with a red strobe light at the
entrance to the tenant space that activate upon all alarm conditions in that tenant

space.

11



31.

32.

33.

34.

35.

36.

Section 907.2.1 Group A. shall be amended as follows:

An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system that activates the
occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed.
Exception: An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system is not required
where the building is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and the occupant notification appliances will activate
throughout the natification zones upon sprinkler water flow.

Sprinkled Building: An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system shall
be provided at the top of all stairs within a sprinkled building

Section 907.2.2 Group B shall be amended as follows:

An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system that activates the
occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed.
Exception: An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system is not required
where the building is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and the occupant notification appliances will activate
throughout the notification zones upon sprinkler water flow

Sprinkied Building: An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system shall
be provided at the top of all stairs within a sprinkled building

Section 907.2.3 Group E shall be amended as follows

An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system that activates the occupant
notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed.

Exception: An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system is not required
where the building is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and the occupant notification appliances will activate
throughout the notification zones upon sprinkler water flow.

Section 907.2.4 Group F shall be amended as follows

An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system that activates the
occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed.
Exception: An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system is not required
where the building is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and the occupant notification appliances will activate
throughout the notification zones upon sprinkler water flow.

Section 907.2.5 Group H shall be amended as follows:
An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system that activates the
occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed.

Section 907.2.7 Group M, shall be amended as follows:

An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system that activates the
occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed.
Exception: An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system is not required
where the building is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and the occupant notification appliances will activate
throughout the notification zones upon sprinkler water flow.

12



37. Section 907.2.8.2 Groupe R1 Automatic smoke detection shall be amended as follows.
An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system that activates the occupant
notification system shall be provided.
a. All corridors and common areas
b. All waiting areas that open to corridors
c. Top of all stairways
d. All Laundry, trash, electrical rooms, mechanical rooms, and storage rooms

38. Section 907.2.9.3 Group R-2 shall be amended as follows:
An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system that activates the occupant
notification system shall be provided.
a. All corridors and common areas
b. All waiting areas that open to corridors
c. Top of all stairways
d. All Laundry, trash, electrical rooms, mechanical rooms, and storage rooms

39. Section 907.2 where required, create Section 907.2.24 Group S
An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system that activates the
occupant notification system in accordance with Section 907.5 shall be installed.

Exception: An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system is not required
where the building is equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 and the occupant notification appliances will activate
throughout the notification zones upon sprinkler water flow.

40. Section 907.2 where required create Section 907.2.25 Groups, R-3 and R-4
An electronically supervised automatic smoke detection system that activates the occupant
notification system shall be provided.
a. All corridors and common areas
b. All waiting areas that open to corridors
c. Top of all stairways
d. All Laundry, trash, electrical rooms, mechanical rooms, and storage rooms
Exception: One and two family occupancies and townhomes built under the IRC.

41. 907.6.6 Monitoring shall be amended as follows:
Fire alarm systems required by this chapter or by the /nternational Building Code shall be
monitored by a U.L. listed central station in accordance with NFPA 72.

42. 907.6.6 Monitoring Create section 907.6.6.3 Transmission
Fire Alarm systems shall transmit and report the electronically supervised signal by point
address to the monitoring station such that specific fire alarm point address is available
and reported on fire department dispatch.

43. Section 912.1 Installation, shall be amended as follows:

Fire department connections shall be installed in accordance with the NFPA standard
applicable to the system design and shall comply with Sections 912.2 through 912.6. The
fire department connection shall be an approved five-inch (5") connection with a thirty (30)
degree down turn. A white strobe light shall be placed above the fire department
connection and the white strobe light shall indicate on water flow only. A two and one- half
inch (2 ¥2") NST single fire department connection shall be acceptable where piped to a
three inch (3") or smaller riser.

13



44. Section 912.6 Backflow Protection, shall be amended as follows.
The potable water supply to automatic sprinkler and standpipe systems shall be protected
against backflow as required by the lllinois Plumbing Code.

45, Section 1206 Electrical Energy Systems, create section1206.1.1
NFPA 855 Standard for the Installation of Stationary Energy Storage Systems:

The most current edition shall be used.

14



